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APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

RECOGNITION OF VISITORS 

- -
QUJ\HTEHLY COUNTY COUHT SEPTEMBER 11, H> 

Be it remembered that the Quarterly Coun 
Court oJ JJoudon County, Tennessee met in r egular 
session on ~I~rnday, September lJ , 1978 at 9:00 a.m. 
with th e Honorable William II. Russell , County J udge 
presiding and Riley Wampler, Clerk of said Court ~: 
present; Whereupon , Sheriff Joe Sims opem:t Court, 
led the Pledge oi AlJ egiance to the F'lag, and intl'< 
duced the Re vorand Charles Re dmond who gave the 
invocation. 

Th e following Squires were present : 

J. J. BJair 
Roy Bledsoe 
J. G. Hudson 
Richard Hawk 
Bart Eldridge 

Doyl e Arp 
J: Will Jones 
Glenn Luttrell 
James Hartsook 

-------------------------------------
It was moved by Hudson seconded by 

Blair that the minutes be approved as prese nted . 
The vot e was unanimous. 

-------------------------------------
At thi s time th e Court r ecognized visitor 

in the audience who wished to speak to the Court 
on various matter s . 

Paul Ker l e y addressed t he Co ur t in con­
nect ion with hi s termination from employme nt with 
t he County . 

Forest Clark, r epresenting the Loudon 
County Huma ne Society, requested the Court to 
assist in supplying funds for the continuation of 
the animal shelter. 

Odell Justice complimented the Court on 
being r eelecte d. 

Frank Hildreat h of Lenoir City requested 
the Court to consider fu ndi ng automobiles for t h e 
Sheriff's d epartment and other related items. 

The Court then r ecognized the Mayor of 
Greenback who read hi s comments concern ing the oper­
ations fo the Court . 

Ray Houk approached the Court c oncerning 
the fact that the Court hncl abolished his position 
of County Coroner and requested that consideration 
be given to having him reinstated as such . 

Ru fe Wilson requested that Gene Crawl e y, 
the new Road Supervisor, be gi ven additional funds 
to he lp with the roads. 

At the r0qucst or 1!1crnbers of Court a 
special session of the Com· t was c a ll e d to conside r 
various -items which W<.>re DOL on this . agenda but nCP.CL 
attention. The following jtcm:-"; are to be cons idered 
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PLANNING COMMISSION 
REPORT 

PURCHASING COMMITTEE 
REPORT 

PURCHASING COl\!MITTEE 
APPOINTED 

HIGHWAY BUDGET 
APPROVED 

BUDGET COM~tITTEE 
APPOINTED 

J. D. CLICK APPOINTED 
TRUSTtE FOR NEWTON 
BOGART ESTATE 

DISCUSSSION OF 
J UDICIAL CO~MISSIONER 

at the spPal session which will be .. lonclay, 
Se pt emb e r 25, 1978 nt 7:00 p . m.: 1 . Consideration 
of the Process S0rver 2. Ccinsid&ratjon of the 
County Coron e r ' s job . 3. Con!:;; ic\eration of 
Resolution to g uarantee Clerk's Salary . 

Dave Folz of the Loudon County Planning 
commission gave the gen eral repo rt of the July 
meeting and presented rc~oning request for Map 76 , 
Parcels 98, 99, 101 , 102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 1 0 7 
108, 109 from A-2 Rura l Residential to R-1, 
Suburban Residential. On motion of Squire Hudson 
seconded by Squire Hawk the property was unanimously 
rezoned. Being attached hereto as Resolution No. 

t.;-~- 7 <g , Exhibit B . 

Purchasing Committee r eport was given 
by Buddy Jenkins , aGopy o:f which is attached 
hereto as Exhibit . . 

Court appointed the following members 
to serve on the Purchasing Committ ee : Roy Bledsoe 
representing Judge Russell, Doyle Arp, Richard 
Hawk, Glenn Luttrell, and Bart Eldridge . 

The Court gave its approval upon motion 
of Squire Hudson and seconded by Squire J. Wil l 
Jones. The vot e was unanimous . 

The Court explained that after September 
1, 1978 there was no longer a three divi~ion highway 
department but that the budget would now be combined 
in one budget. Upon motion of Squire Blair and 
seconded by Squire Eldridge the Highway Commission's 
budget for the reaminder of the year was adopted 

/1 as presented. It i s attached hereto as Exhibit . '--- . 
One No vote by Squire Hudson. ~~ 

Th e Court then appointed the budget 
committee for the coming year. As required by 
law Judge Russell appointed himself as Chairman 
of the Committee and Jim Hartsook, Jim Blair, 
J. G. Hudson, J. Will Jones, serving as the other 
four members. 

Several years ago Newton Bogart died 
and l eft the County $2,500.00 At that time the 
Court appointed J. V. Schrimsher as Trustee to 
administer the estate for the County . The court 
has been advised that Mr. Schrimsher wished to 
be relieved of his dutie~ as Trustee and request e d 
that J. D. Click, the n ew County Trustee be . 
appointed . Upon motion of Squire Hudson and 
seconded by Squire Jones the Court unanimously 
approved the transfer and appointed J. D. Click 
as Trustee for the Newton Bogart Es.ate. 

The Court discussed the position of 
Judicial Commiss ioner which was created at the l ast 
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TASS RESOLUTION 
APPROVED 

DISCUSSION OF 
PROCESS SERVER 

RURITA N CLUB 

ELECTION OF SCHOOL 
BOARD MEMBERS BY 
THE PUBLIC 

S1\LE OF LA ND ON 
M(jDDY CREEK 

regular ~led meeting of Court - uire 
Jim Blair mo ve d and seconded by Hartsook that th e 
position be abolishe d . Squire Bledsoe moved to 
amend the motio n by requ0sLjng that th e State 
Legjs l aturc b e aske d to either amend or r epeal 
the act which authorize d the estab l ishment of 
Judicial Commissione r t o return the status of 
l aw as it was prior to the creation of the Judicial 
Commissioner post. His amendment was seconded by 
Squi r e Hudson . The vote was unanimous for the 
amendment and voting on the original motion carried 
without any "r1o" votHs . 

Squire Blair then r ead a resolution to 
the Court which would guarantee the salary of the 
Clerk and h a ve the effect of removing the Circuit 
Court Clerk from the prohibi tions o f the act re­
stricting the m from issuing warrants. His .Motion 
was seconde d by Squire Hartsook. After discussion 
a motion was ma de to table by Squire Hawk and 
seconded by Squire J ones . The vote was unanimous 
to tabl e . 

------------------------------------
The Court explained that an application an 

grant was b e ing prepared for filing with Farmer ' s 
Home Administration i n connnection with TASS. 
After due explanation and discuss ion and 
r epresentations made by former Judge Harvey L. 
Sproul. Th e Court moved b y Squire Hudson seconded 
by Squire Hawk to allow Judge Russell to file 
for the grant and loan . The vot e was unanimous . 
Being attach ed hereto as Resolution No~·· ?f:'(, ,Exhibit 

A:) . -------------------------------------
Squire Blair made a motion to abo l ish 

the ~osition of Process Server. I t was seconded 
by Squire Eldridge . Aft e r much d iscussion, Squire 
Blair removed h is mot ion and aske d that it b e 
placed on the special called session . 

------------------------------------
Squire Bledsoe advis«lthe Court that the 

Ruritan Club in the Davis Community requested that 
a l ease be drafted and sjgned between the County 
and the Ruritan Club for the purposes of using 
the Davis Schoo l . The Court advised that a lease 
would be drawn according to the discussion h a d 
and present it to the next regularly scheduled 
Court session for the Court ' s consideration. 

------------------------------------
Upon motion of Squire Blair and 

seconded By Squire Eldridge it was move d that the 
area Legislators b e advised that the Court r equ ested 
a bill to be drafted which would r equire the 
popular e l ection of the Loudon County Shool Board 
Members consisting of nin e me mbers apportioned 
exactly as th e present County Court with terms 
for four years. The vote was u animous for this. 

--------------------------------------
The Court advised the members that 

areas . oI land along ~luddy Creek Road whi c h h ad 
been .. purchased during the right of way acqu i.st ion 
for the road and portions of the same were n ow 
not of any part icul ar use to the County . 
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DISCUSSION ON PRJSOXERS' 
BONDS 

DISCUSSION OF BUSINESS 
TAXES 

JIM HARTSOOK APPOINTED 
TO SENIOR CITIZENS'COUNCIL 

NOTARY PUBLICS ELECTED 

ADJOURN:\IENT 

- -
Upon motjon of Squire Blair and 

seconded by Squire Bledsoe t he Court un a nimous l y 
passed a resolution to be sent to the aratLegisJa­
t ors to consider arYJcncling th e gener a l l aw or passi 1 

a private act applicable to Loudon County which 
would alter or remove the r equir ements tha t 
trust deeds h e drafted to the County in orde r 
for prisoners to make bond. Included in th e 
motion was a similar division in connection 

with : Notary Public ' s bonds . I t was unanimously 
passed. 

---------------------------
Upon motion of Squire Bledsoe and .seconde d 

by Squire Arp it was unanimously passed that hhe 
business t axes collected by the Trustee's Office 
and handled throug h ' th e Property Assessor's 
Office b e turn e d over to the County Cl erk . The 
County Cl e rk has a busi ness personal property 
tax with the exception of large mancifactureres 
who will continue to pay through .the Tr1},t{:e. 

7
v 

Being attache d h e reto as Resolut i on No. - o 
Exhibit 6-. ·------------------------ · 

Upon motion of Squire Bl air and seconded 
by Squire Hudson the Court unanimously r eappointed 
Squire Jim Hartsook to the Loudo n County Senior 
Citize ns' Council representing Courlty Court. 

----------------------------
The following Notary Publics were re-elect c 

or elected: Bobbie D. Hamby, H. L. Sproul, Sr . , 
J ohn L. Brown, Faye S . McDonald, Carolyn S. 
Nelson, Frank A. Harvey , and Hassalyne Walker2 
Mary Collins. 

-------------------------------

session. 
Court was adj o urn e d until th e specia l 

Riley Wampler 
COUNTY CLERK 

SEPTEMBER 1 1, 1978 

William H. Russell 
COUNTY JUDGE 
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TO: Judge William H. Russell and Members of the Loudon 
County Quarterly Court 

FROM: David H. Folz, Staff Planner 

DATE: September 11, 1978 

SUBJECT: GENERAL REPORT - LOUDON COUNTY REGIONAL PLANNING 
COMMISSION 

The Loudon County Regional Planning Commission met 1n 
regular session July 20, 1978, and considered the following: 

1. Recommended to County Court that a 3.7 acre tract 
located off Martel Road owned by Jack Hardin be 
rezoned from R-1 , Suburban Residential to C-2, 
General Commercial. A public hearing will be held 
on the matter at the October meeting of the court. 

2. Assisted Mr. Erwin Collins in his efforts to prepare 
a subdivision plat for property off Stockton Valley 
Road. 

3. Discussed the problem with South Central Bell and 
their lack of compliance with the county ' s resolu­
tion dealing with work conducted in public road 
right-of-ways and the requirements for the posting 
of bonds. Mr . Davis, county road engineer, explained 
that he is trying to .r.:et South Central Bell to submit 
a bond for their work in county road right-of-ways. 
The commission voted to proceed with the appropriate 
legal enforcement remedies if South Central Bell fails 
to compl y with the county law. 

4. Requested that staff investigate a proposed Barite 
mining operation in South Loudon County. 

5. Discussed a road proposed by Mr . Robert Bedwell and 
building work being done on the O. D. Hall property 
off U. S . 11 . The corrunission directed the building 
corrunissioner to investigate the latter item and 
report back to the corrunission. 

6. Heard the building corrunissioner's report and the road 
engineer's report. 

7. Approved the planning Program Des ign and discussed 
grading) drainage, and soil erosion regulations. 



- - -
RESOLUTION NO. 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING MAP OF LOUDON 
COUNTY, TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 
13-405 OF THE TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZONE 
PARCELS 98, 99, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106 , 107, 
108, AND 109, MAP 76, FROM A-2, RURAL RESIDENTIAL TO 
R-1, SUBURBAN RESIDENTIAL . 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four , Section 13-405 of the Tennessee 
Code Annotated may, from time to time , amend the number, 
shape , boundary, area, or any regul ation of or within any 
zoning resolution ; and 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Regional Planning Commis­
sion has forwarded its recommendations regarding the amend­
ment of the Zoning Ma£ of Loudon County , Tennessee, and the 
necessary public hearing called for and held; 

NOW THEREFORE , BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court that the Zoning Map of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I. That Parcels 98, 99, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 
106 , 107, 108, and 109> Map 76 located in the 
3rd Civil District be rezoned from A-2, Rural 
Residential to R-1, Subu~ban Residential . 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall 
take effect immediately, the public welfare requiring it. 

DATE: 

LOUDON COUNTY JUDGE 

ATTEST: 
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,.\CCOUNT 
NO. 

01- 383 

496 

744 

701 

650 

798 

459 

795 . 
460 
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LOUDON COilliTY , . TEl:\TNESSEE 

STATEMENT OF PROPOSED EXPENDITURES 

~ 1978- 1979 

HIGHWAY FUND 

I TEM 
. .... _ - . ·- . - -

-.. 

EXPENDITURE FOR NEW ROAD COI 

Salaries 

Utiliti es 

Repairs & Maintenance 

Gas , Oil , Diesel 

Bridge & Road Mater ials 

Tile 

Other Contractual Services 

Rock 

Road Construction 

TOTAL EXPENDITURES 

GRAND TOTAL 

ACTUAL 
1976- 77 

!MISSIONER 

ESTIMATED 
1977-78 

. . 

.. . 

-, 
·-:"' 

- -

PROPOSED 
1978- 79 

-
-

122 ,731 . 88 

500.00 

49, 500 . 00 . 

29 ,000 . 00 

66 ,ooo .oo 

10 ,000 . 00 

1 ,250. 00 

64,ooo . oo 

10 ,000 .00 

352 ,981.88 

476 ,061. 88 

'I 
j 

I, ____________ r eques t that t he above items of expend· . 

itures t o be included i n the budget f or t he fiscal year · l 978-79. 

. . 
• I ·. I • • 

.. 

• I 

. . 

I 

I 
• I 
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ACCOUNT 
l~O. 

3100- 115 

l)Ql 

534 

556 

641 

405 

824 

402 

404 . 
837 

1~06 

990 

LOUDON COUNTY, . TEN1"ESSEE 

STATEMENT. OF PROPOSED EXPENDITURES 

.1978-1979 

HIGHWAY FUND 
--~~~~~~~~~----

ITEM 
ACTUAL 
1976- 77 

ESTIMATED 
1977-78 

Budget for new Road 

Commission~r -- REVENUE ( 
. 

. 
Admini strative Salaries 

Travel 

Telephone 
·, 

Subscriptions & Dues 
. 

Office Supplies 

Inusrance-Employee 

Other Insurance 

Social Security 

Retirement 

Trustee Commission 

Unemployment Compensation 
. 

County Garage .. -
. . 

TOTAL OVERHEAD 

- · 

PROPOSED 
1978-79 

476,061.88 
---·--·· 

"16,895. 00 

·1,500 . 00 

210 . 00 

305 . 00 

400.00 

8 , 000.00 

25,000.00 

9 , 760.00 

20,060 . 00 

4 , 800.00 

2 , 400.00 

13,750. 00 

123.080. 00 

I 

I, ~~~~~~----~--~~-request that the above items of expend-. 

itures to be i ncluded in .the budget for the fiscal . year · l978-79. 

. ~ . 

·. 

) 

.. 

; • 
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HIXUTES -- LOUDmI COUN'PY PURCHASING COi,1HITTEE 

The Loudon County Purchasing Committee met Au.;ust 1, Aucust 22 and 

August ?9, 1978, to ope!l and award the following bids: 

OFFICE SUPPLIES: Bid awarded to A & W Office Supply 
A 2.: W Office Supply 
United Office Supply 
Interstate School Supply(incomplete) 
Beal Office Supply 

of Knoxville. 
$1,532.22 
1,694.86 
1,445.92 
1,814.59 

FILM, INK, etc. for Graphic Arts Dept. Bid awarded to Taylor fo.pressions 

of Kno:{ville. Ta.ylor Ir.1pressior:s, Inc. 
Boyd & Ogden, Inc. 

1,115.86 
1,068.15 

ICE MACHINES: Bid awarded to Institutional Jobbers, Inc. 

I~stitutional Jobbers 
Scruggs, Inc. 

2,232.00 
2,636.80 

EXHAUST SYST:SM for Eatons Cafeteria: Bid awarded to Scrugss, Inc. 

Scru,e;gs, Inc. 
II'-stitutional Jobbers 

16,239.00 
No Bid 

COLD FOOD NODULE: Bid awarded to Scruggs, Inc. 
Scruggs, Inc. 2,275.00 

HEALTH DEPT. MEDICAL SUPPLIES: Bid awarded to White Surgical Supply. 

802.06 
870.77 
999.12 

WASHERS, 

Service Store. 

White Surgical Supply 
Central Medical Supply 
Acme Supply Co. 

DRYERS, REFRIGERATORS & OVENS: 

Goodyear 
Sears, Roebuck Co. 
Greers 

Bid awarded to Goodyear 

2,390.00 
2,807.60 
3,117.80 

FENCING FOR LOUDON JR. HIGH: Bid awarded to American Bence Co. of 

Knoxville American Fence. Co. 
Ace Fence Company 
GN Fence Company 

1,895.00 
2,782.00 
3,916.00 

AMBULANCE SUPPLIES: Bid awarded to Dyna-Medi Inc. of California. 

Ir.rna-r~ed, Inc. 
Southern 1st Aid Supply 
t~nderson H & M S3.les 

3lJ.6.38 
396.17 
488.oo 

WATER COOLERS FOR Board of Education. 

Modern Supply Co. 
Lei:i.art's, Inc. 
Hajoca, Inc. 

Bid awarded to Hoder:!:l. Supply C~. 

221. 00 ea. 
249.00 ea. 
258.00 ea .• 

COLOR TELEVISIONS for Board of Education: Bid awarded to Greer's Inc. 

Greer's, Inc. 
General TV, Lenoir City 
Bondura:'l.t Bros., KnoY.ville 
U:1.ited General Products 
Ledbetter TV Sales 

339.95 
529.95 
355.00 
429.90 
429.00 

ea. 
ealto 
ea. 
ea. 
ea. 
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ATHLETIC EQUIPJ.!ENT for North Middle School. Bid awarded to Athletic 

House of Knoxville. Atheletic House 
Athletic Supply Co. 
Bell, be. 

$531.05 
No Bid 
No Bid 

~EFLOORING Cafeteria area at Eatons School. Bid m.,rarded to Building 

& Utilities Specialty Co. of Knoxville. 
Building & Utilities Co. 
John Beretta Tile Co. 

8,277.00 
No Bid 

ROOFING at Loudon High School. No Bids received. 

DROP-IN CEILING at Steekee and Loudon Jr. High. Bid awarded to 

Bobby Massey of Loudon Bobby Massey 
Ed.die Collis 

9,125.00 
9 1 945.00 

DEMOLITION at Greenbac~ (3, 000 sq. ft.) Bid m·n'!.rded to Letner 

Wrecking Company Letn0r Wrecking Co. 
Omie, Inc. 
Burnett Wrecking Co. 

780.00 
2,372.00 

12,100.00 

CARPET SHAMPOOER: Bid awarded to Kel-San Products of Knocville. 

Kel-San Products 
George's Sanitary Supply 
Dale Sanitary Supply 
Von Schrader Company 

620.00 ea. 
790.00 ea. 
855.00 ea. 

1,005.00 ea. 

HEAVY DUTY VACUUM CLEANER: Bid awarded to Bale Sanitary Supply of 

Knoxville. Dale Sanitary Supply 
Kel-San Products 
George's Sanitary Supply 
Von Schrader Co. 

310.17 ea. 
350.00 ea. 
323.53 ea. 

No Bid 

FILING CABINETS, etc. for Board of Education. Bid awarded to A & W 

Office Supply. A & W Office Supply 3,518.60 
Beal Office Su~1_1ly 4, 076.56 
United Office Supply 4t288.56 
Potpourri School Supply 3,608.95 
Intersj;ate School Supply(inco:nplete) 2, 7t1-7. 34 

xxxx~:RXxm~~~~xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxzxxxxxxxx 
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RESOLUTION NO . 

WHEREAS i t has been determined that there is need for public 
water service in selected rural areas in Loudon County , and 

WHEREAS a project to extend water lines and necessary 
appurtenances has been defined a nd feas ibility studies completed 
in connection with said project , and 

WHEREAS the impl ementation of said project will furthe.r 
promote the f inancial stability of the Tellico Area Services System , 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County Quarterly 
Court that applications be filed on behalf of the Tellico Area 
Services System for loan and grant assistance from the Farmers Rome 
Administration and the Appalachian Regional Commission to finance 
the design and construction of the proposed facilities , 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Ccunty Judge acting on 
behalf of the Tellico Area Services System is hereby authorized to 
sign all necessary assurances and application forms and to provide 
such additional information as may be r equired to complete processing 
of the application, 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED that this resolution s hall take effect 
immediately , the publ ic welfare requiring. 

Da t e: 

Attest : 




