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APP!".0'.TAT.. O? i·UNCTES 

RECOGNITION 0~ VISITOP.8 

Hu~TSVILLE COM!mNITY 
G~~T 

JUSTICE CENTEP. PLAQUE 

CONTRACTORS: BUSil'lF.SS 

Vi.t:RIT svsTF.M r or­
n IG~~~1A v r·r0D.KP.RS 

- -
0UJ\~.TF. P.r.v COU?JTY COUF!.7. FEB~UA:i{'! 6 I 1 9 7 8 

Be it remembered that tl1e Quarterly County 
Court of Loudon County, Tennessee met on Feb. 6 , 
1~7~ at 7 :no ?.m. with the Honorable ~·lilliam II. 
Russell, County Judge , ores idinq an<l Ad<lie Ruth 
Clarke, De9uty Clerk of said Court was present; 
NhereuJ?on , Chief Deputy Sheriff Luke Brig~t ope:1ed 
Court, Led the Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag , 
and introduced the Re v e rend Tony Barnes of the 
Nazaren e Church of Loudon who gave the invocation. 

The following Squires i·1ere present : 

J . ;r. Blair 
I. D. Conner 
'"l. G. rrudson 
Rov Bledsoe 
Terry Vann 

Curtis Williams 
,Tames Harts ook 
Boyd Duckworth 
R. P. Hamilton 

The mi nutes of the December 5 , 1977 meetinq 
o f the Court were adopted u p on mot ion of Squi~e 
Huds on seconaed by Squire BJ.air. The minutes 
' ·7ere a!Jproved a s presented . 

Visitors in the audience were recognized 
at thi s time . 

The Court recognized 1·1r. W • A • Goley 
representing a group of citizens from the 
Huntsville Community showing t!i.eir support for 
the HUD grant app lication being filed by Loudon 
County. 

·The Court recognized Squire Blair who ·1.-1as 
concetne d about the olaaue for the Justice Center . 
He pointed out that ihe .. ori9ina l plaque has been 
either lost or destroyed. He asked that the 
matter he looked in~o and that if someone 
nestroyed the p l aque that they s hould be J?rosecuted 

Squire BJ.air also ask ed if contractors doing 
business in Loudon County was paying a business 
t ax . Especially the contractor building the 
new school. The County Court Clerk is · checking 
on the Sub-contractors , 

The Court recogni~ed !=;q uire f:udson who asked 
i f the Hiqhway workers ~ere on the merit system . 
A meetinq of the !~rit board was called for 
Monday , Februar y 13, 1978 at 7:~0 p.m. at the Loudor 
County Justice Center fo r the personnel hoard and 
three comrr.issioners to take action on thi s issue. 
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RF.CAP n;. COUNTY COURT 
J\CCO~-~~LI SH!•mNTS 

.Z\PPOINT'1F.NT 0P V~IF'ICATION 
C0MtU7TE.F. 

BUDGET AND PURCHASING 
cm,1HI'I'TEES REJ.'.PPOINTF.D. 

HIGHWA~ cmirU'J'TEP. 
APPOINTED 

.li.PPOI\!Tt-1!'.:'t~T or ~IF.!1BP:R TO 
COU!''!Tv INDUSTRIAL BOND 
BOARn 

P.PPOJ:NT~·mNT OF J.'.GP.ICCLTUI'.F. 
COI'JU'ITEE 

- -
Judge Russell recanPe<l Coll".l ty Court 

accomnlis!~ments durina the fall of 1976 and 
1~77 \·1hich is attacheci hereto as F.xhibi t Ff ·-

Judqe Russell appointed a unification committee 
with Ter~y Vann, Chairman and Larry Cate and 
Ron Bridqeman, merrbers. The comrni ttee •. .,as asked 
to use ail the County resources availa~le in 
its study to bring total unification to Loudon 
County and add additional members as needed . 

----------------------~-~-------

Judae Russell aooointed the same members 
to the -Purchasing and Bud9et Committees as last 
year urging the budget committee to act as a 
budget planning committee anQ to pre9are a 5 year 
budqet plan. 

-------------------------~-~-~~~~ 

Judge Pussell a~pointed Squire R. P. Hamilton 
an<l Jim ~artsook , and Boyd Duckworth to the 
County hiq:tway conuni ttee charged \'d th certification 
of candidates to the ne•-r post of county road 
supervisor to the election conunission. 

---------------------~-~-~--~~777 

Tom Mvers of Louci.on was named to the County 
Industrial Bond Board to re?l~ce Don Canter . 

It was moved by ~quire Rlair and seconded by 
Squire Williams that Bobby Shell and Gail Farris 
be named to the A9riculture Conunittee . The 
vote 'l:1as unanimous. 

------------------------~-,-~~~-, 

REPORT OF PLA1~NING CO.ll!USSION ·nave Folz of the State Planning Office gave 

.:ZV-!EN!Y'.FNT TO LOUD0N COtiNTV 
ZO'l\lD,1G PESOLU':"I0~1 

CONSIDERJ:l.'J'ICN ()f' 2 ROA!JS 
POP PGBLIC ~CCEPTANCE 

P.E'.701'1ING REQUES'J'-
F!rfU,J\~-ln HILLS SlJB!)J:VISIO~ 

the qeneral report of the December 15, 1977 and 
Ja~uar~ l~, 1978 meeting of the.P~annj..pg Commission 
'·Jh1ch .is_ attached hereto ·as Exhibit, · f:.) • 

It was moved by Squire Hamilton and seconded 
by Squire Vann to amend the Loudon County 
Zoning Resolution which would allow individual 
mobile ~omes in the C-1 Rural Center District. 
The vote was una::-iimous and the resolution being 
attached hereto as Resolution No'.;;;:_/-:7~ ExhibitL 

It was moved ~y ~quire Hudson seconded by 
Squire Williams that t~e consideration of ?. 
roads for oublic acceptance: Blalock Smith R<l . 
(TVl'. oroj ect no. 3?.~4) anri a private road , 1650 
feet in lencrth extending westwardly from 
.l\.ntioch Church P.d . to tlte .-·Iartel Gate at the 
.r.obinson Lc.ke Prooerty line he acce9ted. The 
vote '·;as unanimous for this an.cl it is at+ached 
hereto as "F'solution No . . -Exhibit ---·--

It was moved by Squire Conner seconded by 
Squire Vann that the rc?.oninq request for parcels 
60 anr1 61, ·of the Hicthland. Hills Su!::-division and 
an adjacent 3 . 81 acres tract from ~-1 Suburban 
P.esi<lential to C-2 , General Commercial be aporove<l 
and the vote was unanimous ar;dr,: it is a ttihed 
'l:Areto as rzesolution No ;J.. 3-/,l Exhibit , __ . 
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~ ·: •,. • • "::' : : .•' • I •, 

RE?ONING Rr.QUFST­
PARCELS 2 & 1, ~AP 93-
PJ\RCELS 22 & /.3, :rnP BS . ~ . . . 

PP.70NING P..E0UF.ST-
F'?ED SHULTS , A!lOS SHULTS , 
& CECIL HAWKINS 

.· 

P..E70NING P..F.QUEST­
W. B . COSTtrnP. 

POSTJ?ONF.MENT TO 
CONDEI·:N ROADWAY FOR 
lUDDLE SCHOOL 

CLEP.K OF NORKS POSITION 
DEL!>.YED 

BTJILDI~-JG CO!<'.~ISSI01'1ER 
PP.P0RT 

....... 

- -
" I .t ·was moved by Squire IIudf;on and seconded by 

Squire Williams that the rezoning r equest for 
Parcel 3 , J1ap 93, from !!-1 General Industrial 
to 1\-2 Rural ncsidential; a lso Parcels 22 and 23 
Hao 85 an<l Pnrcel 2, nao ~3 from H-1 General 
Industrial to A-1 Agriculture Forestry. · The 
parcels being loc<'l.ted off 411 in the third 
ci v5. l district . The vote •:1as .un~nirnous. Being 
attai:hed as Resolution No. ;2 ¥:·/~Exhibit ?t . 

. ~ .2 ~? ~' "Fr-
It \·1as moved by Squire Huf!.son, seconded by 

Squire Hartsook that the follo".ving parcels be 
rezoned from !·l-1 General !n(1ustrial to 1~-1 , 

Agriculture Forestry; Parce l , Mao 93 
owned hy Pred Shults; Parcel 31, Map 36 owned 
by Amos Shults: Parcel 32, Hal? 86 owned by Cecil 
Hawkins . All the adjoining Parcels be·ing in 
the third civil district. 'l'he vote was unanimous 
and it is ~!-tached hereto as Resolution Noc) .s-:::. 7,'l 
Exhibit' .JJ . 

It ~"as IDoved by Squire Duckworth and seconded 
by Squire Blair that the rezoning request for 
Parcel 8-2, Map 63 be oostooned until the next 
meeting. The vote was unanimous . 

It was move d by Squire Blair and seconded by 
Squire Duckworth that the rezoning request for 
Parcel -18 , Map 62 from A-2, Rural P-esidential 
to C-1, Rural Center District ( W. B. Costner) 
b e aoproved . The vote was unanimous and is 
attached hereto as Resolution NO-.~$Exhibit ff . 

Action on a reqaest by the Board of Education 
to condemn f:>roperty m·med by Arthur Hope and 
Harvey Gray for a roadway into the new Fort 
Loudon Middl e School at Loudon was delayed for a 
month . ~-!r . Hope was present and asked why his 
l and and Mr. Gray's was .chosen when the Board of 
F.ducatiQn could have chosen the property from the 
Thomas Estate . Hr. Headlee stated the reason \·1as 
because of large trees on the Tho~as property would 
have to be removed. Also some of the Thomas 
pro9e~ty had already been condemned when the high 
school ~as bui l t . It was moved by Squir~ Hamilton 
and seconded by Squire Williams ~o postpone this 
issue for one month. 

A one month delay was t aken by the Court in 
approving funds to pay a cle rk of the works for 
t he current construction of $4 million in new 
schoolsin the County. 

The Court recognized Jack Henry , Building 
Commissioner who gave his report. He r eported 
$1, ?.66. 00 \·1as collected in Dec~mber and January 
for huildina nermits adding . $477,000 to the 
assessed nro9erty and $3 ,70~.n0 to the tax roll. 
This reorese nts 20 new ho~~ s , 4 additions and 
one co'f!UTl(ffCia l building. 

FEDP.UARY 6 , l??B Page 3 

•::< /0 



-
APPROV~L OP BUDGE~ 
NmND'ffl'lTS 

PURCHP.SING corfJ!ITTEE 
REPORT 

RE.l\PPORTIONEi·lENT 

HUD G?ANT FOR 
HUNTSVILLE 

COUNTY-WIDE FIPE 
DF.PA?.T~F.NT 

P.EFUND OF TAXES 

ELECTIOll OP. NOT.;RY 
PUBLICS. 

ADJ Ot.:' !'~'l.~~EtTT 

- -
: ·:_ rt . was- move d by Squire Huclsen and secn~<J 0.<1 
by S'}uire Hamilton that the Budget ame ndments 
be approvecl. The vote was unanipous. 'l'hcy 
are attac~ed hereto a s F.xhibit~ . 

The r.ourt recoqnized Bundy Jenkins 
gave the Purchasing corrunitt~r.epor.t. 
attached hereto as Exhibit .• 

Squire Hamilton ~resented the 

who 
It is 

reapportionement of the districts in Loudon County 
and ~oved that they be accented . It was seconded 

- by Squire Vann. There was a roll-call vote 
as follows; 

AV.F: 
Blair 
Bledsoe 
Vann 
Duck~vorth 
Hamilton 
Hartsook 
Hudson 
Williams 

· NAY: 
Conner 

l'~ttached hereto as Exhibi t,x· 

-------------------------------- ~ 

A resolution to file appli cation for a 100 % 
HUD grant for the Huntsviiia community was 
presented to the Court by Squire Hartsook. Squire 
Bledsoe asked to add a community building 
at Philadelphia to the grant proposal if it 
would not decrease the changes of the application 
being accepted. A motion to accept the proposal 
was made by Squire Hartsook and seconded by 
Squire Conner . The vote was unanimous. Being 
attaclied "Jl(!eto as ~esolution No. ':d 7-2f 
Ex..liibi t , , . 

--~---------------------------~-
John Parris was added to the committee 

s tudying the possibility of a county-wide ;t;ire 
del?artment. 

--------------------------~---~-7 

A request for refund of taxes in the amount 
of $1~1. 93 to the Tlrs. l-Ie.'3ter Bell heirs was heard!. 
the Court • . 'A . motion was made by Squire Hamilton 
and seconded by Squire Williams. The vote was 
unanimous. 

---------------------------------
~t was moved by Squire Vann and seconded by 

Squire Bledsoe that the followin9 notary ?Ublics 
_ b~ el.ected: John 0. Gibson , Steve Hurst ~ J,ucy 
. ,S . White, Id us Littleton , , James !·1. Hartsook , 

Claude na:oles , Ro:i:,ert II. Hudson , Sue Newberry 
an<l Robin K. Naller. ·· ' 

--~-----------------------------~--

There heing no further business come ~efore 
the Co':1rt, Sq':1irc l·!i lliams moved. and H~s secon~ 
hy Squire Hamilton that the · rceting adJourn. ( ?~I.) 

. ~'7il l iam H. Russ-e-ri:_ 
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M E M 0 R A N D U M 

TO: Judge William H. Russell and Members of the Loudon 
County Quarterly Court 

FROM: David H. Folz, Staff Planner 

DATE: January 9, 1978 

SUBJECT: GENERAL REPORT - PLA~JNING COMMISSION 

The Loudon County Regional Planning Commission met in 
regular session December 15, 1977 and considered the following 
items: 

Cl) Heard a rezoning request from Mr. Frank Hildreath for 
Parcels 60 and 61 and a 3.81 acre adjacent tract from 
R-1, Suburban-Residential to C-2, General Commercial. 
Mr. Winfrey represented Mr. IIildreath and stated that 
the purpose of the rezoning was to permit the construc­
tion of a shopping center on the property. Staff recom­
mended against rezoning the property primarily because 
of the incompatibility of the adjacent proposed residen­
tial land uses and the traffic problems that will be 
encountered. Both the Lenoir City and Loudon County 
Regional Planning Commissions voted unanimously to rezone 
the property to C-2, General Commercial. A public hear­
ing has been called for the February meeting of the 
county court. 

(2) Heard a rezoning request from Mr. Eugene Il lack and a staff 
report on the rezoning survey in the 411 area southwest of 
Greenback. Staff recommended that Parcel 3, Map 93, being 
the land that lies between 411 and the L&N Railroad, not 
be rezoned from M-1, General Industrial to A-2, Rural 
Residential because it is a prime site for industrial 
development. Staff did recommend that approximately 162 
acres north of the railroad be rezoned from M-1 to A-1, 
Agriculture-Forestry since the land is less desirable for 
industrial development. These parcels included Parcel 2, 
Map 93, Parcels 22 and 23, Map 85, and Parcels 31 and 36, 
Map 86 from M-1 to A-1. Mr. Black wanted the property 
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Judge Wil liam H. Russell 
January 9~ 1978 
Page 2 

property rezoned so that his daughter could build a house 
on part of Parcel 3. The p l anning commission voted to 

. rezone Parcel 3 to A-2, Rura l Residential and the rest of 
t he parcels to A-1, Agriculture-Forestry. A public hear­
ing has been called for the February meeting of the county 
court. 

( 3) A request for a curb variance on a proposed road off Waller· 
Ferry Road was deferred indefinite l y at the request of the 
petitioner, Mr. R. M. Moore. 

(4) The planning commiss ion informed Mr. Clifford Shirk and 
Mr. \I . B. Costner of the appeal process on rezoning re­
quests. A public hearing on the two rezoning requests 
has been scheduled for the February meeting of the county 
court . 

( 5) Heard a staff report on the occupancy permit requirements. 

( 6 ) Heard the road engineer's report in which Mr. Davis recom­
mended that two roads be publically accepted. One is a 
former private road 1,650 feet long ext ending westwardly 
from Ant~och Church Road to the meta l gate at the Robinson 
Lake property. The other is a TVA project road (TVA 3294 ) 
called Blalock-Smith Road. Thi s road services an area of 
property owners cut off by the Tellico Dam waters and is 
located slightly east of the Glendale area. The planning 
commission voted unanimously to recommend public accept­
ance of both roads. 

(7) Heard the bui lding commissioner 's report. 
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M E M 0 R A N D U M 

TO: Judge \·l. H. Russell and Members of the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court 

FROM: David Folz, Staff Planner 

DATE: February 6, 1978 

SUBJECT: GENERAL REPORT - LOUDON COUNTY REGIONAL PLANNif\SG 
COMMISSION 

The Loudon County Regional Planning Commission met in regular 
session January 19, 1978 and considered the following items: · 

1. Heard a rezoning request for Parcels 54-1, 54-0, 53, 
104.1, 55-0,- and a part of the DeWitt Subdivision 
between Parcels 104.1 and 55-0, Map 12 from R-1, 
Suburban Residential to A-1, Agriculture Forestry. 
This request involving over 151 acres was made by 
Mr. Brett N. Ward who wants to operate a commercial 
feed lot for about 600 hogs. Staff Recommended 
against the rezoning because it would be in conflict 
with the land use plan and might create a nuisance for 
the adjoining subdivisions (DeWitt, Ford, and Lane). 
The planning commission voted to hold a public hearing 
on the request at its next regular meeting. 

2 . The planning commission voted to grant a variance on 
the curb requirement for a proposed new road located 
off Waller Ferry Road being built by R. M. Moore and 
Associates. The planning commission based its deci­
sion on the recommendation of the County Road Engineer 
and data that indicated that a drainage problem would 
be created if curbs were put on the new road. 

3. Heard a brief staff report on the completed study that 
identifies 8 potential Sanitary Landfill Sites in 
Loudon County 

4. Heard Building Commissioner's report. 

DF/dkr 
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RESOLUTION NO • .;} / / 2 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING ARTICLE 5, SECTION 5.044, 
PARAGRAPH B, PAGE 84 OF THE LOUDON COUNTY ZONIMG 
RESOLUTION, PURSUANT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 13-405 
OF THE TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED TO INCLUDE INDIVIDUAL 
MOBILE HOME STRUCTURE AS A PERMITTED USE IN THE C-1, 
RURAL CENTER DISTRICT PROVIDED SUCH STRUCTURES MEET 
THE REQUIREMENTS AS SET FORTH IN SECTION 4.100 OF THE 
LOUDON COUNTY ZONING RESOLUTION AND ALL APPLICABLE 
ZONING DISTRICT REGULATIONS. 

-

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any zoning 
resolution, and 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Regional Planning Commission 
has forwarded its recommendation regarding the amendment to 
the Loudon County Zonin~ Resolution, and the necessary public 
hearing called for and eld; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court that the Zoning Resolution of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I. That Article 5, Section 5.044, Paraeraph B, Page 84, 
of the Loudon County Zoning Resolution be amended 
to allow individual mobile home structure·s as a per­
mitted use provided such structures meet the require­
ments as set forth in Section 4.100 of the Loudon 
County Zoning Resolution and all applicable zoning 
district regulations. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall take 
effect immediately, the public welfare r equiring it. 

toOnoN ~oONTY JUDGE 

. ;2. Ir; 
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RESOLUTIOH NO .2 ,LJ f 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY, 
TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 13-405 OF THE 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZO~E PARCEL 3, MAP 93, FROM 
M-l, GEHERAL INDUSTRIAL TO A-2, RURAL RESIDENTIAL. 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any zoning 
resolution; and 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Regional Planning Commission 
has forwarded its recommendations regarding the amendni.ent of 
the Zoning Map of Loudon County, Tennessee, and the necessary 
public hearing called for and held; 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court that the Zoning Map of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I. That Parcel 3, Map 93, said parcel being located 
in the 3rd Civil District and being approximately 
37 acres in size be rezoned from M-1, General 
Industrial to A-2, Rural Residential. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall 
take effect irrunediately, the public welfare requiring it. 

LOUDON COUNTY JUDGE 

ATTEST: 

;9 
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RESOLUTION No. ;>i- '/ g· 

A RESOLUTIO!.I AMENDING THE ZONDJG MAP OF LOUDON COU~TTY, 
TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO CHAPTE~ FOUR, SECTION 13-405 OF THI: 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZONE LOTS 60 AND 61 OF THE 
HIG!ILAND HILLS SUhDIVISIOH AND AN ADJACENT 3 . 81 ACRE TRACT, 
FROM R-1, SUOURBA!·l RESIDENTIAL TO C-2, GENERAL COMMERCIAL. 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the numher, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any zoning 
resolution; and 

v7HEREAS, the Loudon County Regional Plannine Commission 
has forwarded its recommendations regarding the amendment of 
the Zoning Map of Loudon County, Tennessee, be amended as 
follows: 

I . That lots . GO and 61 of the Highland Hills Sub­
division and an adjacent 3.81 acre tract said 
property being located in the Second Civil 
District be rezoned from R-1, Suburban Residen­
tial to C-2, General Commercial. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall 
take effect immediately, the public welfare requiring it. 

LOUDON COUNTY JUDGE 

. ~If' 



RESOLUTION NO. ~ <f= - 7 ~ 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY, 
TENNESSEE, PURSUAf\JT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 13-405 OF THE 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZONT.: PARCELS 22 AND 2 3, MAP 
85 AND PARCEL 2, HAP 93 FROM M-1, GENERAL INDUSTRIAL TO 
A-1, AGRICULTURE FORESTRY. 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any zoning 
resolution; and 

\HIEREAS, the Loudon County Regional Planning Commission 
has forwarded its recommendations regarding the amendment of 
the Zonino- Ma of Loudon Count Tennessee, and the necessary 
public hearing ca led or and he d; 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court that the Zoning Map of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I . That Parcels 22 and 23, Map 85 and Parcel 2, 
Map 93, said parcels being located in the 3rd 
Civil District, be rezoned from H-1, General 
Industrial to A-1) Agriculture Forestry. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall 
take effect immediately, the public welfare requiring it. 

LOUDON COUNTY JUDGE 
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RESOLUTION NO . ) ~-J ~ 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZO t>JI J\JG MAP OF LOUDON COUHTY, 
TE~NESSEE, PURSUN·fT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTIO't..l 13-405 OF THE 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZOiJE PARCEL 1, MAP 9 3, ~m 
PARCELS 31 .A;'1D 32, MAP 86 FROM M-1, GEi·?E'RAL I NDUSTRIAL TO 
A-1, AGRICULTURE FORESTRY. 

tJHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any zoning 
r esolution; and ' 

UHEPJ:AS, the Loudon County Regional Planning Commission 
has forwarded its recommendat ions regarding the amendment of 
the Zoning Map of Loudon County , Tennessee, and the necessary 
public hearing called for and held; 

lW\1 THEREFORE ~ BE IT RESOLVED, by the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court that the Zoning Map of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I. That Parcel 1, Map 93 and Parcels 31 and 32, 
Map 86 said parcels being located in the 3rd 
Civil District be rezoned from M-1, General 
Industrial to A-1, Agriculture Forestry. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall 
take effect immediately, the public welfare requiring it. 

LOUDON COUNTY JUDGE 
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RESOLUTION NO. J.&- - 7 ~ 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY, 
TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 13-405 OF THE 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZONE PARCEL 48, MAP 62 FROM 
A-2, RURAL RESIDE~TIAL TO C-1, RURAL CENTER DISTRICT. 

h'HEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any resolu·­
tion; and 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Regional Planning Commission 
has forwarded its recommendations regarding the amendment of 
the Zoning Map of Loudon County, Tennessee, and the necessary 
public hearing called for and held; 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Loudon County 
Quarterly Court that the Zoning Map of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I. That Parcel 48, Map 62, said parcel being located 
in the 1st Civil District be rezoned from A-2, 
Rural Residential to C-1, Rural Center District. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall 
take effect immediately the public welfare requiring it. 

LOUDON COUNTY JUDGE 
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Acct . No. 

1L~2-27100 

142-24100 

142-17100 

142-24100 

142-17100 

142-241100 

-
BUDGET Al'!JE'rffiHJ;:}ITS 

February 6, 1978 

HIGHWAY FUND 

Unappropriated Surplus 

Appropriations 
(142- 43102-744)Repairs & 
Maintenance 

This a.mendme.ndl WBS requested by 
Lee Malone-2nd & 5th Dist. Road 
Commissioner 

Estimated REvenue 

Dr. 

$8,ooo.oo 

(Acct. 142- 33461) Rural noad Funds24,580.78 
Appropriations 

(Acct. 142- 43103- 464)County share 
rural roads 

Estimated Revenue 
(Acct . 142-33461) Rural Road Fun~s41, 106.50 

Appropriations 
(Acct. 142- 43103- 464)County share 
ruaal roads 

-

$8,ooo.oo 

24,580. 78 

41 , 106.50 
Transfer _$100 .00 from Acct. 142- 43103-896 (Trucks and Road Machinery) 

to Acct. 142-43103-496 (Utilities) 

142- 27100 

142- 24100 

These amendments were eequested by Joe 
., Greenway- 3rd Dist. Road Commissioner 

Unappropriated Surplus-1st. & 4th. Dist . 
s·i .. e ,000.00 

Appropriations 
Acct. 142-!~3101-650 (Bridge & Road 
Materials- 1st. & 4th District 

Transfer $12.00 from Acct. 142-43}01 - 459 (Other Contracted 

services) to Acct . 142- 43101- 496 (Utilities)-1st & 4th Dist. 

'Fnase amendments were r equest by J. E. 

Milsaps- 1st & 4th District. 

GENERAL FUNJ) 

. 
$ .. :8 ,000. 00 

Transfer $400. 00 from Acct. 110 41900 001 (unalloca~ed-Primary) 
to Acct. 110 41510 641 (Office supplies- Center al Accounting) 

.Approve the nayment of the lunch hour of the ambulance drivers 
and i~crease thei~ pay to $3. 00 an hour as of the 1st of Febraary 1978 
for the E.M.T. ' s and a proportiate raise be given the one ambulance 
driver. 

·-



- - -

MINUTES -- LOUDON COUNTY PURCHASING COMMITTEE 

The Loudon County Purchasing Committee met Tues. 9 December 27 9 

1977 9 at 7:00 p. m. to open and award the following bids: 

8 sections of shelving for Philadel phia School. Bid was 

awarded to Baker and Taylor Products of Knoxville. 

Baker & Taylor School Products 
Interstate School Suppl y 

$698.45 
728.00 

18 Tables 9 aiso for Philadel phia School. Bid awarded to 

Baker and Taylor Products of Knoxville. 

Baker & Taylor School Products 
Interstate School Supply 
Potpourri School Division 

2,509. 20 
2t519.10 

No Bid 

Addition of school bus routes. Bid awarded to Robert 

Howard for the Eatons area and Scott Collins for Highland Park area. 

Robert Howard 
Lester Williams 
Scott Collins 

975.00 per mo. 
1,000.00 per mo. 
1,000.00 per mo. 

Carpet for the second floor at Loudon County Memorial 

Hospital. Bid was awarded to Harb ' s Rug Cleaning Co. 
Link's Carpet Center 
AAA Tile & Carpet 
Four Seasons Carpet 
Frazier's Carpet 
Cloverleaf Carpet Sal es 

13,525.00. 
17,700.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

Fabric wall covering for Loudon County Memorial Hospital. 

Bid awarded to J . W. Wilburn li{lrdware of Lenoir City. 

J. W. Wilburn Hardware 
Varitex Wall Covering 

9.30 per roll 
9.90 per roll 



- - -

REAPPORTIONE;1ENT PRESENTED BY 

CHAI RMAN' R. P . HA.f\1ILTON 

1-4 dis t rict 

District line begins at Highway 11 bridge and TN river , run east 

with TN river to Little TN river , thence with Little TN r i ver to 

HonJ:"oe Co. line to Meigs Co. line , .Meigs Co . line to Roane Co . Line , 

Roane Co . line to TN river with TN river to TN river bridge on Highway 

11 . 

2 distri ct 

District lines for second district to be same as !enoir City corporate 

limit lines on February 6 , 1~78 . 

3 district 

To begin at Highway 70 & 11 , run with Knox Co . l ine to TN r iver , t hence 

with TN river south to Bl ount and Loudon Co. corner, then with Blount 

Co. line to Little TN river, then with Li t tle TN river to Lenoir City , 

follow Lenoir City east & north line to Town Creek Rd., f ollow Town 

Creek rd. to Shaw Ferry Rd., follow Shaw Ferry Rd. to Highway US 11 , 

t hen follmv Highway US 1 1 to Knox Co . Line. 

s district 

Begin a t Highway 70 &11 , r un with Knox Co. line to Clinch River , f o llow 

Clinch river to Roane Co . l ine , fol l ow Roane Co. line to TN river , 

follow '!'N river to Lenoir City , follow Lenoir Citv line to Town Creek 

Pd. , follow Town Creek R<l . , to Shaw Ferry Rd, Shav1 Ferr? Rd. to US High,·:ay 

11, follow Highway 11 to Knox Co. line , 



- - -
RESOLUTION NO . ;2 7- 7 X 

WHEREAS, the Community Development Act of 1977, 
administered by the Department of Housing and Urban Development 
provides 100 percent grant funds to address the problems of low 
and moderate income areas , and 

' WHEREAS , the County of Loudon has well documented the 
need to address such problems and has insufficient funds to 
adequately provide the resources to resolve the problems , 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Quarterly Court of 
Loudon County, Tennessee that authorization be granted to file 
a pre-application to the Department of Housing and Urban Development 
for a Community Development Block Grant in accordance with all 
applicable rules and regulations governing the program, and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the Quarterly Court of Loudon 
County, Tennessee that the County Judge is hereby authorized 
to sign all necessary assurances and application forms and to 
schedule the public hearings as required by law in order to 
afford the public an opportunity to participate in the community 
development program, and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the Quarterly Court of 
Loudon County, Tennessee that the firm of John Coleman Hayes , Jr. 
and Associates, Consulting Engineers and Planners be requested 
to prepare the CDBG pre-application and other forms as required 
for submission to the Department of Housing and Urban Development , 
and upon notice from H. U.D. to prepare a final application for 
consideration and approval, 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED that this resolution shall take 
effect immedi?tely, the public welfare requiring it. 

c-2- 6-?F 

'-<.::::::> ' At test: l c>·l:_-<-/ ~ 
County Court Clerk 


