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N/l.Tlflil/lL HISTOP.IC 
L/l. ~JDMARK DEDICATION 

DI s cuss I<Hl OF PEPsnNAL 
PROPERTY, TA X ON 
INDUSTRIES g BUSINESSES 

rLMHIING COMrlISSIOM PEPOP.T 

- -
QUARTERL y cot.mTY COURT ti 0 V E !18 E R 1 , 1 9 7 6 

Be it rene~bered that the Quarte rly County 
Court of Louden met on Monday, r~over:iber l, 1976 at 
9 : O O a . rr:. Th e H o:·n crab 1 e l4 i 11 i am H . Russel 1 , 
County Judae,presidin~ and Mrs. Addie Ruth Clarke, 
O e put y Cl erk of Sa i d Court \·!a s present ; ~J ii ere upon , 
Chief Deputy Sheriff Luke Bright opened the Court, 
led the pledge of Alleqiance to the Flag, and 
introduced the Peverend Bill Jackson, Pastor of 
the Eatonwood Church of God, who gave the invocatic 

The following Squires were present: 

J . ,J. Blair 
I. O. Conner 
P.. P. Hamil ten 
J. G. Hudson 
James Hartsook 

Roy Bledsoe 
Curtis Willir.tms 
Bovd Duckworth 
Terry G. Vann 

!!rs. Addie Ruth Clarke, Deputy Clerk of 
Said Court read the minutes of the October 4 , 1976 
~eeting and u~on motion of Squire Blair and 
second by Squi r e Williams the minutes ~ere approved 
as read. 

The Court recoqnized those people in the 
audience who wished to ~ake statements to the ·Court 

The first person seeking recognition was 
Mrs. Fat Viars of the Loud on Women ' s Club. She 
invited the County Court and Judge Russel l to 
ceremonies on Nove~ber 6, 197f at 10:00 a.m. at 
the Courthouse at which the Loudon Women's Club 
wi ll dedicate a marker signifyin? the Loudon County 
Courthouse as a National Historic Landmark. 

The Court then recognized Mr. Ji~ Yokum 
of Greenback Industries who requested information 
copcernin9 property taxes assessed a~ainst Green­
back Industfies which had not been collected for 
the past years. Mr. Yokum sited several reasons 
as to why the tax would hurt Greenback Industries, 
including a lack of ~oney to reinvest i n the 
company. The Court called on Tax Assessor, Emmett 
Carter to exolain the tax. Mr. Carter inf6rmed the 
Court that the State was now requiring the tax to 
be collected and that it was being done for a11 
induStties in the County. 

Mr. Steve 
Plannina Office was 
Planning Comm tfs ion 
as Exhibit . 
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Campbell of the Tennessee State 
recoqnized to give the County 
report and it is attached heret 

PJl.GE l 

;a 
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P.E7.0i! U!S P.F0UEST 

REZONING REQUEST 

REZONING PEQUEST 

HARBOR POINT ROAD 
ACCPETANCE P.EQUEST 

BUI LDitlG COtlMISSIONER 
P.EPOR T 

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT 
REPORT 

- -
I t v• a s then moved the Sq u i re B 1 a i r a n d 

secon ded by Squire Duckworth that the rezoning 
renuest of a F'orticn of rarcel f-0 and 6-1, Tax 
Map ~2. fro r.: .t1-l J\.griculture to R-1, Suburban 
P.esidential; Property located on State Route 72 
in the 4th Civil District a nd owned by J. B. 
Whaley be pranted and the vote was unanimous to 
ap;:irove. ~-< ..;t,-.-/ ). 'f - 7 (p 

Squire Hamilton ~oved and was seconded 
by Sauire Hudson that rezoning reauest for a 
pnrtion of Parcel 6, Tax Map 3, from .A.-1 Agr icul ture 
to C-2 General Cornr.iercial; Prooerty located on 
State Poute 95 and Jones Road in the 5th Civil 
District and owned by Frank Halco~b be approved 
and the vote was unanimous : to aporove . 

'JC~ .::z .. - ;l. -s-- 7 I:. . 

It was then moved by Squire Conner and 
seconded by Squire Vann that rezonin9 request 
for Parce1 7, Tax Map 18, from A-2, Rural Residential 
to C-2, General Com~erc\al; Property l ocated on 
M?.rte l Road in the 2nd Civil District and c\.med 
by Geor9e Sarten be approved. Mr. Sarten was 
present to explain his request, after some discussion 
the vote was as follows: 

AYE : 

Blair 
Conner 
Vann 
Hartsook 

NAY: 

Bledsoe 
Duckworth 
Williams 
Hudson 
Hamilton 

Squire Hartsook moved and was seconded 
by Squire Blair to accept the roads in the Point 
Harbor Subdivision as pub l ic roads. The vote was 
a 1 1 .aye s \·t i ·th th e ex c e p t i o n of S q ti i re Va n n 
who passed. ·The roads · were accepted. 

The Court then recognized Building 
Commissioner, Jack Henry who gave his monthly 
reoort. Mr. Henrv collected $1, 168 for 24 
ne~ permits and a~ded $462,000 to the tax rolls . 

The Court then r ecogn ized Road Commissioner 
I r k M i 1 l s a p s \•/ :1 o d i s c u s s e d w h a t h a s b e e n d o n e a b o u t 
the road in the Piney Community which the Court had 
requested action on in its October f.1eeting. Mr. · 
Millsaps stated that he and Squire Blair had looked 
at the road and determined that the road was i n 
good enough condition for the bus to pass. 
Board of Education member , Ted Randolph then 
informed the Court that the problem had been resolved 
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PURCH ASING CO MMI TTEE 
P.E POP.T 

LOU DO N COUN TY MEtlORIAL 
HO SPITAL REPO RT 

ELECTION OF BEE 
INSPECTOR 

_O UDOM COUNTY PART-
£ CI PAT! ON IN EMS Cb~OP 

~ CCEPTANC E OF TASS 
~ ESOLUTI O n 

~ IXIE LE E UTILITY 
HSTRICT FOR COOPERATION 
iRANT 

PPO I NTME NT OF C O U~TY 
OU RT CHJl.PLAIN 

- - --~--------- - - - -

I II is i ne 
rl 

Squire R. P. Hamilton was recognized 
and qave the Purcha s inq Co r.trr.it '{je Report \·1hich 
is att ached hereto as Exhibit . 

Squire Curtis Williams was then recognized 
to give the Loudon County Me morial Hospital Report . 
He informed the Court · that the Hospital Board had 
elected officers, and then requested the adoption 
of the new hospital bylaws. It was moved by .Squire 
Willi a~s and seconded by Squire Blair to adopt the 
hos~tal bylaws wth the changes as presented and 
the vote \'ias Ln.a·nimous for adopt~n. These bylaws 
are ~tached hereto as Exhibit ~ • 

Squire Hamilton was recognized by the Loudo 
County Court and nominated Mr. Dewey Range for Loudon 
County Bee Inspector. He then moved that Mr. Range 
be elected. Squire Vann seconded and the vote 
was una ni mous for Mr. Range . 

It ~·Jas then · moved by Squi re Bl air and 
seconded by Squire Willia~s that Loudon Coijnty 
cont ibu te $1 ,000.00 to the Emergency Medical Systems 
CO-OP contingent upon a majority of th e other 16 
counties also contribute donati'n9 . The vote was 
unanimous. 

Squire Hudson ~oved and was seconded by 
Squire Williams to adopt the TASS resolutions 
allowing TASS to borrow mo ney to cove r expenses and 
other items until the grant money arrived. The vote 
w a s u n a n i mo u s f o r a pp r o v a 1 o f th t s re s o 1 u t i c n . \·1 h i c h A\ 
i s a t tac he d he re to a s Res o 1 u t i on No ;<_ rb- Zt- Ex hi bi t_/lj../_ 

T~e Court then recognized.Mr. Jack Buchanan 
repres enting t he Dixie Le e Utilities Di st rict, 
requested that Loudon Co~nty cooperate with Dixie 
Lee U.tilities · District grant applicat i on by ag r eeing 
to be .the grant applicant. He assured the Court. 
th a t t h e re "' a s n o f i n a n c i a 1 a s s i s ta n t n e e de d a n d · 
that Dixie Lee Utilities would hand le a ll the 
details. Squire Hartsook ~oved and was seconded by 
Squire Conner that Loudon County cooperate with the 
Dixie Lee Utilites District on their grant request . 
The vote was unanimous for this. 

The County Judge then asked the Court t6 
appoint a pe rmanent County Court Chaplain who would 
serve regularly at County Court meet in g and various 
functions. It was moved bv Hamilton and seco nded 
by Hilliams that the County Judge appoint a Chaplain. 
The vote was unanimous for appointment of a Chaplain. 
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ELECTION OF ~OTARIES 
PUBLIC 

ADJOUR~·lMENT 

- -
Squire Blair moved and was seconded by 

Squire Hartsook to elect the follm·ling tlotaries 
Public : nary 0 . Hartsell and Charles P.. Wil son . 

--------------------------- -- --------
There being no further business, the Court 

adjourned . 

Edward Alexander 
COUN TY COURT CLERK 

NfJVEMBER 1 , 1976 

~J 1 i a rr. H . R u s s e 1 
COUNTY JUDGE 

PAGE 4 
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TO: Judge William H. Russell anct Members of the Loudon 
County Quarterly Court 

FROM: Steve C~_mpbell, Staff Planner 

DATE: November 1, 1976 

SUBJECT: LOUDON COUNTY REGIONAL PLANNING COMMISSION- GENERAL 
REPORT-OCTOBER MEETING 

The planning commission met in regular session on 
October 21, 1976~ and considered the following items: 

1. Recommended the rezoning of a portion of parcel 
17-3, Tax Mnp 53 from R-1, Suburban Residential 
to C-2, General Commercial. The property is 
located on U.S. 11 near the SR72 intersection in 
the 1st Civil District and is owned by Tom Williams. 
A public hearing to consider this request has been 
called for the December county court meeting. 

2. Recommended the rezoning of parcel 28, Tax Mnp 43, 
from A-2 , Rural Residential to C-2, Genernl Com­
mercial. The property is located on SR72 in the 
1st Civil District and is owned by Ma rgie Stooks­
bury. A public hearing to consider this request 
has been c a lled for the December county court 
meeting. 

3. Recommended the rezoning of a portion of parcel 80, 
... Tax Map 12, from R-1, Suburban Residential to M-1, 

General Industrial. The property is located on 
U.S. 70 ~long I-75 in the 5th Civil District and 
owned by John Cardwell. The proposed rezoning is 
consistent with the r evised land use plan and the 
industrial development study currently being pre­
pared . A public hearing to consider the request 
will be held at the Decembe r county court meeting. 

4. Heard staff reports concerning the Industrial 
Development Study, TVA road adjustments, the Muddy 
Creek Road project and the issuance of building 
permits. 
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S. Voted unanimously t o endorse an application by the 
Loudon County Soil Conservation District for Public 
Works Act monies for soil stabilization projects 
throughout the county and for the development of a 
park and nature study area at the old Air Force 
Rest Camp on Fort Loudoun Lake. 

6. Discussed the possibility of an application for a 
sanitary landfill site by the City of Knoxville to 
be located in the 5th Civil District near the Knox­
Loudon County line. It was noted that the site is 
being evaluated at present and that a feasibility 
report would be finished soon. If the report is 
positive and if Knoxville makes a request for 
approval of the site, then the planning commission 
might consider the request as early as November 
18th. Under the Zoning Resolution the planning 
commission has the flexi6i1ity to approve or dis­
approve the proposed landfill operation. 

SC/ks 
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RESOLUTION NO. ;l l/- 7 ~· 

A RESOLUTION JLMENDING THE ZONING 
MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY, TENNESSEE, 
PURSUANT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 
13-405 OF THE TENNESSEE CODE · 
ANNOTATED, TO REZONE A PORTION OF 
PARCELS 6-0 i\ND 6-1, Tl\){ MAP 42, 
FROM A-1, AGRICULTURE TO R-1, SU­
BURBAN RESIDENTIAL 

-

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarte rly Court, in acc0rdance 
with Chnpter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, 
boundary, area, or any regulation of or within any district 
or districts, or any other provision of any zoning resolution, 
and 

W,H~REAS" 
ha~ fo!'Warded 
the Zonin · · Ma 

~,m.~9on Gow.itY R~gional. Planning Commission 
reco;m.mend~tions r?gar.ding the amendment of 
Loudon· bo'unt . Tennessee, anq thG necessary 

public ~ ... · '·· ·, 19:~ ,.:~ . ' .. ~-e . .";:·'· :-· .. -~-··-·· 
. : , '. 

NOW . THEREFORE, BE IT ·RESOLVED by .the Loudon Co~~M 
Quarterly Court that ' the Zoning Map of Loudon CoqritX, ~ennessee~ 
be amended as follows: · · .. --··-,..--·- · 

•• 

.J:. :That a portion of parcels 6- :o and 6-1, 
'· · '' '· .Tax Map 42, said property located in 

the 4th Civil District on SR72, be re­
zoned from n-1, Agriculture to R-1, 
Suburban Residential. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall take 
effect immediately, the public welfare requiring it. 

Date: '{\~ . .. \ 1 ~C{ l fo 
. \ 
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RESOLUTION NO. .J C- J (:, 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING 
MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY, TENNESSEE , 
PURSUANT TO CHAPTER FOUR, SECTION 
13-405 OF THE TENNESSEE CODE 
t.NNOTATED, TO REZONE A PORTION OF 
PARCEL 6, TAX Ml\P 3, FROM A- 1, 
AGRICULTURE TO C- 2, GENERAL COM­
MERCI AL 

-

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Quarterly Court, in accord­
ance with Chapter Four, Section 13-405 of the Tennessee Code 
Annotated, may from time t o time, amend the nuinber, shape, 
boundary, area, or any r egulat i on of or within any district 
or districts, or any other provision of any zoning resolution , 
and 

WHEREAS, the 
has forwarded its 
the Zonin Ma o f 
public hearing ca 

Loudon County Regiona l Planning Commission 
recommendations 'regarding the amendment of 
Loudon Count Tennessee , and the necessary 

' 
NOW THEREFORE , BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County 

Quarterly Court that the Zoning Map of Loudon County, 
Tennessee, be amended as follows: 

I. That a porti on o f parcel 6, Tax Map 3, 
said property l ocated on SR95 at Jones 
Ro?-d in the 5th Civil District, be re­
zoned from A-1, Agriculture t o C-2, 
General Comme rcial. 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this resolution shall take 
effect immediate ly, the public welfare requiring it. 

~~udge 
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MINUTES-- LOUDON COUNTY PURCHASING COl-lMITTEE October 1976 

The Loudon County Purchasing Committee met October and October 26, 

1976, in the office of the Purchasing Department to open and award the 

following bids: 

DOOR AND WINDOWS for Building Trades Class , Bid awarded to Carter 

Lumber Company of Loudon . 

Bid 

bid 

Carter Lumber Company, Loudon 
P. S. Scales Lur.iber Co . , Maryville 
J. W. Wilburn Hardware, Lenoir City 
Pedigo L~~ber Company 
Seiler Brothers, Inc. 
Lenoir Builders Supply 
Schaad L~~ber Company 
Witt Lumber Company 

1,078.67 
1,073.90 
1,154.46 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

SHOWER STALL, PLUMBING & ELEC. SUPPLIES, Bldg. Trades Class. 

awarded to Modern Supply Company of Knoxville this being the only 

received. Modern Supply Company 51,323.94 
J. w. Wilburn Hdwe. No Bid 
Lenoir Builders Supply No Bid 
Carter Lumber Company No Bid 
Crane Supply No Bid 
Jerry's Wholesale No Bid 

TRUCK 2'h to 3 TON: Bid awarded to East Tennessee Trucks, of 

K..'1.oxville. East Tennessee Trucks, 
Volunteer Ford, 
Curtis- Tipton Ford 

7,74o.24 

Dean Simp~on Olds· 
Miller Motor Company 
Beaty Chevrolet Company 
Reeder Chevrolet, Inc. 
Hall Motor Company 
Jim White Chevrolet 

11,350.58 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

BRICK for Building Trades Class: Bid awarded to Carter Lumber 

Company of Loudon as low bidder. Carter Lumber Company $1,215.87 
J. W. Wilburn Hdwe. 1,858.80 
General Shale 1,737.55 
Knoxville Brick Company 1,235.65 



BYLAWS OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

LOUDON COUNTY MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 

WHEREAS, Loudon County Memorial Hospital is a non-profit 

governmental hospital organized by Loudon County under its ~uthority as 

a political subdivision of the State of Tennessee; and 
\ 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the hospital is to serve as a center 

for hea 1th care for the people of Loudon County, and to -pr;:ovi de a means 
\ 

of prov iding good patient care, and for providing for medical education 

and research; and 

WHEREAS, it is necessary to provide for the orderly and 

reasonable organization and operation of the hospital , 

THEREFORE, THE Loudon County Quarterly Court has duly adooted 

these bylaws : 

ARTICLE I 

ESTABLISHMENT OF HOSP ITAL BOARD 

There is hereby created and established in Loudon County , Tennes see , 

a Board of Trustees to have full charge of the operation and maintenance 

of the Loudon County Memorial Hospital in Loudon County, Tenneessee. 

ARTICLE. II 

PURPOSES AND AUTHOR ITY OF BOARD 

Section 1: The Board Of Trustees shall have and be vested 

with full authority and responsibility for the operation, management, 

conduct and control of the business and affairs of the Loudon County 

Mer.iorial Hospital (except as may be otherwise indicated herein or by 

applicabl e l aw) which shall include the following: 

a. Determine the policies of the hospital, with relation to 

the patients therei n and to community needs. 

b. Provide equipment, f aciliti es and personnel consistent 

wi~~ the needs of the patients of said hospital, and within the budget 

needs authorized by the Quarterly Court of Loudon County. 

Date approved by Loudon County 

Quarterly Court: 
~~~~~~~~ 



- - -
c. See that professional standards are maintained in the care 

of the s ick. 

d. Provide adequate finances by sufficient income and by 

enforcing business-like control of expenditures. 

e. Provide for the safe administration of funds entrusted to 

said hospital. 

f. Keep adequate records of the hospital finances and activities. 

g. Surround the patients within said hospital with good, 

r easonab le care and protection, thereby fulfilling the,'rnoral and legal 
\ 

responsibility of the hospital, to include the exercising of proper care 

and judgment in the selection ~fa qualified administrator and the 

medical , nurs ing, techn ical and other personnel and professional needs 

of said nospital. 

Section 2: The authority and responsibility of the Board of 

Trustees shall include but not be limited to the establis.hment, oromulgation 

and enforcemen~ of rules, regulations and policies of the hospital, the 

upkeep, maintenance and protection of all property belonging to the 

hospital, and the administration of the fisca l and other necessary 

affairs of the hospital within the provisions of State l aw, and the 

execution of all contracts, agreements and other instruments unless 

otherwise specified or required by State and/or Federal laws and 

regulations. 

ARTICLE I I I 

APPOINTM[NT AND ORGANIZATION OF BOARD 

Sect ion 1: Said Board of Trustees shall be composed of nine 

(9) in number , each elected or appointed by the Loudon County Quarterly 

Court who shall serve without compensation, except an expense allowance 

for each board meet ing attended, not to exceed $25 . 00 per meet ing and 

shall be authorized any additi ona l personal expenses as authorized by 

the Board for travel outside the County . No person who receives a full 

time regular salary from Loudon County or one of its departments may 

receive the "per meeting" expense allowance. 

-2-
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Section 2: Th e regular term of each elected member wi ll be 

three years; and the election (or re-election) of new membe r s shall be 

in Sept. of each yea r~ the first year being Sept. l , 1977, with t he 

e l ected new members to take office October l, the members of the board 

however , to serve until th e ir successors are elected . 

Section 3: Board members will be apport ioned so that the 

r esi ueRces of members are from the same districts and in the same 

proportion as the make -up of membership on the Quarterly Court unless 

agreed otherwise by the Justi ce of the Peace from a specific district. 

Section 4 : The termso f th e members are 11 staggered 11 in three 
\ 

panels, with a new panel of three to be elected each year. For the 

first election Panel I will only se rv e one year, ' Rane l II will serve twc 
\ 

years , and Panel III will serve three years, but members of all panels 

wi ll subsequently serve three yea r terms. 

Panel I 

Roy Bl edsoe District 1 (A) 
Johnny Youn gD istrict ? (A) 
Mrs . Elan District 2 (B) 

Section 5: 

Pan el II Panel III 

B . D u c k v1 o r t h D i s t r i c t l ( B ) V a . S i mp s o n D i s t r i c t 5 
Gene Hamby District 2 (C) Bliss KizerDistrict 3 
C. Williams District 2 (D) R. Lee Districtl( 

It is spec ifi cally provided that no more than one 

third of the members may be Quarterly court Members (Justices of the 

Peace) and no more than one-third may by physicians. Nom inations of 

the members for election f~ the Board will co me fr om the Justices from 

the appropria te section of the County. The term of any Justice of the 

Peace on the Board of Trustees is co-terminus with his office as 

Justice of the Peace . 

Section· 6 : The County Jud qe and the Chief of Staff of the 

hospital are ex-officio membe rs of the Board without vote . 

Sect ion 7: A truste e whose term has e xpired shall continue 

to serve unti l hi s successor shal l hav e been elected in the mapner 

he r e in provided. In the event of death or resignation of a board 

· member prior to the expiration of hi s term, his successo r shall be 

elected by the Quarter ly Court of Loudon County, TN, for the unexpired 

term . Any incu~bent trustee shall be eligible for re-electioo. 

-3-
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ARTICLI: ~I 

OFFIC£.R~ 

Section 1 : At the first meet ~ ~g of the Board of Trust2~s . t r~ 

B.:iard shall elect from its member ship a chairman . v i ce-chairman, a ~1d a 

S ·~cretary, each of said off i cer s t o ser ve a 0ne-year term and to be 

e l igibl:: for r e-election . . C. r.y e l ected 1.; 1· oointed officer may be 

r1.:moved at any time by the Boa rd . J\ vacJncy in any offi ce may be f i - - - . 

by the Board for the unexp i red pr,n 1 _ . 1f ~ :-.e ::»··-, 

Secti on 2: DUTil:S OF THE OF~ -~: - _ 

a. (;hairman : The chai :m.;·~ ->ha ll pres1ae c _ \ ·22:in·JS 
? ":he board. he shal1 be an ex-o-r·f i:: 1 ~ .. ..: ... ::>E- ... cf a li 

board and management cornmi ttes. exc~o . : tne n~mi n.-; ~ i ng 
comrni tt~e, and ex-officio r.ember \'Ii t hou -:: v~te o: 
all com~ittees or organizations that are asscc;:ted 
or aff i liated with the hos pital. µe sha11 a!so 
pe:--form a il duties inc i:Jent to the off:.~- ".1' ::hcirm.:in 
and sLch otner duties dS ~dY be prescri DtO !he b~~r j 
+:·c:: .. ;, i ·;ie to time. 

: ' .... :::s 
" 

b. ~ice-C~a i rn~n : The vice- c hairman rnav p~r· 
as ma.\ :~e ,-: > ..•. vd to him bv ": i..:, tin,;, · . ..; or 

' l 

I n th c .,. .. :. : '·, · c !1 e c: h :? i ,. .. · :1 ~ , • i , . - i- ,· c . .. , ·: .. 1 · · 

event o , • · 1 1 r.v , : nabi 1 i t_y , : .. · ·· - i::o 
· t r,e vice·· \ n;;~1. ,.·,1 i i fJerfonn the a.; t ~ .... . ~ . .. 
chairma n . 1,1i t h the fu ll po1t1ers of , and sv·~F _:- -;- ~­
the r . :s ~r'ictions upo n ti":t: chairr.:u;i. 

c. Secreta r v : Th2 secretary shall pro\ id~ for the ke~~i"; 
or minutes of all r:.eeti ngs of the boc.. ·d ~ may gi ve C" 
ca~se to be given appro?riate notices in accordance 
\-Ji th these bylaws or cs required by 1 aw ; and sha 11 
pe:form all du~i es incident to the: :a~ -c and such 
o:he r du ti es as rra_y be ass i gr.ec fr _ · r to t ime by 
tne chai~an cf t he -board. 

Section 3: In ~ ~ e event of the abse~c~ 0r inabil~ty of the 

Jd~·~i : ~rator to si gn check ~ . th~ chair~~ 1 of t he Bo~rd of Trustees has 

t~'e ~;.;thori ty to do so i n cci,..junc ti on wi tr. the Cut: ~ ; ._:; ,..: .:ge, or the 

3Jara may authori ze the as s i stant ad~i n is trator or other app ropr ia:2 

,cP. TICL E V 

Se: : ic ~ l: The Boa rj ~f Trusteew 

-.~ .:.: ~-. ]~, t he reg ula r cay anci ti m. ::. :; 
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Section 2: Special meet in gs of the Board may be called by 

the chairMan, or by any three membe rs, with five days' written notice 

to th e r emainder of the Board membe rs. 

Section 3: Voting. 

a. A majo rity of the voting membe rs of the Board shall 

constitue a quorum, and the affirmative vote of a majority of the 

membership shall be required for the Board to act. 

b. The chairman vot es only to break a tie vote or when such 

vote would make a clear majority. 

Section 4: Due 11 public notic e" of 'all meetings of the Board 

shall be ~iven in accordance with State law. "' , 

ARTICLE VI 

HOSPITAL ADMINIST RATION 

Section l: The Board of Trustees shall have authority to 

employ and appoint a chief executive officer or hospital administrator 

for sajd-hospital who shall hold office at the pleasure of the Board. 

The administrator shall not be a member of the Board of Trustees. He 

shall be a qualified person, and experienced in hospital administration, 

whose duties and responsibilities shall be as herein designated and as 

shall be determined and prescribed by the Board of Trustees. 

Section 2: The administrator emp loyed by the Board shall have 

the following duties. 

a. Shall : be the chief executive officer of the hospital, 

subject to the bylaws, rules and regulations adopted by the Board, and 

sh al 1 be under the _ control and direction · of the Board of Trustees. 

b. Shall, \'Jith the consent of the Board of Trustees, equip 

the hosptial with all necessary furniture,appliances, fixtures, equip­

ment and needed facilities for the care and treatment of patients and 

·for theuse of the officers and employees thereof. 

c. Shall be the 11 purchasing agent " or general agent for the 

hospital as to all contracts, and shall work with the County purcha~ing 

agent in purchasing all necess a ry supplies a nd equipment , subject to 

all county purchasing rules, la ws, and regulattons. 

-5-
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d. Shall have genera l supervision and control of the records, 

accounts and bills of the hospital, and all internal affa irs , and shall 

maintain discipline therein and shall enfor ce compl i ance with and al l 

obediance to all rules, bylaws and regulations adopted by the Board of 

Trustees and/or required by Federal, State and local laws, for the 

government, discipline and management of said hospital, and the employees 

and patients t hereof . 

e. Shall ma ke such f urther rul es , regulations and orders as 
... 

' 
he may deem necessary, not incons i stent with l aw or the r J\es and regu-

lations of the Board of Trustees. 

f. Shall, under such rules and regulations and within the 

limits and in the manner prescribed by the Board of Trustees and with 

. the advice and consent of said Trustees , employ such necessary personnel, 

including nurses aides, supervisors, technicians and such other technical 

and general employees as shall be necessary or proper for the effici ent 

performance of .the business of_ the hospital, describe their duties and 

discharge such employees at his discretion for good _cause, in keeping 

wi th good efficient and honest administration. 

g. Shall collect, or cause to be collected, and receive all 

monies due the hospital; and such monies , when col l ected, shall be ~ 

deposited daily when possible, in the bank to the account of the County 

Trustee on r eceivable warrants in the same form as received; shall keep 

an accurate account of the same; shall pay the expenses of the operation 

of the hospital, from funds available, by County warrants drawn on the 

County .trustee, \vith the exception that a speci al payroll banking account 

may be established , such warrants to be countersigned by the County 

Judge. A complete report of the operations of the hospital shall be 

presented by the administrator to the monthly meetings of the Board of 

Trustees. 

h. Before entering upon the discharge of his duties, the 

administrator sha ll give a bond in such sum as the Board of Trustees may 
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determine to secure the faithful performance of his duties, the cost of 

the same to be included in the expense of the operation of the hospital. 

i. Shall perform such other duties as the Board of Trustees 

may prescribe. 

j . Provide liason among the Board, the medical staff , and the 

departments of the hospital . 

k. Provide the hospital ' s professional staff with the admin­

istrative support and personnel reasonably required to carry out their 

review and evaluation activities. 
\ 

1. 
\ 

Organize the administrative functions~of the hospital , 

delegate duties, and establi sh formal means of accountability on the 

part of subordinates. 

m. Be responsibl e, except as otherwise provided, for se-

lecting, employing, controlling, and discharging employees, and for 

developing and maintaini ng personnel policies and practices . 

n. Establ ish such hospital administrative departments as are 

necessary, provide for departmental and interdepartmental meetings, and 

attend or be represented at such meetings. 

o .. Be responsibl e for the maintenance and insurance of all 

physical properties . 

p. Perform any other duty within the express or implicit 

terms of his duties that may be necessary for the . best interest of the 

hospital , 

ARTICLE VII 

MEDICAL STAFF ORGANIZATION 

Section 1: The Board shall cause to be created a medical 

! 

staff organization, whose membership shall be comprised of all practitioners 

privileged to attend patients in the hospital. Membership in this 

medica l staff organizati on shall be a prerequisite to the exerc ise of 

clinical privileges in the hospital, except as otherwise specifically 

provided i n the medical staff bylaws. 
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Section 2: Delegation to the Medical Staff and Action by the 

Board . 

a. The Board shall delegate to the medical staff the re­

sponsibility and authority to investigate and eval uate all matters 

relating to medical staff membership status, clinical privileges and 

corrective action, and shall req~ire that the staff adopt and forward to 

it written recommendations thereon that will allow the board to take 

informed action. 

b. Final action on all such matters shall, be taken by the 

Board after considering the staff recommendations, provl~ed that the 

Board shall act in any event if the staff fails to adopt and submit any 

such recommendation within the time periods required by the medica l 

staff byla\vS.· · Such Board action without a staff recommendation shall be 

based on the same kind of documented investigation and evaluation of 

current abil fty, judgment, and character as is required for staff 

recommendations. 

Section 3: Terms and Conditi ons of Membership and Privileges. 

a. The terms and conditions of membership status on the 

medical staff, and of the exercise of clinical privileges, shall be as 

specified in the medical staff bylaviS. 

b. The procedure to be followed by the medical staff and the 

Board in acting on matters of membership status, cl i nical privileges, 

and corrective action shal l be specified in the medical staff bylaws. 

Section 4: Allied Health Professions (Paramedical Personnel) 

Al lied Health Professionals means an individual, other than a 

licensed physician, dentist or podiatrist , whose patient care activities 

require that his authority to perform specified pati ent care servi ces be 

processed through med i cal staff channels . 

Section 5: Chief of Staff or Medical Director (or President 

of the Staff). The Board shall appoint, from among the qualified nominees 

submitted by the medical staff, a chief of staff to serve as the chief 

medical officer of the corporation. The medical staff shal l have the 
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initial responsibility to recommend to the Board at l east three quali-

. 
fied nominees for the position. Such responsibility shall be exercised 

in good faith and in a reasonable, timely and responsible manner, re-

fleeting the interests of providing patient care of the generally 

recognized professional level of quality and efficiency. If the staff ' 

fails to so exercise. this responsibi lity, an·d after written notice from 

the Board to such effect including ~ reasonable period of time for 

response, the Board may proceed on its 01tm initiat'ive to appoint a chief 

of staff. The chief executive officer shal l also be consulted in the 

naming of a chief of staff. 
\ 

Section 6: Removal from office of the chief of staff or any 

other medico~administrative officer shall be accomplished as specified 

in the medical staff bylaws, but the removal or suspension of the 
officer-

cl inical privileges of a/member of the medical staff shal l automatically 

remove the officer from office and a new officer will be appointed as 

soon as possibl e under the procedures set forth in Section 5 of this 

article. 

Section 7: Medical Staff Adoption of Bylaws 

a. Basic Content and Purpose. The medical staff organization 

shall propose and adopt bylaws, rules and regulations for its internal 

governance which shal l be effective when approved by the Board. These 

bylaws shall create an effective administrative unit to discharge the 

functions and responsibilities assigned to the medical staff by the 

Board . The bylaws, rule~ and regulations shall state the purposes, 

functions and organization of the st~ff and shall set forth the policies 

by which the medical staff exercises and accounts for i ts delegated 

authority and responsibilities. 

b. Procedure. The medical staff shall have the initial 

responsibility to formulate, adopt and recommend to the Board staff 

bylav1s and amendments .thereto which shall be effective ~-1hen approved by 

the Board . If the staff fails to exercise th is responsibility iri good 
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ana t shall 

faith and in a reasonable, timely and responsible manner, and after 

written notice from the Board to such effect including a responsible 

period of time for response, the Board may resort to its own iniative in 

formulating or amending medical staff byla1'/s. In such event, staff 

recommendations and views shall be carefully considered by the Board 

during its deliberations and in its actions . 

Section 8: Professional Accountability to the Board. The 

medical staff and other health care·professionals providing patient care 

services shall conduct and be accountable to ·the Board ,for condu~ting 
\ 

activities that contribute to the preservation and jmprov~ment of the 

quality and efficiency of patient care provided in the hospital . These 

activities shal l inc lude: 

a. Delineation of clinical privileges for medical staff 

members commensurate with individual credentials and demonstrated 

ability and judgment and assignment of patient care responsibilities to 

other health care professionals consistent with individual qualification 

and demonstrated abi lity. 

b. Provision of continuing professional education, shaped 

primarily by the needs identified through the review and evaluation 

activities. 

c. Utilization review procedures based on patient-specific 

needs to provide for appropriate use of the hospital 1 s resources. 

d. Monitoring of patient care practices through the defined 

functions of the med ical staff, the other professional services, and the 

hospital administration. 

e. Retrospective review and evaluation of the quality of 

patient care through a valid and reliable patient care evaluation 

procedure. 

f. Such other measures as the Board may, after receiving and 

considering the advice of the medical staff, the other professional 

services and the hospital administration, deem necessary for .. the preser­

vation and improvement of the quality and efficiency of patient care. 

·' 
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g. Conduct specific review and evaluation activities to 

assess, preserve and improve the over-all qual ity and efficiency of 

patient care in the hospi tal. All such findings and recommendations of 

the medical staff shall be in writing, signed by the person responsible 

for conducting the review activities and supported and accompanied by 

documentation upon which the Board can take informed action. 

ARTICLE VIII 

STANDING BOARD COMMITTEES 
\ 

·' 

Section 1: The Board may have the following standing committees: 
11 Professional Relations 11

, "Evaluation and Nominating'• . "Finance". and 

"Joint Conference and Accreditation 11
• 

Section 2: Additional Board Committees. The Board, by 

resolut ion adopted by a majority of the trustees, may create from among 

its own voting membership one or more additional Board committees. The 

resolution creati ng any such additional Board committee shal l des i gnate: 

the members of the Boar d who are to serve as i ts voting members; the 

chairman of the committee; the authority o.f the Board v1hi ch the committee 

sha ll have when the Board is not in session and any limitations thereon; 

and the funct i ons the committee shal l discharge. 

Section 3: Creati on and Combination of Committees The 

·creation of the Board committees named in these bylaws is discretionary 

with the Board . I~ th~ Board determines that any one of such committees 

shou l d not exist , it shall assign the functions of such committee to a 

new or existing committee or to the Board acting as a committee of the 

whole. 

Section 4: Tenure. Each membe r of a Board committee, except 

the Professional Relations Commi ttee, shall hold office until the next 

annual el ection of trustees and unti l hi s successor as a member of such 

Board committee is elected, unless he shall sooner cease to be a trustee 

or shal l resign or be removed from the committee . 

Section 5: Meetings, Notice and Quorum. Meetings of a Board 

committee may be called by the chairman of the Board , the chairman of 
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the Board , the chairman of the cor.mittee , or a majority of the committee 's 

voting members . Each committee shal l meet as often as is necessary to 

perform its duties. Notice may be given at any time and in any manner 

reasonably designed to inform the members of the time and place of the 

meeting. However, for all Bpard committees which have two or more Board 

members as a part of the committee, due "public notice" of such meetings 
\ 

shall be given in accordance with State law. A majority of the voting 

members of the Board committee shal l constitute a quor~~ for the transaction 
\ 

of business at any meeting of such committee. Eacb Board committee 

sha l l keep minutes of its proceedi ngs and shall report periodical ly t o 

the Board . 

Section 6: Manner of Acting . The act of a majority of the 

members of a Board committee present at a meeting at which a quorum is 

present shal l be the act of the committee so meeting. No act taken at a 

meeting at wh i ch less than a quorum was present shal l be valid unless 

approved in writing by the absent members. Action may be taken without 

a meeting by a writing setting forth the action so taken signed by each 

member of the committee entitled to vote thereat. 

Section 7: Evaluation and Nominating Committee. 

a. Election and ComRosit ion. The Board , by r esolution adopted 

by a majority of the trustees , may create from among its own voting 

membership an evaluation and nominating (E&M) committee. If created, 

the E&N committee shall be composed of the chai rman of the Board and two 

or more additional trustees elected by the Board, one of whom shall be 

designated chai rman of the committee . 

b. Powers. The E&N committee shal l have the authority to 

recommend to the Board with respect to the i mpl ementation of the functions 

assigned to it. 

c . Function. The E&N committee shall : 

(1) Review the performance of the individual 
trustees and of the officers of the hospi tal. 
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(2) Review the performance, compensation and 

terms of employment of the chief executive 
officer and the performance of the chief of 
staff, and make recommendations to the Board. 

(3) Review the compos ition and services of Board 
committees and of the advisory board, if 
elected. 

(4) Recommend to the Board nominees for election 
as officers, members of Board committees, and 
members of the advisory board. 

Section 8: Finance Committee . 

a. Organ ization and duties: The finance committee shall be 

chaired by the chairman of the Board and shall include at least one 

representative each from the Board, the administrat ion, and the medical 

staff . This committee 's duties shall be to: 

(1 ) 

-( 2) 

(3) 

( 4) 

(5) 

Consider and recomme nd plans for securing 
capital and operating funds for the hospital. 

Review the financia l feasibility of hosnita1 _ 
projects, acts and undertakings r eferred to it 
by the Board and make r ecommendations thereon 
to the Board . 

Review the capital and annual operating budgets of 
the hospital. 

Review the monthly financial statements and appraise 
the h~spit?1 's operating perfor~ance. 

Make recommendati ons to the Board concerning the 
selection of a corporate auditor and conceini ng the 
general fiscal affa irs of the hospital. 

(6) Arrange an annual audit of the hos pital's 
fi.nanci al opera ti on and service~ by z.n independent 
firm experienced ln the financia l affairs of 
hospitals . 

(7) Receive. review and evaluate the findings and final -
reports of the auditors and, based thereon, make 
recommendations to the Board concerning the financial 
operation of, and services required by and provided . 
by , the hospital. 

(8) Perform such other duties related to fiscal 
matters as may be assigned to it by the Board 
of the_chairman. 
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Section 9: Joint Conference and Accreditation Committee. 

a. Composition. The joint conference and accreditation 

committee shall include at least two members of the professional re-

l ations committee and an equal number of members of the active medical 

staff, including the medical director. Any remaining medical staff 

members shall be appointed by the chairman of the Board with the advice 

of the chief of staff. The chief executive officer s hall be a member of 

the committee and its secretary. The chairmanship of the\committee 
\ 

shall be held by the chairman of the Board , or some .~ther member of the 

Board des ignated by him. 

b. Duties . The duties of t he joint conference committee 

shall be to: 

(1) Conduct i tself as a forum fo r the discussion of 
administrative and medical policies and procedures 
requiring agreement amo ng the board, medical staff 
and administration. 

(2) Oversee hospital compliance with the laws and 
regulations of f ederal, state and local govern­
mental agencies and wi th the standards, rules 
and regulations of the various accrediting and 
approval agencies, including the Joint Commission 
on Accr~ditation of Hospitals. . 

(3) Recefve , revi ew and r espond to . reports of disaster 
practice drills. 

(4) Consider, review , approve and periodica lly update 
plans for the hospitals, appropriate response to, 
and protection and care of patients and others at 
the time of interna l and external disasters; and 

(5) Assist in coordinating the hospital's disaster 
plans with those of other heal th care facilities 
and other agencies in the community. 

Section 10: Professional Relations Committee: a. The Board, by . 

resolution adopted by a majority of the trustees, may create from among 

its own voting membership, a professional relations committee, consisting 

of at least three trustees, one of \'/horn shall be designated as chairman 

of the committee . Each member of the committee shall serve as l ong as 

he remains a trustee, unless he sooner resigned or is removed from the 

committee . 
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b. Powers :: When the Board is not in session, the professional 

rel ations committee shal l have the authority to take action on behalf of 

the Board with respect to the speci fic functions assigned t o it, subject 

to any prior limitations imposed by statute or by the Board. 

c. Functions The professional r el at ions committee shall: 

( l ) 

(2) 

(3} 

. {_4) 

(5) 

Receive from the medical s.taff written recommen­
dations, and take action on staff applications 
for staff appointment, ~eappointment, staff 
category assignment, departmental affiliation, 
clinical privileges, and specified services and 
on correcti ve actions . 

...., 
Cooperate with and assist the ·medical staff and 
other health care professionals prov~ding 
patient care services in implementing systems 
of care delivered within the hospital and receive 
periodic r eports on the general f indings from the 
review and evaluation. 

Review the results and effectiveness of the 
review and eva luation activ iti es , eva luate 
changes that have been or should be made to 
im~rove the quality and effici ency of patient 
care within the hospita l, and take action as 
warranted by its findings . 

Recei ve medical staff r ecommendations, and recommend 
to the Board action on the adoption, amendment, 
or repeal of the bylaws, rules and regulations 
governini the medical staff. 

Perform such other duties concerning professional 
st.aff matters as may be assigned to it by the 
Board. 

AR TICL E IX 

ADVISORY COUNCIL 

Section l: Creati on of Advisory Counci l: The governing board 

may, at its option, create an advisory council to serve the hospital. If 

created, the members of this council shall be chosen and shall serve in 

the manner provided in these bylaws. 

Section 2: Election, Composition and Purpose .. The Board 

shall sel ect the advisory council from among residents in the com.~unity 

served by the hospita l and other individuals who have volunteered their 

par ticul ar expertise ar.d services to the hospi tal. They shall be selected 

to provide: 
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a. Direct liason with all major elements of 

the commun ity served . 

b. Expertise in their specialty area, along 
with knowledge of the hea l th care needs, 
attitudes, activiti es and interests in the 
community. 

c. Advice on recent trends in t he health care field 
particularly as such trends may affect the 
operations of the hospital and its relations hip 
to t he community. 

-

Section 3: Functions. The primary functions of members of 

the adv isory counci l are to serve as potential members ' of management 
\ 

committees and as individual advisors to the hospi tal's offi cers and 

other exectuives. Service on the adv isory counci l is also intended to 

familiarize community representatives and l eaders with the functionings 

of the hospital and the field of health care . 

ARTICLE X 

CONFLICT OF INTEREST 

Section l: No trustee with vote shall or may be interested in 

any work or any contract of the hospital, or be indirectly interested in 

any such contract. 

Sect ion 2: ·oua li_ty of Interest 

a. Any officer , key employee , or committee member having an 

interest i n a contract or other transaction presented to the Board of 

trustees or a committee thereof for authorization, approval , or ratifi­

cation shall make~ prompt, full, and frank disclosure of his interest 

to the Board or committee prior to its acting on such contract or 

transaction . Such disclosure shall include any relevant and material 

facts , known to such person, about the contract or transaction which 

migh~ reasonably be c~nstrued to be adverse to the hospital ' s interest. 

b. For the purposes of this Section, a person shall be deemed 

to have an "interest" in a contract or other transaction if he is the 

party (or one of the parties) contracting or dealing wjth the hospital, 

or is a director, t rustee or officer of, or has a significant financial 

or i nfluentia l interest in, the entity contracting or dealing with the 

hos pita 1. 
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ARTICLE XI 

AUDITS AND REPORTS 

-

The Board of trustees shall annually present to the Quarterly 

County Court of Loudon County, Tennessee, at the October term of said 

Court, a report setting forth the operation of said hospital for the 

previous year, both financial ly and otherwise, and shall quarterl y 

submit a financial summary of the operations of the hospital to the 
\ 

County Budget Committee. 

ARTICLE XII \ 

SUMMARY OF RESPONSIBILITY '"" 

The Board of Trustees shall have the general superintendence, 

management, and control of said hospital grounds, buildings, officers 

and employees thereof, of the patients therein and of all matters 

relating to the government, discipline, contracts and fiscal concerns 

thereof, and make such other bylaws, rules and r egulations as may be 

deemed by said Board necessary for the efficient and proper management 

and operation of said hospital, and for the carrying out of the purposes 

for which said hospital was established, in accordance with, and not in 

conflict with, the responsibility delegated herein, it being understood 

that the final responsibi lity and jurisdiction for the operation of the 

hospital derives from the Loudon County Quarterly Court. 
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RESOLUTI ON AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF 
NOT TO EXCEED $100,000. 00 IN CAPITAL 

OUTLAY NOTES OF LOUDON COUNTY , TENNESSEE, 
PROVIDING THE DETAILS THEREOF AND • '/ / 

AUTHORIZING THE SALE THEREOF J_ b - C(' 

WHERE.~. the Loudon County and Monroe County Quarterly Courts 

under the provisi ons of the local inter-governmental co-operation act 

each have formed boards of public utilities which have contracted together 

to form the Tellico Area Services System for the purpose of providing a 

public water system along the U. s. 411 "corridor" and surrounding areas 

in the two counties; and 

WHEREAS. construction grants and loans have been obtained by 

said counties and by the Tellico Area Services System, and t he construction 

of the system will be compl eted in several weeks, but the temporary 

borrowing of money for the purpose of paying necessary construction 

costs and expenses is necessary pending approval of the final payment of 

the grants already authorized Loudon and Monroe Counties; and 

WHERt~s, after final approval of the project the necessary 

federal grants will be available to completely 11qu1date the notes 

provided for herein; and 

WHEREAS, Tennessee Counties are authorized by Section 5·1031 

of the Tennessee Code Annotated to issue notes, for a period not to 

exceed three years from the date of issuance, for the purposes of constructing 

water systems, upon the approval of said issuance of notes by the State 

Director of Local Finance; and 

WHEREAS, it appears advantageous to Loudon County at this 

particular t1me to issue capital outlay notes to pay its part of the 

necessary construction costs and expenses 1n winding up said project, 

during the period of time the final payment of the aforementioned grants 

is pending, rather than to 1ssue bonds; and 

WHEREAS , Loudon County has no funds available in its treasury 

for said purposes , but authority exists under the provisions of Section 

5-1031 to 5-1038 of the Tennessee Code Annotated, as amended , for the 

issuance and sale of notes to provide the necessary funds therefor; 
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NOW, THEREFORE, be it resolved by the Quarterly County Court 

of Loudon County, Tennessee, as follows: 

Section l. For the purpose of providi ng funds 1n amounts not 

to exceed $100,000.00, for the purpose herein stated, and pursuant to 

authority granted by Section 5-1031 of the Tennessee Code Annotated, as 

amended, there shall be issued the negotiable notes of said county in 

principal amounts not to exceed $100,000.00. Said notes shall be designated 

"capital outlay notes", shall be dated from the date the notes are 

executed, and shall be in the denomination as shown on the face of each 

note, each to be numbered serially beginning with the number 1, and not 

to exceed $100,000.00 fn total. Safd note shall bear interest from the 

date thereof untf 1 paid at a rate not exceeding 5.4875 per cent per 

annum, and payable within a period of 180 days. Both principal and 

1nterest on said notes shall be payable in lawful money of the United 

States of America, at Sweetwater Valley Bank, Vonore, Tennessee. 

Section 2. Said note shall be signed by the County Judge, 

countersigned by the County Court Clerk, and sealed with the official 

seal of the County. 

Section 3. Sai d note shal l be fn substantially the following 

fonn, the omissions to be approximately completed when the note is dra\m 

or printed: 

Number 

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA 
STATE OF TENNESSEE 

COUNTY OF LOUDON 
CAPITAL OUTLAY NOTE 

--- --- -
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That the County of Loudon, in 

the S,tate of Tennessee, hereby acknowledges itself to owe, and for value 

received hereby promises to pay to bearer the sum of -----

--------- -thousand dollars ($ __________ ), 

on the day of , 1977, with interest 
~~~~~~~-~-

at the rate of per cent ( %) per annum from the date 

hereof until the principal amount shall have been fully paid, such 

interest being payable annually. Both principal hereof and interest 
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hereon are payable in lawful money of the United States of America at 

Vonore, Tennessee. For the prompt payment of this note, both principal 

and intarest at mat urity, and for the levy and col lection of sufficient 

taxes for that purpose, the full faith, credit and resources of said 

County of Loudon are irrevocable pledged. 

This note is one of an issue of notes not to exceed $100,000.00 

in total issued under authority of, and in full compliance with the 

Constitution and Statutes of Tennessee, including Section 5-1031 et seq. 

of the Tennessee Code Annotated, as amende<.f, and under authority of a 

resolution duly adopted by the Quarterly Court of said county on _ 

__ ~_lo_v_e_· m_.,b_e_r_l_,_1_9_7_6_. ___ , for the purposes of providing funds for 

the purposes hereinabove stated. It 1s hereby certified, recited and 

declared that all acts, condf t ions and things required to be done, exist 

and be performed, precedent to and in t he issuance of this note in order 

to make this note a legal, valid and binding obligation of Loudon County 

have been done, exist and be perfonned 1n regular and due time, form and 

manner as required by law, and that this note and the issue of whf ch it 

is a part does not exceed any constitional or statutory limitation. 

Section 5-1039 provides that neither the prfncfpal nor the 

interest of capital outlay notes issued pursuant to the provisions of 

Section 5-1031 to 5-1039, inclusive, of the Tennessee Code Annotated, as 

amended, shall be taxed by the State of Tennessee or by any county or 

muntcfpaltty therein. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the County of Loudon, by its Quarterly 

Court, has caused this note to be signed by its County Judge, countersigned 

by tts County Court Clerk and sealed with the official seal of the 

county, all as of the 1 S t d f Movember 1976 · ay o -------• • 

COUNTY JUDGE 
Countersigned: 
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Section 4. For the purpose of providing funds with which to 

pay interest accruing on said notes and the principal thereof at maturity, 

there shall be levied upon all taxable property in said Loudon County, 

1n addition to all other taxes, a direct annual tax for each of the 

years while said note 1s outstanding, in amounts suff1c1ent for that 

purpose. Principal or interest coming due at any time when there shall 

be insufficient funds on hand to pay the same shall be promptly paid 

when due from the general fund or other available funds of sa1d Loudon 

County, and reimbursement shall be made to such fund or funds in the 

amount of the sums thus advanced when taxes provided for that purpose 

shall have been collected. 

I Section 5. Said notes shall be sold by the County Judge for 

'I not less than par and accrued interest, if any, to date of delivery. 
I 

The act1on of the County Judge 1n consumatf ng such sale and f1xfng the 

interest rate shall be conclusive and no further action shall be necessary 

on the part of this Court. 

Section 6. The proceeds of said notes shall be turned over to 

the County Trustee of Loudon County and shall be paid out to, or for the 

benefit of, the Tellico Area Services System, for the purposes and 

distributed in the manner required by law and this resolution. 

Section 7. All orders or resolutions in conflict hgrewfth be 

and the same are hereby repealed insofar as such conflict exists. and 

this resolution shall become effective 11'1111edfately upon its passage. 

PASSED and approved th1s __ 1 _s_t __ day of __ N_o_v_e_m_b_e_r __ , 

\ l 976. 

I 
!Attest: 

COUNTY JUDGE 

County Court Clerk 
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