
LoCAdovi CoCAVJ-f\1 CoWHIV\issiovi Work:sVlop 

G>:00 pvn 

1) Covnvne,vits by \N\e,vnbers of tVJe, G,eviero1I -Pv1blic 

2.) Codes £viforcevnevit Pi rector - Jivn Je,vikivis 

A. A 12.tSOLLlTION TO -APO-PTT-Ht 2.016 INTE12.N-ATIOIN-AL '0LlILPING, CD"Dt 

(I'Bt), TVJe, 2.016 INT82.N-ATION-AL 12.ESIPENTI-AL CD-Pt (I\2.t), TVJe, 2.01B 

INT82.N-ATION-AL \N\£C,tf-ANit-AL WP£ (I\N\C), T-Ht 2.016 INT82.N-ATIONAL 

-PLLl\N\'BING, WP£ (I-PC) , TVJe, 2.016 INT82.N-ATION-AL fl,,\tL.G,-AS CO-Pt, 2.016 

INT82.NATION-AL EXISTING, '0LlILPING, WP£, TVJe, 2.016 INT82.N-ATIONAL 

£N82.G,'I WNS82.V-ATION CO-Pt, -Avid Tf+t ICC-A117.1-2.01r, f()g LOLlPON 

COLlNT'I, TtNNtSStt, -PW2.SLl-ANT TO TtNNtSStt WPt ANNOTATtP, 

SECTIONS 0-2.0-101 T#ROLlG,+/ 0-2.0-10G>. 

17. A12.£SOLLlTION A\N\£NPING, T-Ht lONING, \N\A-P Of LOLA-PON COLANT'I, 
TtNNtSStt, -PW2.SLl-ANT TO CffA-PT82. StVtN, §13-7-100 Of T+/t 
TtNNtSStt WP£ ANNOTATtP, T012.tl0Nt f12,0\N\ A-2.,12.W?.-AL 
12.tSIPtNTI-AL PIS712.ICT TO C-2. I G,tN82.-AL W\N\\N\82.CI-AL PIS712.ICT. 
LOLlPON WLlNT'I TAX Wi-A-P 01Cl, -PA12.C£L OBB.00 LOt-ATtP AT CJ040 
+/OTC,f-fkISS V-ALLt:'112.P, LOl,,\PON COLlNT'I, TN, SITLl-ATtP IN T+/t 0TH 

LtG,ISLATIVt PIS712.ICT 

C. A 12.ESOLlXTION AVV\ENPINGt THE t.ONINf1 VV\A'P Of LOlJDON 
CD(AN1'1, 1ENNESSEE, 1'LW.S(;IAN110 GHA1'1tl2. SEVEN, §1'3-7-100 Of 
THE 1ENNESSEE CODE ANN01A1£P, 1012.Et.ONE f12.0VV\ VV\-1, 
6tENtl2.AL IN1l(;IS11?.IAL 1lIS11?.IC110 A-1 A&IC(;IL 1L,02.AL­
f012.ES11?.'I PIS11?.ICT LO(;ll)ON CO(;IN1'11AX VV\Ar' 032, 1'A1?.tEL 
112.00 LOCA1£P A1 COT?.1'012.AiE 1'A1?.K WIVE, LO(;IPON C,O(;IN1'f, 
IN, SI1(;1A1EP IN THE 1ST LEGtISLA1IVE 1lIS11?.IC1 

1 



3) Vv\c;iyor -1?>&\ddy 1?>ro1dsV1o1w 

A. Solid Wo1ste, AppoivitVl'levit 

4) Ll.lVl'lVl'lissiovier - f1o1ry WVJitfield 

A. fork Cre,e,k12.oc;id12.esol&\tiovi & Ivite,rlocc;il At'.)rMVl'levit 

'S) Lo&\dovi Ll.l&\VJty -P&\rCVJolSiVJI:) - VV\c;itt KleiVJSCVJVl'lidt 

A. 2023 - 2024 tVl'lploye,e, Vv\e,dico1I, Visiovi & l)e,vito1I Ivis&\rnvice, 

c;,) LllVl'lVl'lissiovier - Vo1vi SV1o1ver 

A. l)isc&\ssiovi o1Vl'levidivi0 plc;it o1pprovo1I process for -Plo1viviivi0 Ll.lVl'lVl'lissiovi 

7) l)ire,ctor of Acco&\vits o1vid 1?>&\dl:)e,ts - frivi 12.ice, 

A. 1?>&\d0etl2.ecoVl'lVl'leVJdo1tiovis 

2 



Loudovi Cbuvity CbVYWY\issiovi 

A 12.-ESOLUTION TO AVO-PT THE 2.0,'o INT-E12.NATIOINAL 13lAILVING, GOVE 
(I13t), Tvie 2.0,'o INT-E12.NATIONAL 12.ESIVENTIAL GOVE (I12.t), Tvie 2.0,'o 

INT-E12.NAT IONAL W\-EC,/--tANitAL GOVE (IW\t), THE 2.0,'o INT-E12.NATIONAL 
-P LUW\13ING, GOVE (I-Pt), Tvie 2.0,'o INT-E12.NATIONAL flAE L G,AS GOVE, 2.0,'o 

INT -E12.NATIONAL EXISTING, 13lAILVING, GOVE, Tvie 2.0,'o INT-E12.NATIONAL 
EN-E12.G,'I tONS-E12.VATION GOVE, AV1d THE Itt A117.1-2.01r, f012. LOlAVON 

tOlANT'I, TENNESSEE, -PlJRSUANT TO TENNESSEE GOVE ANNOTATEV, 
SEtTIONS 0-2.0-10, T-/-tl2.0UG,H 0-2.0-wc;,. 



RESOLUTION 

A RESOLlJTION TO AOOPT THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL IlUJLDING CODE (TilC), THE 2018 
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC), THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE (IMC), 

THE 2018 lNTERNATIONAL PLUMD!NG CODE ()PC), n,r,; 2018 JNTERN1\TIONAL FUEL GAS conE, 2018 
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE, nm 2018 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION 

CODE, AND TI-IE !CC Al 17.1-2017, FOR LOUDON COUNTY, TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO TENNESSEE 
CODE ANNOTATED, SECTIONS 5-20-101 THROUGH 5-20-106 

WHER8AS, the subject Codes est ablish minimum regulations to provide for the safe construction o f buildings and heallh of 
the inhabitants: and 

WHITREAS, the adoption oflhe subject Codes will provide for the proper inspection oflhe construction or addition to 
buildings within unincorporaletl areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have nol adopted their 
own codes regulating the same subject areas, lo help protect the public health, safely and welfare ofrhe County's inhabitants; 
and 

WHEREAS, th e subject Codes are the current codes adopted and enforced by the Stale of Tennessee, thereby ensuring !hat 
Loudon County will be enforcing and administering the same codes adopted by the State, which will avoid connicls in 
requirements when the State is involved in county inspections; and 

WHEREAS, the fee for building permit s will be set beginning with lhe first $1 ,000.00 of value or cost of construction as 
outlined on Attachment JI: Appendix B: Recommended Schedule of Permit Fees, Section B101 through B105, with Section 
BI 05, "PLAN-CHECKING FEES", not applicable to one- and two-family dwellings or residential accessory structures; and 

WHER8AS, pursuant lo TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATE!)§ 5-20-102, one(!) copy of the subject Codes have been filed 
in the Office of the Loudon County Clerk for a period ofat least ninety days prior to the adoption of this Resolution; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RF.SOLVED by the Loudon County Commission as follows: 

I) That the 20 18 International Building Code, published by the lnternalional Code Council, with amendments as 
prescribed in Altachmcnt !: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local building code within unincorporated 
areas of Loudon County, and within an y incorporated areas which have not adopted their ow n code regulating the same 
subject; and 

2) Thal ihe 20 I 8 International Res idential Code, published by the International Code Council, with amendments as 
prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local residential code within unincorpornted 
areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have 1101 adopted their own code regulating the same 
subject; and 

J) That the 20 IS International Plumbing Code, published by the International Code Council, with amendments as 
prescribed in Att.ichmenl I: Appendix/\: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local plumbing code within unincorporated 
areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporn1ed areas which have not adopted I heir own code regulating the same 
subject; and 

4) Thal the 20 I 8 Internalional Meclrnnical Code, rublished by the International Code Council, with amendments as 
prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopiecl as lhe loca l mechanical code within unincorporated 
areas of London County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted their own code regu lating the same 
subject; and 

5) Timi ihe 2018 International Gas Code, published by the International Code Council, wi th amendments as 
prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as ihe local gas code within unincorporated areas of 
Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted their own code regulating the same subject; and 

6) That the 2018 International Existing Building Code, published by the lntemational Code Council, with 
amendments as prescribed in Attachment!: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local existing building code 
within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted their own code 
regulating the same subject; and 

7) Thal lhe 2018 In1e111ational Energy Conservation Code, rublished by the International Code Council, with 
amcndmenls as prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local energy conservation 
code within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted their own 
code regulating the same subject; and 

8) Thal the A 117.1-2017 Standard, published by the International Code Council, be adopted as the local handicap 
code within unincorporated areas ol'Loudon County, and within any incorpornled areas which have not ,idopted their own 
code regu lating f11e smne subjtcl; and 

!) That Attachment 1: Appendix A : Code Amendments be adopted as amendments to applicable codes; and 

2) That /\ltachment II : Appendix B: Recommended Schedule of Permi t Fees be ~dopled as th e schedule for 
calculating building permit fees; 



OE IT FINALLY RESOLVED that this Resolution supersedes Resolution 040714-D, adopling previous codes, and shall 
take effect on July I, 2023, the public welfare requiring it. 

ATTEST LOUDON COUNTY CHAIRMAN 

APPROVED: LOUDON COUNTY MAYOR DATE 



APPENDIX A 
CODE AMENDMENTS 

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of this appendix 
(the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix are in conformity with the adopted 
code sections). 

SECTlON AIOI 
Amendments to the 2018 International Building Code 

1. Section IOI.I Title. 
Delete "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]" and insert "Loudon County, Tennessee" in its place. 

2. Section 101.2 . .1 Appendices, 
Insert "The following llppendices are specifically included in the adoption . All others are excluded. 

Appendix B IJoard Of Appeals 

3. Section 101.4.4 Plumbing. 
Delete "fnfe,-nationol f'rivate Sewage Disposal Code " and replace with "State of Tennessee Department of 
Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection" . 

4. Section 101.4.4 Property maintcnnnee, 
Delete Section IO 1.4 .4 in its entirety. 

5. Section 101.4.S Fire prevention. 
Delete Section IO I .4.5 in its entircry. 

6. Section I 10.3.7 Energy efficiency inspections. 
Shall be per the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code. 

7. Chapter I I Accessibility, 
Delete Chapter I I in its entirety. 

8. Section 1612.4 folood hazard docurnc11tation. 
Delete text and insert . "Documentation shall be provided per the adopted Loudon County, TN Floodplain 
Development Resolution." 

9. Section 1704.1 General. 
Change the first occunence of"shall" to "may be required to". 

10. Sectio11 2901.1 Scope. 
Change "!111emario11al Private Sewage Disposal Code" to "requirements of the Tennessee Department of 
Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection''. 

11. Referenced St:inclarcl.s. 
In the rnbles or referenced standards that list ASCE-7-16, delete this standard and replace with i\SCE-7-22. 



APPENDIX A 
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.) 

SECTION Al02 
Amendments to the 2018 International Residential Code 

Change all references in this code to the "!111emc,/io11a/ Privale Sewage Disposal Code" to "Tennessee 
Depai1ment of Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection requirements . 

1. Section R.101.l Title. 
Delete "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]" and insc1t "Loudon County, Tennessee" in its place. 

2. Section R102.5 Appendices. 
Insert "The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption. All others arc excluded. 

Appendix F Radon Control Methods 
Appendix M Home Day Care - R-3 Occupancy 

3. Section RI0S.2 \-Vork exempt from permit. 
Dclete"2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high." and inse,1 "2. Fences." in its place. 

4. Table R30l.2 (1) Climatic And Geographic l)csi~11 Criteria. 
lnse,t "10 PSF" in the table for Ground Snow Load . 
Insert " 115" in the table for Wind Speed . 
lnseti "No" in the tnblc for topographic effects. 
lnse1t "C" in the ta hie for Seismic Design Category. 
Insert "Severe" in the table for Weathering. 
lnse1t "12 inches" in the table for rrost Line Depth. 
Insert "Moderate to heavy" in the table for Termite. 
Insert "19 degrees Fahrenheit" in the table for Winter Design Temp. 
lnse1t "No" in the table for Ice Shield Underpayment Required. 
Insert "May 16, 2007" in the table for Flood Hazards. 
Insert "21 O" in the table for Air Freezing [ndex. 
lnse1i "59.4" in the table for Mean Annual Temp. 

5. Section R30l.2.2 Seismic provisions. 
In the exception, insert "and townhouses" after the word "dwellings" and at the end of the section insert 
"All references to "lownhouses in seismic design category C" in Clrnptet·s 6, 7, and 28 slrnll not apply in 
Loudon County." 

6. Section R303.4 Mechanical ventilation, 
. Add the word "Optional." in the sect ion title after the word ventilation. 
Delete the words "the dwelling uni I shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilution" and 
replace with the words "dwe lling units provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation shall be" 

7. Section R311.7.5.l Riser height. 
Delete "7 ¼ inches ( I 96mm)" and replace with "8 inches". 
Treads and risers of stairs shall be so proportioned that the sum of t\vo risers and a tread, exclusive of 
projection of nosing, is not less than 24 inches (610 mm) nor more than 26 inches (660 mm). 

8. Section R311.7.5.2 Trear! depth. 
Delete" IO inches (254 111111)" and replace with "9 inches 

9. SectionR311.7.S.2.1 Winder Treads. 
In both places and change "6 inches ( 153 mill)" to "4 inches" for the winder tread minimulll width nt the 
narrow end . 

10, Section R311.7.8 Handrails. 
Change "four or more risers" to "a total rise of 30 inches or more". 

11 . Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinlclcr Systems. 
Add the word "Optional" in the section title after the word "Systems". 

12. Section R502.ll.4 Truss Design Drawings. 
Delete "to the building official and approved prior to installation" and replace with "for review when 
required by the building official". 



13. Section R802.10.l Ti-uss design drawings. 
Delete " to the building officia l and approved prior to installation" and replace with "for review when 
required by the building officia l". 

14, Tahlc Nll02.l.2 (H.402.1.2) Insulation And Fenestration Requirements By Component. 
In the row fo r c limate zone "4 except Marine", change the Ceiling R-Valuc from "49" to "38", and 
change the Wood Frame Wall R-Valuc from "20 or 13+5" to " 13", and clrnnge the Mass Wall R-Valuc 
from "8/l 3" to "5/1 O". 

15. Table NI 102,1.4 (R402.l.4) E<111ivalent U-Factors. 
In the row for climale zone ",1 except Marine", change Ceiling U-Factor from "0.026" to "0 .030", and 
change Frame Wall U-Factor from "0.060" to "0.082", and change Mass Wall U-Factor from "0.098" to 
"0.141 ". 

16. Section Nll02.2.6 (R402.2.6) Steel-Frame ceilings, walls, and floors. 
ACter the firsl occurrence of the word "of'' insert "Table N 1102. l .2 or", 

17. Section Nl 102.4.1.2 (R402.4. l.2) Testing. 
Add the word "(optional)" alter the word "Testing" in the section title . 
Before the first sentence insert "Where required by the Building Official," 

18. Section NI l03.l.I (R403. l.l) Programmnhlc Thcrn1ostnt. 
Add the word "(optional)" after the word "thermostat" in the title section. 
Before the first sentence insc,t "Where required by the building official and," 

19. Section Nl103.3.2 (R403.3 .2) Sealing (Mandatory). 
Delete the word "(Mandatory)" . 

20. Section Nll03.3.3 (R403.3.3) Duct testing. (Mamlatory) 
Delete the word "(Mandatory)". 
At the beginning of the sentence insert "Where required by the building ofticial", 

21. Section Nl 103.4 (R.403.4) Mechanical system piping insulation (Mandatory). 
Change the R-Value from "R3" to " R2". 

22. Section N 1103.5.3 (403.5.3) Hot water pipe insulation (Prescriptive). 
Clrnnge the R-Value from " JU" to "R2". 
Delete Numbers 1, 2, 4, 5, 6 in the required locations. 

23. Section N 1103.6 (R403.6) Mechanical ventilation (Mnndatory). 
Delete the word " Mandatory" and replace with the word "Optional". 
Delete "The building shall be provided with ventilation thal complies with" and replace with "Building 
provided with ventilation shall meet". 

24. Section N1104 (R404) Electrical Power and Lighting Systems (Mandatory) . 
Delete lhe word "Mandatory" and replace with the word "Optional" 

25. Part VIII - Electrical. 
Delete Part VIII (Chapter 34 through Chapter 43) in its entirety. 



APPENDIX A 
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.) 

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of this appendix 
(the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix are in conformity with the adopted 
code sections). 

SECTION A 101 
Amendments to the 2018 International Plumbing Code 

I. Scclion 101.1 Title. 
Delete "[NAME OF JURJSDICTION)" and insert " Loudon County, Tennessee" in ils place . 

2. Section I 06.6 Fees. 
Delelc Section in its entirely and inscn "Fees ns adopted by resolution for Loudon County, Tennessee." 



APPENDIX A 
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.) 

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of this appendix 
(the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix arc in conformity with the adopted 
code sections). 

SECTION AlOl 
Amendments to the 2018 International Mechanical Code 

I. Section 1 OJ.I Title. 
Delete "(NAME OF JURISDICTIONl'" and insert "Loudon County, Tennessee" in ifs rlacc. 

2. Section 106.5 Fee.,. 
Delete Section in its entirety nnd insert "Fees as ndopted by resolution for Loudon County, Tennessee ." 



APPENDIX A 
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.) 

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of thi s appendix 
(the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix are in confonnity with the adopted 
code sections). 

SECTION AIOI 
Amendments to the 2018 lritcrn:itional Fuel G:is Code 

I. Section 101.1 Title. 
Delete "[NAME 01' JURISDICTION]" and insert "Loudon County, Tennessee" in its place, 

2. Section 106.6 Fees. 
Delete Section in its entirety and insert "Fees us adopted by reso lution for Loudon County, Tennessee ." 



APPENDIX A 
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.) 

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of this 
appendix (the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix are .in confonnity 
with the adopted code sections). 

SECTION AlOl 
Amendments to the 2018 International Existing Building Code 

I. Section 101.1 Title. 
Delete "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]" and insert "Loudon County, Tennessee" in its place. 



APPENDIX A 

CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.) 

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of this appendix 
(the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix are in conformity with the adopted 
code sections). 

SECTION AlOl 
Amendments to the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code 

1. Section IO I.I Ti1/e. 
Delete "[NAME OF JURISDICTION]" and insert " Loudon County, Tennessee" in its place. 

2. rncC-Residential Provisions. 
Structures permitted under the 2018 ln1ernat io11al Residential Code shall be regulated by Chapter 11 of the 
International Residential Code. 



APPENDIX 8 
RECOMMENDED SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES 

TolBI Valuntion 

SI ,000 and less 

$ I ,000 lo S5 0 ,000 

SECTION 8101 
PERMIT FEES 

Fee 

No fee, unless inspection required, 
in which case a S15 ,00 fee for each 
inspection shall be charged . 

$15.00 for the first Si,000.00 plus 
.li5 .00 for each additional thousand 
or fraction thereof. 10 and 
including $50,000.00. 

$50.000 10 $ I 00,000 $260.00 for the first 550,000.00 
plus $4.00 for each additional 
thousand or fraction thereof, to and 
including $100.000.00. 

$100.00010 $500,000 $460.00 for the first SI00,000.00 
plus $) .00 for each additional 
thousand or fraction thereof, to and 
including 5500,000.00. 

5500.000 and up S 1,660.00 for the nrsl $500,000.00 
plus $2.00 for each additional 
thousand or fraction thereof. 

SECTION 8102 
MOVING FEE 

For the moving of any building or structure , the fee shall be 
$100. 

SECTION 8103 
DEMOLITlON FEES 

For the demolition of any building or structures, the fee shall 
be: 

O up 10 100.000 cur, 
100.000 cur, and over 

SS0 .00 
S0.5011 .000 cu ft 

SECTION 8104 
PENALTIES 

Where work for which a permit is required by this code is 
started or proceeded prior 10 obtaining said permit, the fees 
herein specirted shall be doubled, but lhc .payment of such 
double fee shall nol relieve any persons from fully comply­
ing with the requirements or this code in the execution or the 
work nor from any other penalties prescribed herein . 

SECTION 8105 
PLAN-CHECKING FEES 

When the valuation of the proposed .construction exceeds 
$1,000.00 and a plan is required 10 be submilled by 104.2, a 
plan-checkini; fee shall be paid to the building official al lhe 
time of submilling plans and specifications for checking. 
Said plan-checking fee shall be equal lo one,half of the build­
ing permit fee as sel forth in l~.7. Such plan-checking fee is 
in addition to the building permit fee . 

175 



LotAdovi CorAvity Covnvnissiovi 

A12.ESOLlATION AVV\ENVING, T+/E lONING, VV\A'P Of LOLAVON CDLANT'/, 
TENNESSEE, T(;fl<SlAANT TO c+/ATTfR SEVEN, §13-7-100 Of T+/E 
TENNESSEE COVE ANNOTATEV, T012.ElONE f12.0VV\ A-2,12.(;fl<AL 

12.ESIVENTIAL 'DISTRICT TO C-2, G,ENt\2.AL COVV\VV\t\2.CIAL 'DISTRICT. 
LOlAVON COl;\NT'/ TAX VV\AT 01C-l, TA12.CEL 066.00 LOC,,ATEV AT C.,040 

+/OTe+/kISS VALLE'/12.V, LOlAVON COlANT'/, TN, SITlAATEV IN T+/E 0T+/ 
LEG,ISLATIVE 'DISTRICT 



RESOLUTION ____ _ 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY, 
TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO CHAPTER SEVEN, §13-7-105 OF THE 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZONE FROM A-2, RURAL 

RESIDENTIAL DISTRICT TO C-2 , GENERAL COMMERCIAL DISTRICT. 
LOUDON COUNTY TAX MAP 019, PARCEL 088.00 

LOCATED AT 9545 HOTCHKISS VALLEY RD, LOUDON COUNTY, TN, 
SITUATED IN THE 5TH 

LEGISLATIVE DISTRICT 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Commission, in accordance with Chapter Seven, § 13-7-105 of the 
Tennessee Code Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, boundary, area or any 
regulation of or within any district or districts, or any other provision of any zoning resolution, and 

WHEREAS, the Regional Planning Commission has forwarded a recommendation regarding the 
amendment to the Zoning Map of Loudon County, Tennessee, 

WHEREAS, a notice of public hearing and a description of the resolution appeared in the Daily 
Edition on May 12, 2023 consistent with the provisions of Tennessee Code Annotated, §13-7-105, and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County Commission that the Zoning 
Map of Loudon County, Tennessee be amended as follows: 

Located at 9545 Hotchkiss Valley Road situated in the 5th Legislative District, referenced by Tax Map 
0019, Parcel 088.00 to be rezoned from A-2 (Rural Residential District) to C-2 (General Commercial 
District). 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this Resolution shall take effect immediately, the public 
welfare requiring it. 

ATTEST LOUDON COUNTY CHAIRMAN 

DATE: ____ _ 

APPROVED: LOUDON COUNTY MAYOR 

The votes on the question of approval of this Resolution by the Planning Commission are as 
follows: 

APPROVED: __ o __ 

DISAPPROVED: _8_ 

ABSTAINED: ___ _ 

ATTEST: SECRETARY LOUDON COUNTY 
REGIONAL PLANNING COMMISSION 
Dated: 



RESOLUTION NO. ____ _ 

ILLUSTRATION ATTACHMENT 

REZONE FROM A-2 (RURAL RESIDENTIAL DISTRICT) 
TO C-2 (GENERAL COMMERICAL DISTRICT). REFERENCED BY LOUDON COUNTY 

TAX MAP 019, PARCEL 088.00 
LOCATED 9545 HOTCHKISS V ALLER ROAD 

LOUDON COUNTY, TN, SITUATED IN THE 5TH 
LEGISLATIVE DISTRICT 



Lo<Adovi Co<AVJ-n.t Cowiwiissiovi 

A12.ESOLlXTION AVV\ENVING, THE lONING! VV\AP Of LO(AVON 
CD(ANT'I, TENNESSEE, -Pl.Al<Sv\ANT TO G/-tA-PT82. SEVEN, ~313-7-100 Of 

THE TENNESSEE COVE ANNOTATEV, T012.ElONE "fROVV\ VV\-1, 
G,EN82.AL INVv\S--rRIAL VIS--rRICT TO A-1 AG,RICv\LTl.Al<AL­

fOl<ES--rR'I VIS--rRICT LOl,.,\VON C,Ol,.,\NT'I TAX VV\A-P 032., -PA12.CEL 
112.00 LOCATEVAT COl<-POl<ATE -PA12.K. WIVE, LOv\VON C,Ol,.,\NT'I, 

TN, SITv\ATEV IN THE , sT LEG,ISLATIVE VIS--rRICT 



RESOLUTION _____ _ 

A RESOLUTION AMENDING THE ZONING MAP OF LOUDON COUNTY. 
TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO CHAPTER SEVEN, §13-7-105 OF THE 

TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, TO REZONE FROM M-1, GENERAL 
INDUSTRIAL DISTRICT TO A-1 AGRICULTURAL-FORESTRY DISTRICT. 

LOUDON COUNTY TAX MAP 032, PARCEL 112.00 LOCATED AT 
CORPORATE PARK DRIVE, LOUDON COUNTY, TN, 

SITUATED IN THE 1ST 
LEGISLATIVE DISTRICT 

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Commission, in accordance with Chapter Seven, §13-7-105 of the 
Tennessee Code Annotated, may from time to time, amend the number, shape, boundary, area or any 
regulation of or within any district or districts, or any other provision of any zoning resolution, and 

WHEREAS, the Regional Planning Commission has forwarded a recommendation regarding the 
amendment to the Zoning Map of Loudon County, Tennessee, 

WHEREAS, a notice of public hearing and a description of the resolution appeared in the Daily 
Edition on May 12 ,2023 consistent with the provisions of Tennessee Code Annotated, §13-7-105, and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County Commission that the Zoning 
Map of Loudon County, Tennessee be amended as follows: 

Located at Corporate Park Drive situated in the 1st Legislative District, referenced by Tax Map 032, 
Parcel 112.00 to be rezoned from M-1 (General Industrial District) to A- I (Agricultural-Forestry 
District) 

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this Resolution shall take effect immediately, the public 
welfare requiring it. 

ATTEST LOUDON COUNTY CHAIRMAN 

DATE: ____ _ 

APPROVED: LOUDON COUNTY MAYOR 

The votes on the question of approval of this Resolution by the Planning Commission are as 
follows: 

APPROVED: --"'-8_ 

DISAPPROVED: _O_ 

ABSTAINED: ___ _ 

ATTEST: SECRETARY LOUDON COUNTY 
REGIONAL PLANNING COMMISSION 
Dated: 



RESOLUTION NO. ------
ILLUSTRATION ATTACHMENT 

REZONE FROM M-1 (GENERAL INDUSTRIAL DISTRICT) 
TO A-1 (AGRICULTURE-FORESTRY DISTRICT). 

REFERENCED BY LOUDON COUNTY 
TAX MAP 032, PARCEL 112.00. LOCATED CORPORATE PARK DRIVE, 

LOUDON COUNTY, TN, SITUATED IN THE 1ST 
LEGISLATIVE DISTRICT 



Lov1dovi Cov1vity Covnvnissiovi 

W\~y \ ?, 2023 



LOUDON COUNTY, TENNESSEE 
BOARD OF COMISSIONERS 
RESOLUTION -----

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING INTERLOCAL COOPERATION 
AGREEMENT WITH CITY OF PHILADELPHIA, 

TENNESSEE FOR FORK CREEK ROAD 

WHEREAS, Tennessee Code Annotated §12-9-108 authorizes public agencies to 

" ... contract with any one (I) or more public agencies to perform any governmental service, 

activity or undertaking which each public agency entering into the contract is authorized 

by law to perform; provided, that such contract shall be authorized by the governing body 

of each party to the contract...;" and 

WHEREAS, the City of Philadelphia, Tennessee ("the City") owns and maintains 

approximately 0.7 miles of Fork Creek Road, extending from the intersection of Hwy 11 

to the entrance of Philadelphia Park; and 

WHEREAS, Loudon County, Tennessee ("the County") is the recipient of State 

ARPA funds and wishes to use some of those funds to pave the City's portion of Fork 

Creek Road; and 

WHEREAS, the City hereby agrees and has proposed the Interlocal Cooperation 

Agreement for Fork Creek Road attached as Exhibit A; and 

WHEREAS, the City and the County desire to enter into said agreement whereby 

the County employs a third-party entity to pave the City's portion of Pork Creek Road, and 

will take over complete maintenance and upkeep of said portion of Road. 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Loudon County Board of 

Commissioners, in regular session assembled this _ day of ______ , 2023, that the 



County Mayor be authorized to enter into the Interlocal Cooperation Agreement with the City of 

Philadelphia, Tennessee, in the form attached hereto as Exhibit A to this resolution. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, this Resolution shall take effect immediately, the public 

welfare requiring it. 

ATTEST: 

APPROVED: 

Riley Wampler, County Clerk 

Rollen (Buddy) Bradshaw, Mayor 

Henry Cullen, Chairman, Loudon County, Tennessee 
Board of Commissioners 

2 



INTERLOCAL COOPERATION AGREEMENT 
FOR FORK CREEK ROAD 

This Interlocal Cooperation Agreement ("Agreement") is entered into this __ day of 
___ 2023 by and between THE CITY OF PHILADELPHIA, TENNESSEE 

. ("City") and LOUDON COUNTY, TENNESSEE ("County"). 

WITNESS ETH 

Whereas, Tennessee Code Annotated § 12-9-108 authorizes public agencies to " ... contract 
with any one (1) or more public agencies to perform any governmental service, activity 
or undertaking which each public agency entering into the contract is authorized by law 
to perform; provided, that such contract shall be authorized by the governing body of 
each party to the contract ... ; " and 

Whereas, the City owns and maintains approximately 0.7 miles of Fork Creek Road, 
extending from the intersection of Hwy 11 to the entrance of Philadelphia Park; and 

Whereas, the County is the recipient of State ARP A funds and wishes to use some of 
those funds to pave the City's portion of Fork Creek Road; and 

Whereas, the City hereby agrees; and 

Whereas, the City and County desire to enter into an agreement whereby the County 
employ a third party entity to pave the City's portion of Fork Creek Road, and will take 
over complete maintenance and upkeep of said portion of Road; and 

Whereas, to achieve this plan, the City and County hereby enter into this Interlocal 
Cooperation Agreement for the purpose of the County's paving the City's portion of Fork 
Creek Road, and the County's continued maintenance and upkeep of the same. 

NOW THEREFORE IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS: 

1. The City shall continue to be the legal owner of the approximately 0. 7 miles of 
Fork Creek Road extending from Hwy 11 to the entrance of Philadelphia Park in 
Philadelphia, Tennessee. 

2. The County, utilizing the State allocated ARPA Funds, shall employ a third-party 
entity to pave this section of Fork Creek Road. 

EXHIBIT A 



3. The County shall be responsible for all obligations under the contract with said 
third-party entity including, but not limited to, payment for paving. The City shall 
not be deemed a party to any contracts regarding this paving project. 

4. The County shall maintain the City's portion of Fork Creek Road for perpetuity, 
so long as it is open to the public as a City street or road or is added to the County 
road list, and shall indemnify and hold the City harmless for any matters related to 
or caused by the condition of the Road due to any negligence of the County. 

5. The County shall inform the City of the entity chosen to perform the paving, and 
keep it apprised of any changes thereto moving forward. 

6. The County's Road Superintendent shall notify the City Mayor of any planned 
projects for this portion of Fork Creek Road and provide a description of all 
maintenance that has been performed or is scheduled to be performed on the road. 

7. The County's Road Superintendent shall be the designated contact person for this 
road paving project and future road projects and maintenance of the City's portion 
of Fork Creek Road. 

8. This Agreement shall take effect upon its adoption and approval by the governing 
bodies of both parties hereto and shall be binding upon the undersigned, their 
successors and assigns unless modified by an agreement in writing executed by the 
parties hereto. 

Witness the day and year first above written. 

City of Philadelphia, Tennessee Loudon County, Tennessee 

By:________ By: _______ _ 

Adopted:_______ Adopted: ______ _ 



LotAdovi CorAVJfy CoW\Wlissiovi 

VV\t1y vs, 2.023 

2D23 - 2D24 €vnployee VV\edic~I, Visio~ & Ve~t~I I~Svff~~ce 



Cigna Healthcare Financial Exhibit for: 

Loudon County Government 
Effective Date: July 01, 2023 

Q1 P1, As-ls Renewal 

Cigna PLAN OFFERED 

Plan Offering 
Plan Name 
Situs 

Subscribers 

Employee 
Emp + Dep 
Emp + Family 
Monthly Billed Amount 
Included in the proposed Monthly Billed 
Amount is the Benefit Advisor Fee which is 
not part of the monthly premium. 

Acct#:0626354/OP-5266006/Q 1 /3227150 

84 
62 
78 
224 

Members 

506 

3i:t 
Cigna . 

Local Plus 
LCP 

Single Option 
LCP Performance 

TN 
LCP (TNLCPR, TNLCPU) 

Current Rate Renewal Rate Monthly Billed Change · 
Amount 

$592.94 $622.56 $52,295.04 5.00% 
$1,185.84 $1,245.08 $77,194.96 5.00% 
$1,689.82 $1,774.23 $138,389.94 5.00% 

$267,879.94 

Page 1 of 1 5/1/2023 3:02 PM 



_y( Cigna . Cigna Vision Solution for Loudon County Government 

EfrccllVC! DJIC: 7l1'2021 

Rcncw~1 qi.i:ilc can pie led 17t C.(}f\l ~nur &i V1~on Ul"Jcrvrrl~ng on M,vch J. 2021 
Vglur,l:iry Fl C uo1o /Por Emploroo Per PJonlh) 

Cmplo)°\:~• Ontr 
Emplo)'CO • 1 
Employee• h 

Toi.JI EE'~ 

~ 
07 
5' ., 

"' 

'81cliorcomniiu;Ol'S ol 10:~ .:,ro incl;.KJcdin IM quolo 

~ 
$5.47 

$10.17 
S15,40 

'VfJC.1111.1,y: M.xlic.il :,nc:f'o,, dor.t.JI rvl:Jctiect r c:,11 ,l<nl ro no, ar,1r,/lin v,s~i. Do~•s "°' ,ctrr lo conlribv/,On /c.,t l t . 
·o...o,. i'S ,·.Jli,J fo• ,0 dJy:s and inclvdos ch,:TI POC~SSlr,i] na/wCfk JC"C:"S~ CIJS(Ol"IICf scrvico, pol,,;y 

:.Jt'ldcoll ific.J to. ,1rtd J/;,rci:JrcJ 1-:sion tf'f)OlfiflfJ 1'ld IM ;1/sa inrludiH /wa 11irior, sp,x,'f;c 10 t:Jrdr . rnJJ/1.'ddir~,,, 10 1llo 

mcl'IIWS flotl1a J<JdtuH (vi/ass a//1fd ,Jtt;1rgcmot.1s ;,,o m,1Jo irl Ji.,JttCc}. 
·uur C,011.1 Visi~ /YO(X)S ;i l is c~:i~r, / LJt»il scl-::linr, Cig n.J fc, y::,(.lr den/JI Jn:i 'or nic~J:JI c.:;1·cr;i9::. 

·rtiir Q\'010 .1HIJll'IOI ,,.. C,'°gnJ v~,·::,,, will bo J df1Mi•i,ie,N on FJCC!J . 

'RJtas Jto 9uJrJn/ordlor J y c.1rs 
' Cig,i,1 //a,1//hc,11t's .,;,ion p1o:Juct1 :,,o ·o rccp!ad boriot,,r · ;mdnol Sub/'-"'' lo Ess art,.:,ll /0.11/11 lJt>na, , •rouiamalll: . 

711120~ 1 
SS.6l 

$ 10 .Sl 
$ 1S.9•1 

711 /20?2 
SS..6J 

SIO.Sl 
SIS.94 

711/lQ'J 
SS.6J 
$10.SJ 
SIS.9-1 

Pl.:tn Code: 

·nic Jbo.,a q...-otC'd •~ /fJj inr:I/Jda llcJfl, htVJl'>CO AJJCHnl<W"lf leas (PP11Cl1J (u, 10!0 ""''''' '-'· 0(/f ,1;,f fu, 20ZI .ir.d Wyo11d. Ci90J1rsc,vcs :ha 1i9hl /O f11Cldilt Q:JOIC'd / J /Cf, JS nt-eCSSJt}'. Sh«J.'Othcre 
bd .J'ly Chil'IOCS ;,, lultlft f('JIJIJ!iotl or cost s 

Cig••l V, t iol tl.-1,--o,k Qll ,:f~ 000 o/ ll1g ~g~~;111;,kir\JI rou1 '1c Yi siu-1 no1110tk \, ,Yill'I op:ornc:, i: U 3i'ld 
ooh!hX~oi,i~IS :II hJl r.:1in11 Loc.:il ions na'.tol'l,1ido. in:ludin,;, p,i,. ,,10 rv,ic1Cn :v>d n,11~.~ :v\d rc,,j.m:l 1t 1,--.1 lrT.;i:im,. 
Plc;uo bo :,,v,vo Iha! JhoCien.l Vi1"oi No!,~crl!. it ~He1cnt lrorn ti~ Con,1 ms'd:C: .~ nell•ots , 
Rcnow .JI PrJn Design• t'f'O • 5chrdulcd 
Frro;.,crcv is 12 mantli r IOi o;Jn,s, 11 fl't~nJllt /:,, ltttlOJ, 12 ma.,thJ lo• cc-nl.'ICI l;,11: rn. ;,n,J f!.J mcr11i'l, /-,, t,,,,,,e,. 
Bene Ill ln•Nclwork 
1;,,-vnin~,on C:cp.11 SIS 
•~o, i:il, Cop.lf 
(:~yn 

S111Jlo V,fio,·1lW'l\~t 
~'o.10:loc:.t l o- •~u~ 
l.il\00 T1 ifo:::il l..rf'lsu~/P109rC'!i~i,,o lmw, 
l'"l~ul:.- ll"'l~e) 
C:g-1!.>c;l ll.'l"ltc1M,\l e1,-"1(10( ;i!i)'lo,.,:r,c:o) 

E: loc!ivo 
Thc,;oc,..,lic 

r1 ,1rn•1 hci.V ,"\'..,.v.v>e:lll 

ln•fklwo,k 0ct\C'lll1 lndud, 

SlO 
Co,,Cf<.'\J ir1 Full 
Co,,,ett"di-ltun 
C<WCl'od if"IFU:1 
Crw"',.-1;,.F,JI 
CcwC'tod 111Fu11 

S"ICIO d lo,,/V'ICc 

Co-11.,-cdin F~H 
S100 ;i'low.v,c11 

• Onz .-,,on :ittd C)'C 1\:-.'1.'lh c,:i/11~~ i,1cWno 11,,,1001 l.,r.,co 10 eye llc:i#.h c .. ...-n.,.-.,l,.~ <tl.1101, ,c-1, .x:101. ;i.'Wj prcsc,ipeo, 1u 

ou.ucs 
• Ooc p~r d ll~Yd l)ICIC ll,)!.:wl pl.ut,c Ol ')l"'I.I I toni u . :i,'I l:W'(J'!1 rJ prcsc.r;p1<)<>$ h>C""tf:) /W1(J fl"~ln J ) 

• Add'~icn:111 cf"><c, ~ lens cnh.1r,i;cm('l111. mMum 20",~ u·.inJt· incudo119 but nol kr.t.-d 1;1 · 

Rcit113Scr e<.,,..,19 

lcnl E nh;,,c cn1cilll /~~l'lmlrn ~':", ~;r,.ir,o;)' ' 

O-:i111Lc-,l~ll"\ 

R.11 0 Tofl1; ,11)-,012 

t'otrc;vll:,,1,111 
A.~ PLuli:: 0 (0 T"wih 
Sl:v>d;ll'O Ptoott,,nl>< • (i l.i:.1 QI P•~•< 

Sl.in.1,V(I Scr.ucn Co.it~ 
S:Jnd.11CIUl.-;M:,ltiCo.ll;,,} 
Pro.J•c1s,,-cs 
SI.YIC,VOAnlo · R ~ l{';lo,eCc;..ll<119 

C~..-dlnfu'l 

Co-«ld In Fi.ti 
CCM;.'l'cd<.l'Jrc:uol.v,: ,o .. 
so ,. 
Cc,,,c,co lnFu·1 ,. .. 
so 

Cu sl i,rr, ,r Cosl 

uplcr5J!l .. 
SU 
U(l 10 s .ic lor A.;.,11~ 

V9 IOSl1 

uploSH2 

uplo511 

u p10S1 7 ,. 
up lo!l--15 
2C~'. oilt~~I 

20~'• D1 l 1c1:.l 

• One 111T1H) ol th0°(C CQ\it'f~ up !o rc\ ;i. l pl.Tl ,-)i-.,, ¥YV:", plul I 20Y. 1:l,~"1)1 m ;\lt\O,Jf\1 lh!I c,Co<.'1::h 11:,, <1 (' ;:,11o-.... ~c 

OUl•ol •NclW!!lk 

,,. 
545~'f~O 

S-I0;:i;'\c,,,V,V1CO 

SGS~U.v.vico 
S1S;il~ ••=• 
SI0()~1;v,co 

S0i Q.1;1-fr.vu;a 

S210:i.1uwanco 

SSS"'1::1w.1nea 

• 0 1\C p.>1 or o sin;I!: purd~c Sv.rf.lr ol con1x1 k,,ru("S in ~cv ol 111\St"I" .i,"l(f lr.ir,ic t.,cr,1;"'11. i,,1:11 n<J rc,::cw:: CO'\\a:l lm~e, """lr.l.'l•c-s.,, 11\c s l.•m UC'ncl,1 ~ .111. 
• ,\IJO.,-:W'CC :W"-'d l!.M-.-vdCCl11 ol f upp/C,nC'<!l.ll con:,,,:1 k ol'lt"i p,ol~1,u~~ ~cn-oce1 

• Hc.>111,At'Yr.w-1!, 3 • V,s ,01 N:-1 ... ,n. S.i-.-t>Qf Pl .l(Y."11'1\ 

• I.\,,;,,,.,,,, ~•• n .-'.t1 ;11· on a.1c,IO'l :\l 1J!Jtth~CJ d 1,.-.,u~-, ; , o<J,\,o lt.•o Jr.. , ;,._1.,.J~i, 1(., ,i ~1i:w,1 . # ~1 3 r.ild ~1n -:;c,,p1,:,n. 0fltt(.V , a,lti\ji 

~ Nt ~ , lo CC,,,l.l.:1 lcni m J!a-,.j, . c,-«l ...,l' I )(\If c~ V.:"71 tkl .. -ook r,o-.<:10' la, dci:\lli . 

· P1~d« p:w1~p,.11ion 1s 100"/ , ooiu<11:vy, plcJJC Chcdl wlh JOUf Ere C MC Poolcn ,oruj I~ .ir•t cl/n ('do11 i aunlJ : Sl.llcod CuO:•n('I Coll , u ptcrm.u.mt,11T11 , :vc SIJtlicd loch,""9Cw,\."IQUI 1'1,;,11:CC. 

· ·cCM:"l';ll)C nu, Y.r"f Ill p.YU;ipJtO<J GI HQ.Jnl /Cl,"\;I ,lj l(f l'T'l("T'IO('l"$ t,O clubapk:\ll~~l ,011 , plc.nc Ctinl.XICv11oonci Sct,<clcr 1p,cc,I ,: cc••'t'fl0~•1r D1"1n~-.n . 

8t'rn'fi1J:vc\ll'\Jc,,..nrirncr.:,cn,n·s,r·r:-db1C?U fli1 "1lo,m.1/,o,i1 intl"{ldc,J JJJ 

,...,.,rnJI)' o/br~l,/J cnr, hdcc-1 n:;,t c:f,'.' J,;1,0C, J h lhc trmu , p.,o,,iJ IOl'll Jnd•·tn:J/q'IJ of f>A,/ pl,v., /1,'rl..o~ "'""Ql."J ,,•i:­
iA.1\'P(Y"Q"rw C.:.'111.Xl'11 so'rtr ,r1p,¥1rtbl~ tr,r rw11wt •nq ~' ' '"" c1Jt1in,11;.,., .:rdpi~IJ. 
Y.\/20 7. 1 11 :-U O~1"lr . O? ,S011127!J i\ccc,,.mlN~,l"b,,_.,.. ; C62GJSJ 

,, 
P.11J IF1oncl1(K110, ..,;ao, TN ,08) 



Cigna Healthcare Financial Exhibit for: 

Loudon County Government 
Effective Date: July 01, 2023 

Cigna Rates 
PPO Employee 
Plan 1 Emp + Family 

Monthly Total 

Plan Cost Summary - Rates 

Total Enrollment Current 

102 $29.39 
173 $86.30 

$17,927.68 
Renewal Change 

This quote assumes the proposed DPPO benefits will be administered on Dentacom. 

Account#:626354 

Renewal 

$29.39 
$86.30 

$17,927 .68 
0.00% 

-~~r~ 
Cign a. 

5/1/2023 3:26 PM 




