LOUDON COUNTY COMMISSION WORKSHOP

Monday, March 17,2014
County Office Building
6:00 pm

This is the time for audience members to speak on items on or not on the
Agenda.

Loudon County Planning and Codes Director, Russ Newman

A. A Resolution to Adopt, with Amendments, the 2012 International Building
Code (IBC), the 2012 International Residential Code (IRC), the 2012 International
Mechanical Code (IMC), the 2012 International Plumbing Code (IPC), and the 2002
North Carolina Accessibility Code with 2004 Amendments, for Loudon County,
Tennessee, Pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated, Sections 5-20-101 through
5-20-106.

B. A Resolution to Amend the Loudon County Zoning Resolution, Section 4.240
Site Plan Review, Pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 13-7-105.

Loudon County Roads Commissioner, Eddie Simpson

A. Loudon County 2014 Road’s List.

Loudon County Commissioner, Bob Franke
A. The Roll of County Commission in Day-to-Day Management of County Personnel
B. Issues that Could Affect Adequate Ambulance Service for Our County Citizens

C. Current Status of LCSWDC Negotiations on Landfill Closure Funding?

Loudon County Budget Director, Tracy Blair

A. Budget Committee Recommendations

Any other items

Adjournment



RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION TO ADOPT, WITH AMENDMENTS, THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE (IBC), THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC), THE 2012
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE (IMC), THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE
(IPC), AND THE 2002 NORTH CAROLINA ACCESSIBILITY CODE WITH 2004 AMENDMENTS,
FOR LOUDON COUNTY, TENNESSEE, PURSUANT TO TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED,
SECTIONS 5-20-101 THROUGH 5-20-106

WHEREAS, the subject Codes establish minimum regulations to provide for the safe construction of buildings
and health of the inhabitants; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of the subject Codes will provide for the proper inspection of the construction or
addition to buildings within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which
have not adopted their own codes regulating the same subject areas, to help protect the public health, safety and
welfare of the County’s inhabitants; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED § 68-120-101, the subject codes are current with-
in seven (7) years of the latest edition; and

WHEREAS, the fee for building permits will be set beginning with the first $1,000.00 of value or cost of
construction as outlined on Attachment II: Appendix B: Recommended Schedule of Permit Fees, Section B101
through B105, with Section B105, “PLAN-CHECKING FEES”, not applicable to one- and two-family dwellings
or residential accessory structures; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED § 5-20-102, one (1) copy of the subject Codes
have been filed in the Office of the Loudon County Clerk for a period of at least ninety days prior to the adoption
of this Resolution;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County Commission as follows:

1) That the 2012 International Building Code, published by the International Code Council, with
amendments as prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local building
code within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted
their own code regulating the same subject; and

2) That the 2012 International Residential Code, published by the International Code Council, with
amendments as prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local residential
code within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted
their own code regulating the same subject; and

3) That the 2012 International Plumbing Code, published by the International Code Council, with
amendments as prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local plumbing
code within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted
their own code regulating the same subject; and

4) That the 2012 International Mechanical Code, published by the International Code Council, with
amendments as prescribed in Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments, be adopted as the local mechanical
code within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and within any incorporated areas which have not adopted
their own code regulating the same subject; and

5) That the 2002 North Carolina Accessibility Code with 2004 Amendments, published by the State of
North Carolina, be adopted as the local handicapped code within unincorporated areas of Loudon County, and
within any incorporated areas which have not adopted their own code regulating the same subject; and

6) That Attachment I: Appendix A: Code Amendments be adopted as amendments to applicable codes;
and
7 That Attachment II: Appendix B: Recommended Schedule of Permit Fees be adopted as the schedule

for calculating building permit fees;

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this Resolution repeals Resolution 100608-N, adopting previous codes, and
shall take effect on April 8, 2014, the public welfare requiring it.

ATTEST LOUDON COUNTY CHAIRMAN

APPROVED: LOUDON COUNTY MAYOR DATE



APPENDIX A
CODE AMENDMENTS

The codes adopted by this resolution are amended as provided in the sections of this
appendix (the amendment identifiers contained within this appendix are in conformity
with the adopted code sections).

SECTION A101
Amendments to the 2012 International Building Code

1. Section 101.1 Title.
Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Loudon County, Tennessee” in its place.

2. Section 101.2.1 Appendices.

Insert “The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption. All others are excluded.
Appendix A Employee Qualifications
Appendix B Board Of Appeals”

3. Section 101.4.1 Gas.
Delete Section 101.4.1 in its entirety.

4. Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.
Delete “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” and replace with “State of Tennessee Department of
Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection”.

5. Section 101.4.4 Property maintenance.
Delete Section 101.4.4 in its entirety.

6. Section 101.4.5 Fire prevention.
Delete Section 101.4.5 in its entirety.

7. Section 101.4.6 Energy.
Delete Section 101.4.6 in its entirety.

8. Section 110.3.7 Energy efficiency inspections.
Change “shall” to “may” in two places.

9. Chapter 11 Accessibility.
Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety.

10. Section 1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas.
Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Loudon County, Tennessee” in its place.
Delete “[INSERT DATE OF ISSUANCE]” and insert “May 8, 2007.

11. Section 1704.2 General.
Change the first occurrence of “shall” to “may be required to”.

12. Section 2901.1 Scope.
Change “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” to “requirements of the Tennessee Department of
Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection”.

13. Section 3401.3 Compliance with other codes.

Delete “International Energy Conservation Code, International Fire Code, International Fuel Gas
Code...International Property Maintenance Code and International Private Sewage Disposal Code
Insert after “International Residential Code”, “and the requirements of the Tennessee Department of
Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection”.

14. Section 3412.2 Applicability.

Delete “[DATE TO BE INSERTED BY THE JURISDICTION. NOTE: IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT
THIS DATE COINCIDE WITH THE EFFECTVE DATE OF BUILDING CODES WITHIN THE
JURISDICTION.]” and insert “January 1, 2006”.

15. Section 3412.3.2 Compliance with other codes.
Delete Section 3412.3.2 in its entirety.



APPENDIX A
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.)

SECTION A102
Amendments to the 2012 International Residential Code

Changé all references in this code to the “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” to
“Tennessee Department of Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection
requirements.

1. Section R101.1 Title.
Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Loudon County, Tennessee” in its place.

2. Section R102.5 Appendices.

Insert “The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption. All others are excluded.
Appendix F Radon Control Methods
Appendix M Home Day Care — R-3 Occupancy”

3. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit.
Delete”2. Fences not over 7 feet (1829 mm) high.” and insert “2. Fences.” in its place.

4. Table R301.2(1) Climatic And Geographic Design Criteria.
Insert “10 PSF” in the table for Ground Snow Load.

Insert ““90” in the table for Wind Speed.

Insert “C” in the table for Seismic Design Category.

Insert “Severe” in the table for Weathering.

Insert “12 inches” in the table for Frost Line Depth.

Insert “Moderate to heavy” in the table for Termite.

Insert “19 degrees Fahrenheit” in the table for Winter Design Temp.
Insert “No” in the table for Ice Shield Underpayment Required.
Insert “May 8, 2007” in the table for Flood Hazards.

Insert “210” in the table for Air Freezing Index.

Insert ““59.4” in the table for Mean Annual Temp.

5. Section R301.2.2 Seismic provisions.

Delete item 1, renumber item 2 to item 1 and insert “and townhouses” after the word “dwellings” and at the
end of the section insert “All references to “townhouses in seismic design category C” in Chapters 6, 7, and
28 shall not apply in Loudon County.”

6. Section R302.2 Townhouses.

Delete the word “Exception:” and insert “Exception #1: for townhouses equipped with an automatic
sprinkler system:”

At the end of this exception, insert the following:

“Exception #2: for townhouses not equipped with an automatic sprinkler system:” A common 2-hour fire-
resistance-rated wall is permitted for townhouses if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical
equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be
in accordance with Section R302.4.”

7. Section R302.5.1 Opening protection.
Delete the words,”equipped with a self closing device” and insert a period after the word “doors”.

8. Section R303.4 Mechanical ventilation.

Add the word “Optional.” in the section title after the word ventilation.

Delete the words “the dwelling unit shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation” and
replace with the words” dwelling units provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation shall be”

9. Section R501.3 Fire protection of floors.
Delete section R501.3 and the exceptions in its entirety.

10. Section R311.7.5.1 Risers.

Delete “7 % inches (196mm)” and replace with “8 inches”.

Delete the last sentence of the section on open risers and insert, “The difference in height between adjacent
risers shall not exceed 3/16 inch. Treads and risers of stairs shall be so proportioned that the sum of two
risers and a tread, exclusive of projection of nosing, is not less than 24 inches (610 mm) nor more than 26
inches (660 mm).



APPENDIX A
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.)

11. Section R311.7.5.2 Tread depth.
Delete “10 inches (254 mm)” and replace with “9 inches”.

12. Section 311.7.5.2.1 Winder treads.
Delete “10 inches” and replace it with “9 inches” and delete “6 inches and replace it with “4 inches”.

13. Section R311.7.5.3 Nosings.
In the exception change “11 inches” to “10 inches”.

14. Section R311.7.8 Handrails.
Change “four or more risers” to “a total rise of 30 inches or more”.

15. Section R312.2 Window fall protection.
Delete section R312.2 and R312.2.1 in their entirety.

16. Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems.
Add the words “(Optional, see Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(a)(8)).” in the section
title after the word “Systems”.

17. Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems.
Delete the words” An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in townhouses.” And replace it with
“When an automatic residential fire sprinkler system is installed in townhouses, the following shall apply:”

18. Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems.

Delete the words “An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-family
dwellings.” And replace with “When an automatic residential fire sprinkler system is installed in one- and
two-family dwellings, the following shall apply.”

19. Section R404.1.3 Design required.

Delete the word “or” and insert the word “and” in its place at the end of the sentence in item 2. of this
section.

20. Add new section numbers, titles and text as follows:

“Section R404.1.3.1 Permanent lateral support for foundation and retaining walls. Masonry
foundation walls shall be laterally supported in accordance with the applicable provisions of Chapter 6
Wall Construction Sections R606 General Masonry Construction, R607 Unit Masonry, and R608 Multiple
Wythe Masonry.”

“Section R404.1.3.2 Masonry and concrete foundation walls supporting four feet or more of
unbalanced backfill. Where masonry or concrete foundation walls supporting four feet or more of
unbalanced backfill do not extend and attach to the floor sheathing above, they shall be laterally braced at
the top of the wall at intervals not to exceed two feet on center. Bracing shall be provided by the floor
structural members where they are perpendicular to the wall and by blocking or bridging where the floor
structural members are parallel to the wall. Such blocking or bridging shall be installed in the first three
spaces between the floor structural members. For nominal “two by” lumber floor structural members, the
blocking shall be nominal “two by” solid full depth blocking the same size as the floor joist. For
engineered floor structural members, such as trusses or I-joist, such blocking shall be in accordance with
the manufacturers written instructions and shall be not less than a 2” x 4” diagonal brace connected to the
sill plate on top of the wall and connected to the top of the first structural member and a 2” x 4” flat block
connected to the top of the first and second structural members in line with the diagonal brace.”

“Section R404.1.3.3 Lateral support for the bottom of masonry and concrete foundation walls.
Where masonry or concrete foundation walls are required by Table R404.1.1(1), R404.1.1(2), R404.1.1(3),
R404.1.1(4), or R404.1.1(5) to have vertical steel reinforcing , the bottom of the wall shall be laterally
supported. Lateral support shall be provided by a full basement concrete slab floor a minimum of a 3 %”
thick poured tight against the bottom of the foundation walls with no compressible materials allowed for
expansion or other purposes. If no floor slab is to be poured, such as in crawl spaces, lateral support of the
bottom of the foundation wall shall be accomplished by embedding steel reinforcing in the foundation,
which shall extend up into the wall and be tied to the wall reinforcing. This reinforcing shall be of the
same size and spacing as is required for the wall.”



APPENDIX A
CODE AMENDMENTS (Cont.)

21. Section R502.11.4 Truss Design Drawings.
Delete “to the building official and approved prior to installation” and replace with “for review when
required by the building official”.

22. Section R602.6 Drilling and notching studs.
In subsection “2. Drilling.” Delete the second occurrence of the word “no”.

23. Section R802.10.1 Truss design drawings.
Delete “to the building official and approved prior to installation” and replace with “for review when
required by the building official”.

24. Table N1102.1.1 (402.1.1) Insulation And Fenestration Requirements By Component.

In the row for climate zone “4 except Marine”, change the Ceiling R-Value from “49” to “38”, and change
the Wood Frame Wall R-Value from “20 or 13+5” to”13”, and change the Mass Wall R-Value from “8/13”
to “5/10”.

25. Table N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3) Equivalent U-Factors.

In the row for climate zone “4 except Marine”, change Ceiling U-Factor from “0.026” to “0.30”, and
change the Frame Wall U-Factor from “0.057” to “0.082”, and change the Mass Wall U-Factor from
“0.098” to “0.141”.

26. Section N1102.2.6 (R402.2.6) Steel-frame ceilings, walls, and floors.
After the first occurrence of the word “of” insert “Table N1102.1.1 or”.

27. Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing.
Add the word “(optional)” after the word “Testing “in the section title.
Before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official,”

28. Section N1103.1.1 (R403.1.1) Programmable thermostat.
Add the word “(optional).” After the word “thermostat” in the section title.
Before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official and,”

29. Section N1103.2.2 (R403.2.2) Sealing (Mandatory).
Before the words “Duct tightness” insert “Where required by the building official,”

30. Section N1103.4.1 (R403.4.1) Circulating hot water systems (Mandatory).
Add the sentence “All circulating hot water piping shall be insulated to at least R-2.” After the
section title.

31. Section N1103.4.2 (R403.4.2) Hot water pipe insulation (Prescriptive).

Delete the word “Prescriptive” and replace with the word “Optional” in the section title.
Before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official,”

Before the words “All remaining piping” insert ‘Where required by the building official,”.

32. Section N1103.5 (R403.5) Mechanical ventilation (Mandatory).

Delete the word “Mandatory” and replace it with the word “Optional” in the section title.

Delete “The building shall be provided with ventilation that meets” and replace it with “Buildings
provided with ventilation shall meet”.

33. Section N1103.9 (R403.9) Pools and inground permanently installed spas (Mandatory).
Delete the word “Mandatory” and replace it with the word “Optional” in the section title.
Before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official,”

34. Section N1104 Electric Power and Lighting Systems (Mandatory).
Delete the word “Mandatory” and replace it with the word “Optional” in the section title.

3S. Section N1104.1 (R404.1) Lighting equipment (Mandatory).
Delete the word “Mandatory” and replace it with the word “Optional” in the section title.
Before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official,”

36. Part VIII — Electrical.
Delete Part VIII (Chapter 34 through Chapter 43) in its entirety.



APPENDIX A
CODE AMENDMENTS (CONT.)

SECTION A103
Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code

1. Section [A] 101.1 Title.
Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Loudon County, Tennessee” in its place.

2. Section [A] 101.2 Scope.
At the end of the first paragraph insert “The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption.
All others are excluded.

Appendix B Rates of Rainfall for Various Cities

Appendix C Vacuum Drainage System

Appendix D Degree Day and Design Temperatures

Appendix E Sizing of Water Piping System

Appendix F Structural Safety”

3. Section [A] 106.6.2 Fee Schedule.
Delete Section 106.6.2 in its entirety and insert “Fees as adopted by resolution for Loudon County,
Tennessee.”

4. Section [A] 106.6.3 Fee refunds.
Delete section 106.6.3 in its entirety including the section number and title.

5. Section 701.2 Sewer required.
Delete the words “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” and replace with “Tennessee Department
of Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection”.

6. Section 903.1 Roof extension.
Delete “[NUMBER]” and insert “twelve” in its place.
Delete “(mm)”

7. Change “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” to “requirements of the Tennessee Department
of Environment and Conservation Division of Ground Water Protection”.



APPENDIX A
CODE AMENDMENTS (CONT.)

SECTION A104
Amendments to the 2012 International Mechanical Code

1. Section [A] 101.1 Title.
Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Loudon County, Tennessee” in its place.

2. Section [A] 101.2.1 Appendices.
Insert “The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption. All others are excluded.
Appendix A Chimney Connectors Pass-Throughs”

3. Section [A] 106.5.2 Fee Schedule.
Delete Section 106.5.2 in its entirety and insert “Fees as adopted by resolution for Loudon County,
Tennessee.”

4. Section [A] 106.5.3 Fee refunds.
Delete section 106.5.3 in its entirety including the section number and title.



APPENDIX B
RECOMMENDED SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES

SECTION B101
PERMIT FEES

Total Valuation Fee

$1,000 and less No fee, unless inspection required,
in which case a $15.00 fee for each
inspection shall be charged.
$1,000 to $50,000 $15.00 for the first $1,000.00 plus
$5.00 for each additional thousand
or fraction thereof, to and
including $50,000.00.

$50,000 to $100,000 $260.00 for the first $50,000.00
plus $4.00 for each additional
thousand or fraction thereof, to and
including $100,000.00.

$100,000 to $500,000  $460.00 for the first $100,000.00
plus $3.00 for each additional
thousand or fraction thereof, to and
including $500,000.00.

$500,000 and up $1,660.00 for the first $500,000.00
plus $2.00 for each additional
thousand or fraction thereof.

SECTION B102
MOVING FEE

For the moving of any building or structure, the fee shall be
$100.

SECTION B103
DEMOLITION FEES

For the demolition of any building or structures, the fee shall
be:

$50.00
$0.50/1,000 cu f

SECTION B104
PENALTIES

0 up to 100,000 cu ft
100,000 cu ft and over

Where work for which a permit is required by this code is
started or proceeded prior to obtaining said permit, the fees
herein specified shall be doubled, but the payment of such
double fee shall not relieve any persons from fully comply-
ing with the requirements of this code in the execution of the
work nor from any other penalties prescribed herein.

SECTION B105
PLAN-CHECKING FEES

When the valuation of the proposed construction exceeds
$1,000.00 and a plan is required to be submitted by 104.2,a

_plan-checking fee shall be paid to the building official at the

time of submitting plans and specifications for checking.
Said plan-checking fee shall be equal to one-half of the build-
ing permit fee as set forth in 104.7. Such plan-checking fee is
in addition to the building permit fee.

1055



A RESOLUTION TO AMEND THE LOUDON COUNTY ZONING
RESOLUTION, SECTION 4.240 SITE PLAN REVIEW, PURSUANT TO
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED, SECTION 13-7-105

WHEREAS, the Loudon County Commission, in accordance with Chapter Seven,
Section 13-7-105 of the Tennessee Code Annotated, may from time to time amend the
number, shape, boundary, area or any regulation of or within any districts, or any other
provision of the zoning resolution; and

WHEREAS, the Regional Planning Commission has forwarded its recommendation
regarding this amendment to the Loudon County Zoning Resolution; and

WHEREAS, a notice of public hearing and a description of the resolution appeared in
the Loudon County News Herald on March 16, 2014, consistent with the provisions of
Tennessee Code Annotated Section 13-7-105;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Loudon County Commission that

Section 4.240 Site Plan Review of the Loudon County Zoning Resolution be amended as
follows:

Add Subsection 10:

10. Plans for soil borrow site operations of 1 acre or more shall include the existing
topography of the site, existing site drainage, proposed finished topography, erosion
control plans and stormwater best management practices (BMPs) planned during
site disturbance, and plans for site stabilization and revegetation.

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED, that this Resolution shall take effect immediately, the
public welfare requiring it.

ATTEST LOUDON COUNTY CHAIRMAN

DATE

APPROVED: LOUDON COUNTY MAYOR

The vote on the question of approval of this Resolution by the Planning Commission is as follows:

APPROVED: 9

DISAPPROVED: 0

ATTEST: SECRETARY, LOUDON COUNTY
REGIONAL PLANNING COMMISSION
Dated: February 18,2014

File #



( R ST {
‘ 201. 014 i
ROAD NAME LENGTH |[COUNTY OR CLASS & |BED IRIGHT OF |CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN |PAVERENT [TILE Speed Limit
WILES |STATE AID_|WIDTH TH WAY DE CE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE

Notes: Roads in Yellowood Subdivision were removed due to bec
~ set speed limits for County Roads. See note on Page 17 of Road Len,

2014 Road List

oming private roads ( Bingham Hill & Red Hill) we have added Speed Limit Approved Com
gth Change to Poplar Springs Rd.

mission is required by law to pass vote on

ROAD NAME LLE‘NT:TH COUNTY OR|CLASS & |BED RIGHT OF |CURBED LOCAYION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT | THE  |Speed Limit
T WILES ISIATEAD |[WiDTH  [WibTH WAY  [DE. L h s e REPLACE. i “Approved..
- . . . SUBDVISION oATE
HOR DR 71511905
'ABBOT RD 6.9|CO 1-26 26 50° BOIVISH THINES VALLEY 77812011 15
IADKINS ROAD 0.5|CO 4-15' 15 50° OFF STEEKEE CREEK 12/1172013
ALLEN ROAD 0.2]CO 316 18 50° DEAD END 17 BETWEEN SHAW FERRY/MUDDY CR 1012412012
[ DROVE 0.5|CO 2-19.5 19 50° SUBDIVISION TOFF AWY 3215 NEAR DAM 121312013]
ALLISON TOWN ROAD 0.6/CO 412 iF 30 DEAD-END OFF POND CREEK S OFDRY VALLEY 21412012,
'ALPINE DRIVE 0.1]CO 1-25 25 50° DEAD END EATONWOOD SUB. OFF 321 8/1472013|
AMBERLY COURT 0.2|CO 1-25" 25' 50° CURBED AMBERLY MEADOWS 12/13/2013]
Al [ 0.2]CO 1-23 23 50° CURBED DEAD _ |OFF SHAW FERRY S OF HWY 11 127112013
'ANTIOCH CHURCH ROAD E 2.7 7195 17 50 HWY 321 5 10 UNITIA ROAD 127172013 30
ANTIOCH CRURCH ROAD W 2.4|CO 1215 27 5G° DEAD END FWY 321 5 TO TELLICO LAKE - 127172013 35
APPLEBY LANE 0.2|CO 412 12 30° OFE EAST COAST TELLICO PKWY 127172013
[ASHFORD LN 0.1]CO 1_20' 20° 50° OEF PARIS DR ON BEALS CHAPEL 1211;20“13! —

10f34




ey

<

R( usT

R

2013-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTH |COUNTY OR|CLASS & l%g |RIGHT OF |CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD IsieN [PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
MILES |STATEAID |WIiDTH TH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
AVERY CIRCLE 0.7|]CO 126 26 50° CURBED “[MARTEL ROAD 127112013
AVERY STREET 0.2|CO 126 26" 50° CURBED OFF MARITEL TO AVERY CIRCLE 11114/2012
AXLEY CHAPEL ROAD 2.2[CO 317.5 17 50° NTL CAMPGROUND AT ECPWKY 111172013
B
BAILEYS ROAD 0.2|CO 2-16 16 50° OFF 95 TO AXLEY CHAPEL ROAD 127112013
BARCLAY COURT 0.1jCO 1-26 26" 500 CURBED DEAD AVALON SUBDIVISION 127112013
BARGER ROAD 0.1]CO 3-15- 16 30 DEAD END FROM WILSON RD TO DEAD END 127172013
[BARKMOOR DRIVE 0.3]CO 1-25 25 50° DEAD END OFF HWY 321 NEAR 70 8714/2013
BARRIER DRIVE 0.2|[CO 2-16" 16 50° |FROM PORT MADISON TO ENGLE RD 121172013
BAT CREEK RD 1.1jCO 3-14.6' 14.6' 50° FROM HARRISON TO DE 1112272011
BAT CREEK ROAD E 1.3|CO A7 7 50° FROM MONROE LINE TOHWY72 SO 1172212011
BAXTER BRIGHT RD 0.4{CO 50° CURBED YELLOWOOD SUBDIVISION 372172012
BEALS CHAPEL ROAD 2.8|5A 121 27 50° DE OFF MARTEL 10/25/2012
BEALS LANDING LANE 0.2]CO 1-24" 28 50" CURBED [OFF BEAL CHAPEL 10/25/2012
EELER LOOP ROAD 04[O (573 7 30 [NATIONAL CAMPGROUND ROAD 213013
ROAD N 0.8[CO vy 7 50° !_NEAR GREEN ACRES IN LOUDON 127112013,
BELL ROAD S 0.8|CO Xpd 17 50 FROM WEST LEE HWY 10 DEADEND 121112013
IBELL VIEW ROAD 0.7|CO 412 127 30 JACKSON FERRY TO PARKWAY 12]172013
DRIVE 0.2|CO 18" 26" 50 SUBDIVISION OFF OLD 85 NEAR HARRISON RD B/11/2011 25
B RD 1.9|CO 2-16.5 16 40 FROM 95 TO MEADOW RD W 12112013 20,
BIG SANDY ROAD 2.8|CO 1-20 20° 50 FORM FOSHEE RD TO COUNTY LINE 127172013
IBILL SMITH ROAD 0.4[CO 316" 20 50 DE OFF 321 NNEAR I-75 127112013
[BIRD ROAD 1.2[SA 127 25 500 RM WILLIAMS FERRY TOBUTTER 121/2013 35
BISHOP ROAD 1.1|CO 2-19" 20° 50" BONORE RD TO WATTS CEMETERY 2/112013
BLACK ROAD i[CO 316 16 50° OFF 411 NEAR MONORE CO LINE 27112013
RIDGE ROAD 0.7|CO 1-26' 26" 50° CURBED DEAD OFF BEALS CHAPEL 1171472012
= HERRON DRIVE 0.1]CO 124 24 50° CURBED DEAD LLERS NG D END 71112013
BLUE SPRINGS ROAD 3.8]SA 12T 27 50° OFF OAKLAND RD INTO ROANE CO 571072013 35
BLUE TICK LANE 0.4|CO 413 27 50" DEAD END OFF BUT TERMILK NEAR KNOXVILLE 71112013 20
BLUFFTON RD 0.2|CO 1-25 25 50° SUBDIVISION WINDRIDGE TO DE 8/172011 20
IBONA VISTA LANE 0.1]CO 12T 27 50 SUBDIVISION LITTLE MOUNTAIN ESTATES DEND 7/5(1805
@mw HOLLOW ROAD 0.8|CO 316 16 50° DE OFF PROSPECT CHURCH RD 712013
NCH ROAD 1.1|CO 413 13 30 VONORE TO WATT CEMETERY RD 11172013 35
0.1|CO 316" 16 50 |MIDWAY RD TO DAVIS DR /172011
IBRAND YWINE DRIVE 11|CO 123 23 50° CURBED/SUB %%wmnm' NEAR DIXIE LEE JUN 9/1/2011
|BRANNON ROAD 6.1|CO 4126 17 30 NN CO 71112013
B LE ROAD 1.9|SA 1-16' 25 50° HOTCHKISS VALLEY T0 E HINES VA 7112013
BRENTWOQD PLACE ROAD 0.1|CO 1-26' 26" 507 SHAW FERRY 10 DEAD END HWY 11 71172013
BREWSTER ROAD 0.1|CO 10 [F3 30 HOTCHKISS VALLEY RD EAST 212812012
GHT ROAD 22|CO 315 15 50° FROM JIM DYKE TO POND CREEK RD 71172013
(BRITTS DR 0.4|CO 1-23.5 23 50" CURBED/SUB [ROCKINGHAM SUBDIVISION 71112013
BROOK ROAD 1.6|CO 121 27 50° OFF 95 TO MEADOW RD WEST 71112013
[BROOKVIEW ROAD 0.8/CO 219 19 50° OFF SANDY SHORE FORT LO EST 2 71112013
20f34



-

Ro(" ST

o

2015-.014
ROAD NAME LENGTH|COUNTY OR|CLASS & |BED RIGHT OF |CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
MILES |STATE AID |WIDTH WIDTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
BROWDER HOLLOW ROAD 1.6[CO ISR 18 50 WY 11W 10 HARRISON RD 8/1312013
BROWDER SCHOOL ROAD 0.2|CO 1205 37 50° OFE HWY 11W AND BACK 10 HWY 11 10/2412012
BURL ANDERSON ROAD 0.2|CO 4106 0 30 OFF OAKLAND NEAR MONORE 71312013
BURNETTE CIRCLE 0.4[CO 120 20 50° OFF EAST LEE HWY AN ENGLE RD 71172013
BUSTER BLVD 0.1]CO 17 16 30 DEAD END OFF JiM CONNER OFF MARTEL RD 1171412012
[BUTTERMILK ROAD 51|5A 127 28 50° FROM OLD 95 TO KNOX CO LINE 71112013 35
BUTTERMILK ROAD W 0.5|SA 1-28 33 50" FROM 321 T0 ROANE CO LINE 71172013 35
C
C & C ROAD 0.2]CO 13 13 30 DEAD END OFF HICKORY CREEK RD 71172011
CABE ROAD 0.5/CO 119 5N 30° DE OFE MORGANTON BWT CRAIGSIFIPP 71412011
ADDY DR 0.1|CO 125 75 50° SUBDIVISION 'ROVERVIEW GOLF COURSE 71112013
LOWELL ROAD 1.3|CO 3-15' 15" 50° FROM STEEKEE AT GO LINE MONORE 71112013]  11/1/2008 25
ALLOWAY CIRCLE 0.8|CO 1-26' 26 50" CURBED OFF MARTEL 1171412012 4/25/2012
Al AY DRI 0.5]CO 126 26" 50° CURBED ESTATES 8/14/2013
CALLOWAY ROAD 2.6|CO 316 16 507 FROM WEST LEE HWY 10 FORK CR 774/2013] 117172010 35
' CAMERON LANE 0.1]CO 127 27 50° CURBED DEAD OAKWOOD ESTATES 10 DEAD END 8/112013!
[CARDINAL VIEW COURT 0.1jCO 1-26° 26" 50° CURBED DEAD AVALON SUBD 8172013
[CARPENTER LOOP 11|CO 4-125 17 30° OFF P NEAR NTL CAMPGROUND 9/1/2013
CARTER DRIVE OFF ROBINSON SPRINGS TO CITY LIMITS 97172013
CARTER ROAD 0.4]CO 249 19 50 OFF BIG HILL RD OFF HWY 95 97112013
ICARTER' S CHAPEL ROAD 1.3|5A 119" 23 50" HINE VALLEY TO HWY 70 10 PAW 8/20/2011 35
WEL CHAPEL ROAD 1.5[CO 218 18 50° Hi AL EAR WHEAT 8/20/2011
0.1|CO 122 27 50 SUBDIVISION OARWOOD ESTATES TO DEAD END 9/112013
ﬁ%mv COURT 0.25{CO 1-23.5' 235 50 CURBED/SUB OFF HWY70 10/1/2013
MAN' WE 0.2|CO 1-25° 25 50° OFF RAWHIDE TRAIL INN FORTY EST 1111472012
CECIL DRIVE 0.5|CO 124 24" 50° OFE WILLIAMSON DR IN INDUS TRIAL 10/112013].
CEDAR CIRCLE 0.6]CO 125 75 50 CURBED SUBDIV |OFF MARTEL CEDAR HILLS SUBD 21112013
[CEMETERY ROAD 0.4|CO 316 16 50° OFF STEEKEE RD 107112013 25
CHELSEA CIRCLE 0.1[CO 125 25 50° TURBED DEAD _JAVALON SUBD _ 10/1/2013
NNE BLVD 0.4|CO 1-24' 24" 50° CURBED/SUB OFF HWY70 10124/2012
ICHILI LANE 0.1|CO oy & 50" OFF POPLAR SPRINGS RD NEAR DAV 92011
CHRISMAN ROAD 0.2|CO 125 25 50° TIEATH PARK 1072412012
CIRC 0.4[CO 1-24" 24 50° OFF SIE A 10/1/2013
CLAR 0.4|CO 218 23 50° PRI HARRISON RD 7/5/1905)
CLAY HOLLOW ROAD 1.1jCO 316.6 16 50° FROM BLUE SPRINGS 10 ROANE CO B/112011 30
[CLEAR BRANCH ROAD N 0.5|CO 7 7 50° OFF 725 A FROM GET GOOD 10/1/2013
'CLEAR BRANCH ROAD S 0.3]CO 13 13 300 OFF 72 SOUTH 37172013
[CLEAR COVE COURT___ 0.1]CO 124 24" 50° GURBED DEAD OFE LAKE CREST RD 37112013
[CLINGHVIEW DRIVE 0.1/CO 120° 20 500 OFF HWY 321 N NEAR 140 212011
EL’O’YD" S CREEK ROAD 0.2 315 & 30 [¢] RD YOER 3712013
04|CO 124 28 50° CURBED EROM HUFES FERRY N 10 DEAD END 3112013} 25
—m_RIVE 1.2|CO 1-20° 20 50 C D OFF HINES VALLEY _ 11/8/2011 6/1/2011 20
CONKINNON DRIVE 13|CO 124 24 50 CURBED CONKINNON SUBDIVISION 37112013

30f34




R ust

o,

Mo

{
2013-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTH|COUNTY OR[CLASS & |BED 4&6}«1’ OF |[CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TLE Speed Limit
) MILES |STATE AID |WiDTH WIDTH WAY DE REPLAGE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE

CONNATSER RD 0.1|CO 4116 17 36 PFF EAST COAST TELLICO PKWY 8/112013

COOK DRIVE 0.3|CO 415 15 50° FROM STEEKEE SCHOOL RD 8/112013

COPE ROAD 0.2|]CO 3-14’ 14’ 30° OFF 411 NEAR SHULTZ LN (GB) 8/1/2013

CORDOVA LANE 0.1]CO 126 37 50° CURBED-SUBDIV _|CORDOVA SUBD OFF OLD 95 8/1/2013

CORINTH CHURCH ROAD 1.5]CO 3-16' g 50' FROM CALLOWAY TO STEEKEE 8/172013 30
CORINTH ROAD 1.4|SA 1-20' 16’ SO’ STEEKEE RD TO STEEKEE SCHOOLD 9/1/2013 25
CORNEITT ROAD 0.4|CO 316 22 50 OFF HOTCHKISS VALLEY N HAPPY H 2/2812012

COULTER SHOALS CIRCLE 0.7|CO 219 19 50° OFF LAKELAND DR NEAR KNOX 10/25/2012

COUNTY RD 298 6.2|co 2-16.3' 16.3" 50° OFF ERIE INTO MONORE CO BLUE SPRINGS 2/2812012

'COVE VIEW LANE 0.1|CO 1-23 23 50" CURBED OFF POINT HARBOR DR BEALS CH 9/1/2013)

COVENANT CIRCLE 0.4]CO 1-24' 24 50° CURBED OFF HWY 11E 9112011

COX ROAD 0.2|CO 317 17 50 FROM E LEE HWY 10 WEBB DR §/112013

COYTEE ROAD 13|CO 218 18 50 DEADEND OFF AXLEY CHAPEL TO DEAD END 9172013

[CRAIGS CHAPEL RD 2.1]CO 4126 126 30° HWY 70 E TODE 97172013

[CRANFIELD IANE 0.1]CO 315 is 50° CURBED DEADENO|OFF 70 E NEAR SMITH VALLEY RD 1072412012]

'CREEKWOOD COURT 0.1[CO 124 28 50" OFF RIVER POINT DR 67172013

[CRESCENT DRIVE 0.2|CO 215 i 50 [FROM E LEE HWY TO DAILEY AVE 8112013

[CRESS LANE 0.3]CO 317 1 50' DEADEND OFF MARTEL RD 1171412012

CRESTVIEW CIRCLE 0.6/CO 125 25 50 CURBED 'Ju_mmm 81412013

ICRES T VIEW DRIVE 6.1|CO 2-18° 18 50 OFF FORD RD_ 871412013

[CROCK ROAD 0.9|CO 316 25 50° OFF LOUDON RIDGE TO SUGARLIMB 72011

[CRUZE ROAD 0.9[CO 1-27 2Z SO DEADEND OFF ANTIOCH CHURCH E 9/1/2013)

[CUDDIE LANE 0.1jCO AT 17 50° OFF WEBS DRIVE 8/1/2013

'CUSICK CIRCLE 0.6/CO 2-19 217 50° OFF 11 NEAR OLD STAGE/JUNCTION 1072412012 211512012

[CUSICK LANE 0.1]CO 29 2T 50° DEADEND OFF CUSICK CIRCLE 1072472012

3 - 6/172013

IDAILEY AVE 1,i[CO 316 16 30° [FROM BLAIR BEND DR 10 WEBB DR 7112011

DAIRY LANE 0.3|CO 124" 30 50° CURBED OFF MUDDY CREEK (SILO ACRES) 8/14/2013

IDAVIS DAIRY ROAD 0.3[CO 1-26' 26 50 OFF SU ED SPRINGS 9172013

'DAVIS DRIVE 0.1[CO a4 14 30 NEXT TO MIDWAY 10/172011

IDAVIS FERRY ROAD 28|SA 2T G 50 FROM VONORE RD TO PKWY 32aR012| 35
DAVIS LANE 0.9|CO 2-18 30 50° DEADEND OFF BUTTERMILK N OF 140 10/11/2011

IDAVIS RIDGE RD 0.4|co 414 16 50° BROWDER SCHOOL TO LOUDON RID 8172013
[DAWSON ROAD o.?ﬁco 315 15 50 F D INTO ROANE CO' 8/172013 30
DEADEND ROAD 0.5[CO 314" 14 50° iND B S 912013,

DEATON ROAD 0.3|CO 313 13 30° OFFBEALSCHAPELRD 10/25/2012

DEEP COVE LN 0.1]CO 4-12 12 30° REST CAMP RD TO DE 7112011

IDEERFIELD COURT 0.1|CO 1-26 26 50" DEADEND [AVALON 81172013

'DEERFIELD LANE 0.5[CO 126 26 50° CURBED DEADENC|OFF NORTHSHORE DR 10 KNOX 1272112011

'DERBY CHASE DRIVE 0.1GO 127 77 55 E 7112013

DEVYN LN 0.1jcCO 1-23' 23 50' HOLLAND TRAIL TO DE 8/12/2013

DEWITT DRIVE 0.4/CO 315 16 30° DEADEND OFF FORD RD 7RRG13

DIXIE LEE CIRCLE 0.7/CO RET4 b74 50° OFF WHEELER DR NEAR JUNCTION 71172013

4 of 34




{ Ro{ ST
B 2013-.014
ROAD NAME LENGTH|COUNTY OR[CLASS & IBED RIGHT OF _|CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT Speed Limit
WILES |STATE AID |WIDTH WIDTH WAY DE REPLAGE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
DIXIE LEE LANE 0.1]CO 129 75 50° DEADEND OFF WHEELER DR NEAR JUNCTION 7112013
DIXIE MEADOWS DR 0.1|CO 126 26 50° CURBED/SUB HARRISON LN 1O DE 8172011
DIXON ROAD 0.7|CO 122 27 50 OEE OLD STAGE RD -KNOX CO 10/25/2012
DOGWOOD LANE 0.1]CO 3_16 20 50° DEADEND OFE MIMOSA ST OFF FORD RD 71412013
DOGWOOD LANE E 0.1]CO 1-28° 24 50° CURBED DEADENC |FROM OAKWOOD EST T0 DEADEND 61172013
DONALDSON LIGHT LANE 0.2[CO 4135 i3 30 DEADEND OFF ANTIOCH CH RD E NI ALEXANDER 6172013
DONNA DRIVE 0.4[CO 316 23 50° DE OFF HICKORY CREEK RD 77372011
DOTSON HILL ROAD 0.3[CO 410 10 30 FROM AXLEY CHAPEL 10 DEADEND 67172013
DOTSON ROAD 0.3|CO 4105 10 20° WAPLE ST AND TRIGONIA 612013
IDOWNING COURT 0.1]CO 126 26 507 CURBED DEADEND]AVALON 5112013
DRIFTWOOD COURT 0.1JCO 124 24 50 CURBED DEADEND|MILLERS LANDING TO DEAD END 5172013
DRY BRANCH ROAD 0.3|CO 412 [F3 30 OFF POND CREEK RD NEAR 175 5/1/2013
DRY RIDGE ROAD 17|cO 413 13 30" FROM DRY VALLEY 10 ROBERSON S 5172013
VALLEY ROAD 2.4|SA 121 27 50° OFF POND CREEK RD 21122012 30
DUGGAN ROAD 0.1|CO AT T 30° DEADEND FROM HARMON 10 DEADEND 811412013}
DUNCAN ROAD 06 i3 i3 70 OLD MIDWAYTO MUDDY CREEK 70/25/2012
[DUNRIDGE LN 5.1|CO 127 27 50° OFF BLAI 111412012,
'DUNSMORE ROAD 3.3[CO 13 7 30 DEADEND OFF CARDWELL CHAPEL 922011 25
DUTTON ROAD T3|CO 219 25 Eij OLD KINGSTON T0 PINEGROVE/PROV 512013 127112011
BT et 5172013,
EAST COAST TELLICO PKWY 6.1]0A 1249 2% 50 FTWY 411 TO AXLEY CHAPEL 1272812011 45
[EAST COVE DR 0.1]CO 218 18 50 ON FROM NORTHSHORE 10 DE 5172013
EASTER DRIVE 0.2|CO 316 16 50° BETWEEN VONORE AND SIMPSON 5112013
[EASTER RIDGE ROAD 0.3[¢0 A7 20 50° OFFE LAKEVIEW NEAR MARTEL 111412012 2012
EBLEN LN 0.1jCO 1-24° 24 50 TRADES DRIVE HARRISON HILLS 71611905
El ROAD 0.2/CO 413 ¥73 30 ROM DUTTON TO OLD KINGSTON 871412013 25
ECHO HOLLOW ROAD 0.4]CO 7-18 i 50 FROM WIHITE WING TO WILLANS F__ 8/A2011]  4/26/2012
IEDGE LANE 0.1]CO 410 10 30° DEADEND FROM JACKSON BEND 52013
EDITH LANE 0.5/CO 315 20 50° HINES VALLE ON FOREST 8112011 25
FIGOL ROAD 0.5[CO 315 5 50 DE OFF JIM DYKE W OF PROSPECT /112013
[EL CAMING LANE 0.4|CO 122 7 50 GEADEND OFF WAT] RD N OF 140 6112013
[ELEVEN ESTATESDR 0.1jCO 718 g 50° A R CIRCLE T0/24/2012]
[ELIZABETH WAY 0.21CO 1-22 27 50° SUBDIVISION DE__|OFF CRUZE RD.10 DEADEND BI/2011
[ELLIS ROAD 0.3|CO 219" 19 50 EROM OLD 95 10 OUTER DRIVE 712212613
ENGLE ROAD 0.4[CO 219 19 50° E LEE HIGHWAY 10 DEAD END 1012412012
1 26|CO 2-18° 18 50° FO A TO MANTOO 9/1/2011
ESSEX COURT 0.1]CO 11 EES 30 SUBDIVISION AVALON 8172013
ESTES ROAD 14|CO 218 23 50° ROM PINE VE/PROV 10 CO LI 61112013 30
[EVERGREEN CIRCLE 0.2|CO 219 2% 50° OFF RODNEY RD NEAR SCENIC DR 117112013
R 1172013
IFAIRVIEW DRIVE _ 0.1]CO 316 18 50° DEADEND EROM FORD RD TO DEADEND 117172013
FAIRVIEW ROAD 17|CO 1-20.5 20" 50" OFF HWY 321 S 11/1/2013 35
IFAIRWAY DRIVE 0.2|CO 124 30 50° CURBED OFF HUFFS FERRY IN RIVERVIEW SUB 7372011

50f 34




P
ra

(

LIST

: 20.5-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTH[COUNTY OR|CLASS & IBED [RIGHT OF [CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT Speed Limit
MILES |STATE AID [WIDTH WIDTH _ |WAY DE t:REPLA: LACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
FALCON FIRE 0.1jco 1-3¢° 30° 50° CURBED AVALON 97112013
FIPPS [N 0.6/CO 3-15" 15' 50° DE OFF MORGANTON TO DE 97172013
FISHER LANE ~ 1.8|CO 3155 15 30 AXLEY CHAPEL TO GLENDALE 97112013
FLATWOODS ROAD 1.8[CO 4-12 12 30 FROM HOLT TO NEW HOPE ERIE 8/1/2011
FOGHILL LN 0.2]CO 122 27 50 DE HWY 321 N 1O DE /112013
FOOTHILLS RD 0.4|CO 130° 30 50° OLD 95 TO DE LITILE MNT ESTATES 712212013 35
FORD ROAD 1.7]SA 1-20° 20' 50" OFF HWY 11E TO HWY 70 117112011
FORE DRIVE 0.1jCO 1-24 30 50° CURBED IVERVI LF SUBDIVISION 10/1/2013
FOREST HEIGHTS CIRCLE 1|co 219 27 50° OFF MUDDY CREEK 10/25/2012,
[FOREST HILLS DRIVE 0.1jCO 120 20° 50° FROM FOREST HEIGHTS CIRCLE TO E 10/25/2012
FORK CREEK ROAD 3|3A 219 G 50 WEST LEE HWY TO STEEKEE 37712012 35130
FORK ROAD 0.1]CO 316.5° i 30° MEADOW W TO BLOUNT CO LINE 107172013
FOSHEE ROAD 15|CO 316 16 50 BIG SANDY TO STOCKTON VALLEY 10/1/2013
FOSTER DRIVE 0.4[CO 1-26' 26 50 CURBED OFF MARTEL (MARTEL ESTATES £) 1114212012
FOSTER ROAD 12jC0O 219 75 50° LOUDON RIDGE TO BROWDER HOLLOW 10/1/2013
FOUNTAIN HEAD COURT 0.1[CO 1-26 26 50° CURBED DEAD __ |AVALON 10/1/2013
FOUTE TOWN ROAD 0.2/CO RER 18 50 DEADEND OFF MARTEL NEXT 10 CEMETERY 107172013
FOX HUNTER ROAD 0.4]CO 37 27 50° DEADEND OFF BEALS CHAPEL 7O DEADEND 10/251112
FRANKLIN ESTATES LN 0.4]CO 125 25 50° BACK 1272672011 25
LFRTEW 1P ROAD 0.5[CO 218 73 50 OFF 321 NTO HWY 70 17262012
[FRIENDSVILLE ROAD 2.5]CO 217 7 507 3215 70 BIG HILL RD 10/172013 25
R 10/1/2013
[GALLARER ROAD AT T big DE BIG SANDY 70 DE 10/1/2013
GALYON DRIVE =K} 13 30 HWY 11 10 BROWDER SCHOOL RD 10/24/2012
GALYON ROAD 412 1z 30° POND CREEK NEAR DRY VALLEY 10/27/2013
GAP ROAD 3A7 27 50° OFF CORNETT 1/10/2012
GARNETT HILL DR 2-16' 16 50 CURBED/SUB Hwy 11 E o Deadend 9/1/2013
GASTON ROAD [EES 7 30 TEROM CORNETT RD /2815012
GENTRY DRIVE 3-16' 16" 30° FROM RAUSIN TO STEEKEE CREEK 127212011
'GENTRY ROAD 316" 6 30 OFF HINES VALLEY to DEADEND 9/1/2013
[GET GOOD HOLLOW ROAD A7 7 50° OFF SIEEKEE TOHWY 725 5/112013 2009 35
ROAD 417 17 50° WASHINGTON PIKE 70 DE 12/2/2011
GIFFIN CIRCLE 125 25 50° OFF MATLOCK BEND EAST 9/172013
(GILBERT LANE 3145 145 30 DEAD END OFF UNITIA RD a/172011
GILES ROAD 2-18.5, 18 ~156° OFF TINNEL NEAR HIGHLAND PARK 10/24/2012
DRIVE _ 124 FZ} 50° CURD-DE OFF CONN KINION PT OFF PARRIS 8/172013
GLENDALE COMMUNITY RD 37 7 50 OFF 95 NEAR HWY 321 INERSECTION 9/1/2013
[GRANDVIEW DRIVE (LC) 1-26' 26" 50° CURB OFF MARTEL IN MARTEL SUBDIVI. 9/1/2013
DRIVE (LO) =73 & 30° GETGOOD HOLLOW 8/1/2013 2009 25
DRIVE 123 23 50° STEEKEE CREEK 10 GRIMES 8/172011
[GRIFFITS KEEP COURT 123 75 50° CURBED E COAST PKWY TO DEADEND 971/2013
GRIMES ROAD 3T 7 50 UB HCH 9/1/2013] 11/1/2010 35
GRUBB LANE [RTy 20 30 OFF OVERLOOK NEAR OLD 95 1272712011
60of 34
) J J



-

1

Ro{ ST

Lt

2015-.u14
ROAD NAME LENGTH |COUNTY OR|CLASS & |BED ‘msm OF |CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
WILES |STATE AID |WIDTH WIDTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE

GRUBB ROAD 0.8|CO 414 20 50° BUTTERMILK TO WOODLAWN 8172013 2013
GRYDER LANE 0.6/CO 219 17 50° OFF MEADOW W BT FORK/ISHEETS H 41172013
GUNTER DR 0.05|CO 2-16' 16 50 CURBED/SUB Gamet Hill to Deadend 41112013
H 41172013
HACKNEY CHAPEL ROAD 0.7|5A 4135 135 30 EROM ANTIOCH E TO VINEYARD 21372013 20
HALL ROAD 1|CO 127 29 50° PINE GROVE/PROV 10 ROANE CO 8172011 12712011 25
HALL STREET 0.7)CO 316 16 50° FROM HWY 11E TO HIGHLAND PARK 71112013
HAMMONTREE LANE 0.3|CO =y T 30 OFF BROOKRD 71112013
[HAPPY HOLLOW ROAD 2.7|5A 347 78 50 FROM OLD 95 10 HOTCHKISS VAL 712212013 2013 30
HARBOR POINT COURT 0.1|CO 124 2% 50 CURB-DE LAKECREST DR 10 DE miLLERS LAN 71172013
'HARBOUR PLACE 0.1|CO 123 23 50° CURB-DE POINT HARBOR SUBDIVISION 71172013,
THARBOUR VIEW DRIVE 0.7[CO 125 28" 50° CURB OFF BEALS CHAPEL 71112013
HARDIN DRIVE 0.4|CO 298 27 50 HARDIN ESTATES OFF MARTEL 1171472012
IFARMON LANE 0.2[CO 1207 25 50° DEADEND OFF 321N Q2412012 20
FHARRIS ROAD 15[CO A7 7 55 POND CREER 70 WASHINGTON PK /172013
[HARRISON BEND jco 2179 7.8 50° W EORT HILL T0 DE 62013 30
FARRISON CEMETERY 0.4]CO 210 10 3¢ HARRISONRD &71/2013,
IHARRISON LANE 1)CO 314 19 50" OFEE HWY 70 & 11 10 JUNCTION 7112011
HARRI RD 0.5/CO 315 i5 30 FR N LN TO KNOX LINE 1012412012
W%ﬁom 2.4|CO 344 27 50 OFF 85 1271212011
HARVEY RD__ 0.2|CO 314" 27 50° OFF NORTHSHORE DR TO KNOX 10/25/2012

TLEY DRIVE 0.3|C0O IXEN i5 30 DEADEND FROM AWY 11 10 DEAD END 10/2412012
RATIERAS CR 0.5|CO 1-23.8' 238 50 CURB/SUB ROCKINGHAM SUBDIVISION 87112013
[HEAPE RD 0.2|CO 10 10 30 SIMPSON 10 DE 8/1/2013
HEATHER LANE 8.1]CO 120 ¥73 50 DEADEND OFF SIMPSON RD /011800
[HEATON ROAD 0.3|]CO 13 i3 30 DE NTL CAMPGROUND 10 DEADEND 8112013
HEWINS ROAD 0.3]CO 312 15 30 OE Y NEAR SIM E 1072512012
'HICKORY CREEK ROAD 2.6|5A 121 28 507 OFF HWY/0 71172011 12/1/201135-30-15
[HICKORY VALLEY ROAD 0.4|CO 120 70 50° FROM 321 S T0 UNITIA RD 8/1/2011
'HIDDEN OAKS DR 0.3|CO 1-24' 24" 50 OFF LENORE DR 8/14/2013
(RIDDEN VALLEY LANE 0.1jCO 316 20 50° DE F RD 8720136
[HIDDEN VALLEY ROAD 0.1|]CO 316 20 50° OEF TOWN CREEK ON FORD RD 81172013
AIGHLAND AVENUE 0.8{CO 412 12 30° STEEKKRD /112011
[HIGHLAND PARK DRIVE 0.4|CO 123 23 50 321 TO AWY 11 8112011
HILLSBOROUGH LANE 0.2|CO 122 27 50 F T END 10/25/2012
AILLTOP DR 0.5/CO 124 24 50° OFE HWY 11 NEAR LENOIR CITY 6112011
[HINES VALLEY ROAD 5.9|SA 126 3 50 OFF AWY 70 112013 3045
[HIRST CIRGLE 0.7/|CO 124 23 50 CURBED 'MAFLON PLACE SUBDIVISION 10/24/2012
HOFEMAN DRIVE 0.2|CO =5y 7 OFF OUTER DR 10 ELLIS 772212013
HOFFMAN LANE 0.1]CO 411 T 30 OFF SNODDERLY 712212013

UE 0.2|[CO 122 30 50 ACROSS FROM FRIENDSHIP/321 712212013 25-35

HOLLAND TRAIL - 0.7|CO 219" 23 50° SUBDIVISION HARDIN ESTATE 10725/2012,
HOLT ROAD 0.6|]CO AT T 50° OFEE STOCKTON VALLEY 10 OAKLA 57172011 2009

7of34




pu
( R( usT (
i 2015-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTH [COUNTY OR[CLASS & [BED 1[@Gm’or: CURBED [LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMIENT |TILE Speed Limit
MILES ATE AID |WIDTH WiDTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
HOPE CREEK ROAD 0.8]CO 316 16 50 DE OFF BUTTERMILK NEAR DAVIS LN 97112011 25
HOTCHKISS VALLEY LANE 0.2|]CO 1-25' 30° 50° DE NEAR SUGAR LIMB RD BI14/2013
HOTCHKISS VALLEY ROAD E 46[SA 120 33 50° FROM OLD 95 TO PINE GROVE/IPROV 712272013 4126/2012] 12/1/2011
HOTCHKISS VALLEY ROAD W 17]cO 120 29" 50" SOUTH SIDE OF INTERSTATE 8/13/2013 45
HOUKROAD 0.2|CO 49 20° 50° DE OFF HINES VALLEY §7172011
HUBBARD ROAD 1.8|CO 316 36 50 DE LOUDON RIDGE RD 9/1/2013
HUFFS FERRY ROAD N 18|CO 1-20° 35 50 HOTCHKISS VALLEY TO RIVER 9/172013, 35
HUGHES ROAD 0.2|co 1-20' 20' 50° FROM APPLEBY RD TO DE 97172013
HUNTSVILLE HOLLOW ROAD 1.1]CO 216 27 30 OFF HWY 11 NEAR W LENOIR CITY 97172011
HUTTON ROAD 0.6{CO 315 15 30° OFF 95 S NEAR 411 9/172013
[ 9/1/2013
INDEPENDENCE LANE 0.1]CO 17 14 30 TNTARTEL RD TO DEADEND 8772011
INTERSTATE LANE 0.6{CO 3-16' 26" 50" DE ACROSS FROM HOTCHKISS V WEST 8/13/2013
TRENE LANE 0.3]CO 1-24 24 50" lﬁﬁ'ﬁm RD 10 DEAD END 7/172013)
! 7112013
| JACKSON BEND ROAD 1.5|CO 2995 iEd 50 OFF 321 S NEAR DAM 71472013 2011
JACKSON CEMETERY ROAD 0.4|CO 28 18 50° PWKY 10 DEAD END 6/12013
JACKSON FERRY ROAD 16[CO 316.5 16 50° FROM 955 OF NTL CAMPGR T0 PKY 6/1/2013 25
0.5/CO 310 0 30 DEAD END NEAR NT ZION GCHURCH 6/1/2013 2009 15
0.3]CO 1-26' 26 50’ CURB -DE OFF AVERY CR 11/12/2012
0.5|CO 124" 24 507 SUBDIVISION RY VALLEY TO DEADEND 117172013
0.2|CO 127 27 50' CURB OFF MISTY RIDGE OFF VIRTUE 1171412012
0.2|CO 17 16 30° DE OFF MARTEL BETWEEN AVERY/HAR 1111472012
15|CO A7 7 50 PROSPECT CH 10 STOCKTON VAL 117172013
0.1]1-23 23 50 50° R ] T 117112013
0.3|SA 316 16 50° [BLUE SPRINGS TO ROANE CO 8172011
1|CO 247 17 50° 321 TO ROANE CO LINE 8/1/2013 2013 30
0.1/CO 218 5 50 FROM DERBY CHASE TO DEADEND 97172013
0.1]CO EXEN iEs 30° LEE HI ST TO DE 71172013
0.4|CO 412 12 30" DEADEND OFF BIRD RD 77172013
8/1/2013
0.3]CO 210 10 20° DE OFF UNITIA RD 87172011
0.3[CO 12 17 20° DE OFF LAKELAND DR NEAR SUBDIVIS 10/25/2012
0.2|]CO 4105 15 307 OFF BROOK RD E OF HAMMONT REE 8/1/2013
0.1{CO 18 iy 30 OFF NEWJTON RD 87172011
0.3]CO 1-24° 24" 507 CURBED FROM HWY 11 TO DEAD END 1172172011 ]
0.7]CO 12 [F3 30° TO DEADEND &/1/2011] 4/26/2012 20
0.1[CO 1-27 27 50° CURBED IAVALON aM172011
0.8{CO 315 15 50" NTL CAMPROUND TO BELLVIEW 87172012
0.1[CO 316 16 50° OFF 411 TO RUDD RD 97172013
(KISER LANE 0.3|CO 315 15 50" DE RD 10 DE 117172013
IKISER ROAD (LO) 11|CO 3-15' 15 50° FROM REED SPRINGS 10O RAUSIN 117172013
8of 34



( RO{ ST (
2015-.V14
ROAD NAME LENGTH JCOUNTY OR|CLASS & ’BED RIGHT OF _|CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT |TILE Speed Limit
WILES |[STATE AID |WIDTH WiDTH WAY DE L ACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
KISER STATION ROAD (GB) 0.8|/CO 3-15' 15’ 50° FROM UNITA TO SR321 BI1/2011
KYKER RD 0.1|/CO 12 127 30 411 TODE 170/1900
L 11/1/2013
LAKE COVE ROAD 0.3|CO 124" 24 50 CURBED OFF MILLER RD 117172013
. [TAKE CREST DRIVE 1|CO 124 24 50° CURBED OFF RIVER POINT DR 17171900
LAKE DRIVE 0.7|CO 219 19 50° DE OFF MATLOCK BEND E 1271212011 25
[AKE FOREST DRIVE 0.2|CO 121 27 50 DE OFF LAKELAND 111172013
[AKE HARBOUR DRIVE 0.4{CO 124" 24 B E CURB-DE OFF LAKE CREST (MILLERS LAND) 117172013
LAKE POINT DRIVE 0.1JCO 2-18 18 50° CURB -DE OFE WILKERSON OFF PALMER 101252012
[AKE VISTA 0.1[co 2-18' 18’ 50° FOOTHILLS POINT 117172013
LAKELAND DRIVE 2.7|SA 120 27 507 OFF BEALS CHAPEL 10 KNOX CO 10/25/2012
LAKELAND FARMS ROAD 0.4|CO 12 i3 30° DE E OF LAKE FOREST DRIVE 70/25/2012
LAKESIDE DRIVE T4|CO 218 18 50° OFF BEALS CHAPEL 10 PHELPS RD 1072512012,
LAKEVIEW ROAD 17[CO 1-23 23 50 MARTEL T0 BEALS CHAPEL 117172013
TAKEWOOD DRIVE 0.6/CO 316" 16 500 DE OFF MATLOCK BEND E 12/1212011
LANE ROAD 0.2[CO 316 7 30° DE OFF 11 NEAR FORD RD 127812011
LARUE ROAD 0.1|CO 316 7 30 E LEE HWY TO BURNETT CR 10/24/2012
TAURA LANE 0.1jCO 4135 13 30 OFF UNITIA NEAR BLOUNT &172011
LEE HI LANE 0.1JCO 218 27 50° OFF 11 E OF HALL 51 10 DEADEND 117172013
LEE HI STREET . 0.2|CO 315 15 50° HWY 11E 10 DE 77172011
LEE SHIRLEY ROAD o.z}co 1-20° 20 50" FROM TRIGONIA 10 BLOUNT 27212012
ILEEPER PARKWAY 0.2|CO 1-26' 26 50° CURB 7110 AVERY ST 10/2472012
LEEPERS FERRY ROAD 0.5|CO 123 73 50° OFF ROAX NEAR BLOUNT 117172013 25
LENNOX COURT 6.1|CO 126" 26 50° CURB -DE AVALON 117172013
LENORE DRIVE 0.1jCO 1-26' 26 50° CURB FORT LOUDON ESTATES 81372013
LEONA DRIVE - 0.3|CO 1-21.5 27 50° SUBICURBIDE _|OFF SCENIC DR NEAR DAM 321 S 117172013
LETTERMAN ROAD 0.1]CO [XTY 26 500 FWY 70 NEAR 175 OVERPASS 1072472012
[LINDER LANE 0.1JCO 124 24 50" CURB-DE OFE AWY 70 NEAR MUDDY CREEK 1012412012
LINGENFELTER LANE 0.1|CO 1-20° 20" 50° CURB -DE OFF PINECREST 10 DEADEND 1072472012
LITTLE MOUNTAIN LANE 0.5/CO 1-26' 26 500 1DE ATES 11172013
LITILE SHUBERT ROAD 0.1JCO A EEN 30 DE OFF JiM DYKE 117172013
LI TLE VALLEY ROAD 1.8|CO 3A7 7 50° SPRI N/DAVIS FER 117/172013] 2013
LI TLETON DR 0.2 316 6 50 DE 725 T0 DEADEND 12112013
LLOYD LN 0.1[CO 124" 25 50 A 12112013
[TONG COVE COURT 0.3]CO 124 24 507 CURB -DE OFF LAKE COVE RD 127172013
LONG ROAD 0.2|]CO 31 16 507 OFF HACKNEY CHAPEL 127172013
LOU GODDARD LANE 0.3|]CO 317.5 18 50° FORM TARWATER 10 BLOUNT CO 1112212011 2011 30
' OUDON RIDGE ROAD 28|SA 219 3T 50° OFE SUGARLIMBI HARRISON RD 712212013
LUCY LANE 0.1|CO 4136 13 30 OFF NICHOLS RD 127172013}
LYNN ROAD 13[CO 316 16" 507 OFE STOCKTON VALLEY 8i12011] 81172011 25|
LYNN WOOD DRIVE 0.7[CO 120 20 50 TN TRIGONIA TO LEE SHIRLEY RD 21212012 30
.. 121112013]
[MALONE ROAD (LC) 0.9/5A 347 T 50° OFF HINES VALLEY BI172011] 30

90of 34




. o
- §usT (
20.3-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTHJCOUNTY OR[CLASS & [BED 'mem OF [CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
MILES |STATEAID |WIDTH WIDTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
. SUBDIVISION DATE
MALONE ROAD (LO) 1.2|SA 316 16 50° HWY 725 TO WATKINS 97112013 2009 25
MANIS ROAD 0.6[CO 3155 7 50° OFF 321 BETWEEN EATONS & 140 10/1/2013 2011
MAPLE HILL ROAD 14|SA 1-20° 20° 50 OFF DAVIS FERRY RD 107172013 35
MAPLE HILLS LANE 0.4]CO 1-24° 24 50° CURBED |MAPLE HILL HEIGHTS SUBDIVISION 10/172013
0.1jCO 124 24 50° CURB -DE MARTELJOAKWOOD ESTATES 10/4/2013
1.3[SA 124 2 50° OFF 72N 107172013 30
1[CO 2-20° 20 50° FROM WADE RD T0 MONORE GO 10/1/2613]  11/1/2009
42[SA 127 27 50° FROM 11 E NEAR 321 TO KNOX CO 171012012 71311805
0.4]CO 493 13 30° DE OFF BEALS CHAPEL Nt LAKELAND 10/25/2012
47|CO 37 7 50° DE FROM 72 AT TN RIVER 9/1/2013 2012]  12/8/2011 20
18[CO 316 16' 50° |FROM RIVER RD TO CORPRATE PARK 12/12/2011
0.6]CO 3T 19 50° WILLLIAMS FERRY TO ECHO HOLLOW 12/172013]
0.25|CO 490 10 307 FROM RIVER RD TO CORPRATE PARK 121172013
0.3[CO 4145 16 DE 2ND LEFT K 1211720 13' 20
0.8[CO 417 14 30° OFF 72 S NEAR VILLIAGE 12/1/2013 25
0.2|CO 316 20° 50° DE OFF FORD RD NEAR MIMOSA 127172013
0.8[CO 315 15 30 ILES FERRY TO TRIGONIA 2272012 20
0.1]CO 1-24' 24 50" AMBERLY MEADOWS 12/1/2013
0.7|CO 315 15 30° OFF PKWY NEAR COYTEE 2/112013
0.3|CO 1-26' 26 50° CURBED FROM CRESTVIEW CR MARTEL SUB 81372013
2.6[SA 3205 20° 50° OFF MEADOW W TO BLOUNT CO 2/1/2013 2013 30
2.7|5A 2-19.5 19 50° HWY 321 S AT BLOUNT CO LINE 2/172013]  5/30/2012 30
0.6]CO 219" 19 50 OFF 70 TO HINES VALLEY 8172011
0.1/CO 1-23 23 50' CURBEDISUBDIV_ |VINEYARD COVE SUBDIVISION 87172011
0.8/CO 37 19 50° OFF 11 5 OF JUNCTION 8/1/2011
0.3]CO 124 24 50° D OFF BEALS CHAPEL 7O LAKELAND 8172011
0.3CO 124 24 50° CURBED __ |OFF STEEKEE RD NEAR FORK CREEK 82011
0.1jCQO 316 20° 50° DE OFF FORD RD 27172013
0.3jCO 1-27 27 50° CURBED OFF VIRTUE E OF MUDDY CREEK 11/14/2012
0.3]CO 1-24' 24 50° CURBED OFF VIRTUE E OF MUDDY CREEK 1171472012
3 02|CO 124" 3 50° CURBED OFF RIVERVIEW DR NEAR HUFF FERRY 1171472012
MOATSWELL RD 02|co 315 15' 30° STEEKEE CREEK TO MONORE 2/1/2013
T 0.2[CO 3-15° 15' 30' SUBDIVISION UTILE MOUNTAIN ESTATES DEND 712212013
MONTEICELLO DRIVE 0.1jCO 124 24 50° FOOTHILLS RD 1O DEADEND 712212013
homv DRIVE 0.3]CO 124 24" 50° 15T LEFT OFF CORPORATE PARK 107172013
MONTOOTH ROAD 0.5|CO 3156 16" 50° FROM OAKLAND BACK TO ERIE 10/1/2013
ROAD 0.7]CO 125" 25 50° OFF 321 N NEAR MANIS 771712013 35
STREET 0.1jCO 417 17 20 OFF11E 77172013
MOONRUN LN 0.t1jco 4-10° 10" 30° OFF HAMMONTREE 7H72013
GANTON CEMETERY RD 0.5]CO 1-22 27 50" FROM E COAST PRWY 77172013
MORGANTON ROAD 42ISA 1205 207 50° ~|BLOUNT TO PKWY 12/12/2011 40
I’Wom'on LANE 02|CO 434 17 30 DE |OFF MORTON RD N/ VIRTUE 10/25/2012
100f 34




(

Ro( ST

=

201>-.014
ROAD NAME LENGTH|COUNTY OR|CLASS & |BED RIGHT OF [CURBED chmou OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
MILES |STATE AID |WIDTH WIDTH WAY DE [REPLACE
SUBDIVISION DATE
MORTON ROAD 1.3|CO vy 6 50 EROM MARTEL TO VIRTUE N/KNOX 107252012
MOSS ROAD 0.8|CO 718 18 50° OFF BLUE SPRINGS /MCMINN CO g/172011 2011 30
MOUNTAIN CREST LN 0.2|CO 125 25 50 OEF PETERSON TO FRANKLIN EST 71712013
[WOUNTAIN VIEW ROAD 0.5/CO 1255 24 50° SUBICURBIDE OFF SPRING OFF HARRISON_ 71812011 25
[MT. ZION CHURCH ROAD 0.5|CO 316’ G 50° FROM DAVIS FERRY TO MAPLE HILL 811/2011] 11/11/2009 25
(MUDDY CREEK ROAD 14|SA 123 26 50" FROM MARTEL 1O HWY 11 10/1/2011
MURRY'S CHAPEL ROAD 0.8/CO 7 7 50° [FROM OAKLAND TO MONROE 97112013 35
MYERS ROAD (LC) 0.5|CO AT 7 50° TOWN CREEK W 10 SIMPSON 9/1/2013
EYRTLE ROAD 0.4|CO 413 i3 30° OFF RITCHIE 1O DEAD END 172612012
N 87172013
N WILKERSON ROAD 0.2|CO 119 19 50° CURBED OFF BEALS CHAPEL 1072412012
NATIONAL CAMPGROUND RD G 1243 24 50° FROM 95 T0 PKWY 107172013 35
NEELEY ROAD 0.1/CO 210 i3 20 DE OFF 11 E NEAR SHAW FERRY 1072472012
INESS LANE 0.3]CO 4-12.6' 12.6' 30" FROM 95 10 HAMMONTREE 10/1/2013
INEW HOPE ROAD 23[CO 2-18 18 50° FROM POND CREEK 10 MONROE 21282012
NEW MACEDONIA ROAD 0.2|CO 2-18' 18 50" OFF STEEKEE INTO MONROE 9112013
NEWBERRY DRIVE 0.5[CO AT 7 50 OFF YEDEAR RD NORTH END 97172013
NEWTON ROAD 0.2[CO 7 7 50 BETW/HIGHLAND AVE/RIVERVIEW RD 8172011]
INIGHOLS ROAD WITH 200EX 0.4|CO 413 i3 30° DE OFF NOR RE DR 70 KNOX 10/25/2012
INILES FERRY ROAD 2.1|CO 1-20° 20 50 FROM 411 BACK T0 411 21212012 30
'NORTH HOLSTON DRIVE 0.4|CO 37 T 50° OFEE 321 5 RUNS PARALLLEL TO 321 97172013
NORTH TRIGONIA ROAD 2.5|CO 1-20° 20° 50 3115 10 TRIGONIA 211412012 30
'NORTHSHORE DRIVE 21|5A 127 23 50° OFF TIMBERLAKE OFF PKWY 10/25/2012,
INORTHVIEW DRIVE 0.3]CO 1-26.5 27 50 CURB/DE OFF OLD 9S/INORTHVIEW ESTATES 772212013
OAK CHASE BLVD 1.6]CO 1-25' 25' 50° SUB/CURB OFF 70 AVAL ] 12/28/2011
OAK GROVE ROAD 0.7]CO 127 27 50' DE OEF HOTCHKISS VALLEY 5/31/2012|
OAKLY GLENN LANE 0.2|CO 124’ & 50° CURBED SUB 8112013
OAKWOOD ESTATES DRIVE 0.8/CO 124 25 50° CURBED DE OFF MARTEL 81112013
OLD BAILY ROAD 0.2|CO T T 20 DEADEND OFF BEALS GHAPEL 1072512012,
OLD FARM ROAD 0.4[CO 1-25' 25 50 CURBISUB __ |OFF COLUMBUS DR _ 8172011
'OLD GREENBACK ROAD 0.7|CO 316.5 16 50° OFF 321 3 ACROSS FROM SCENIC DR 112013 77172011
HOLLOW ROAD 0.8|CO 3T 7 50 VONORE RD T H 9/112013
D HWYS5 24|5A 123 23 50° M 81H AVE 10 HWY 70 712212013 2013
KINGSTON ROAD 24|SA 1235 30 50° FROM HOTCHKISS VALLEY WIROANE 81112013 127172011
OLD LEE HWY _ 0.4]CO 2-18 (L3 50° FROM W LEE 10 MONORE CO 97172013
OLD MCTEER RD 0.2|CO 10 12 20 WADE RD E 10 DEADEND 6/1/2013 ]
'OLD MIDWAY ROAD T31|CO 3T 7 50° FROM 11 £ 10 MUDDY CREEK T0724/2012] 721172011
OLD NILES FERRY PIKE 6.1[CO 1-20° 20 50 FROM THOMPSON BRIDGE 10 BLOUNT 8/172013]
SINKING CREEK ROAD 0.6]C0O 4125 17 20 FROM OOK 107112012
IOLD SPEARS ROAD 0.3|CO 413 7 30 DE OFF BEALS CHAPEL 10 DEADEND 10/26/2012,
[OLD STAGE ROAD 0.3]CO 2-18' 20° 50° OFF 11 NEAR DIXIE LEE JUNCTION' 9/1172011
OLD STEEKEE RO 0.15]CO 4-14.6' 14.6" 50° STEEKEE 10 SIEEKEE RD 97172013

11 0f 34




pias

rs

N’

£
( Rd AST
2013-2014
[ROAD NAME LENGTH [COUNTY ontcuss & lBED @Gm OF |[CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
WILES |[STATEAID |WIDTH DTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
|SUBDIVISION DATE
OLD SUGAR LIMB ROAD 1.8|SA 219 28 50 FROM SUGARLIMB LOOPS BACK 71172013
OLD SWEETWATER CHRD 0.3|CO 119 19 50 FROM WASHINGTON PIKE TO CO LINE 8/172013
OODYROAD 0.4|CO 4-13 13° 50 OFF VONORE RD 8/2/2011
ORCHARD DR 0.1/CO 124 24 50 CURBED 1L ATES SUBDIVISION &71/2013
OREN WHITE ROAD 0.3]CO LSES KN 30 DEADEND FROM CARTERS CHAPEL 10 DE 7772011
OSPREY COVE COURT E 0.2|CO _ 124 24 50° CURBED-DE “|MILLERS LANDING 311712013
OSPREY COVE COURT W 0.1]CO 122 22 50° CURBED [MILLERS LANDING 31112013
OTIER LANE 0.1[cO 124 2 50 CURBED-DE [MILLERS LANDING 7/72013]
OUTER DRIVE 0.5[CO 120" 2 50 FROM 321 N NEAR SHAW FERRY/95 712212013 35
OVERLOOKLN 0.2|CO 314 14 30° 00 GRUB OFF OLD95 71222013
OWRNBY ROAD 0.1]CO 13 13 20 FROM NILES FERRY T0 BLOUNT 1272212011
P 71112013
PALMER DRIVE 0.6|CO 314 15 30 DE OFF LAKELAND BETIKEENERIWILKERSC 1072572012
PAR DRIVE 0.1]CO 124" 24 50 CURBED RVIEW UBDIVISION 12/172013]
PARDUE LANE 0.4[CO 4-10° 12 30° DE OFF 11 E ACROSS FROM NEELEY 11/712011
PARKWAY DRIVE 0.3[CO 124’ 24 507 SUB OFF 321N 1SION 132013 25
[PARRIS DRIVE 7.7|CO 719 20 50° OFF BEALS CHAPEL TO TWIN COVE 1072512012
PATE ROAD 0.2[CO 4-13 13 30 OFF 321 S NEAR 85 INTERSECTION 12/1/2013]
PAW PAW PLAINS ROAD 0.8|5A 316 16 50 FROM HWY 70 NEAR ROANE GO 12/172013) 30
[PEACHTREE STREET 0.1]CO 312 12 30 FROM DAILEY AVE 10 WEBB DR 121172013
[PEMBROOK COURT 0.1|CO 1-26 26" 50° CURB-DE [AVALON SUBDIVISION 12172013
IPERKLE ROAD 0.6]CO 2145 14 30 FROM FRIENDSVILLE TO MEADOW W 573072012
PETERSON ROAD 18|CO 2185 18 50° NKING CRE 1272802011 35
ROAD 0.8|CO 218’ 25 50° OFF BEALS CHAPLE TO LAKESIDE 10/2512012
PHILLIPS ROAD 0.5/CO 218 (63 50" DE OFF HINES VALLEY ~11/8/2011 20
PICKLE ROAD 0.4|CO 14 27 30° DEAD END OFF HALL RD 12/412013]
[PINE GROVE CIRCLE 0.4/cO 11T 17 50" OFF 95 GREENBACK S/B2011]  9/1/2011] 12/1/2011
] 0.2|CO 1245 24 50° DE [EFT OFF LEEPER FERRY IBLOUNT 87812011
[PINE STREET 0.1]CO 1-20° 20° 50" |FROM DAILEY AVE 10 WEEB DR 12/112013
[PINE TOP STREET (G) 0.6/CO 718 18 50° HIGHLAND PARK DR TO TWIN LAKES 11172013
ST CIRCLE 0.7]CO 219 27 50" OFF CUSICK CIRCLE 10/2412012
| FINEGROVE/PROVIDENCE RD 06 127 27 50° FROM HOTCHKISS VALLEY TO HINES 10812011 35
IPOINT RARBOUR DRIVE 0.2|CO 1-23' 23 50° CURB -DE OFF PHELPS NEAR BEALS CHAPEL 117112013
PONQ CREEK ROAD 3.915A 218 (63 56° OFFE W LEE HWY 10 STOCKTON VAL 117172013 35
POND ROAD 3.8[CO 316 16 30° OFF E LEE NEAR SUGARUMB 10/24/2012
[POPLAR RIDGE ROAD 0.9]CO 1245 23 50° PWKY 10 POPLAR SPRINGS 971/2013] 30
{POPLAR SPRINGS ROAD 35|C0 1217 2T 50" POPLAR SPRINGS 1O DEADEND SF2013 2013 45
VE 041CO 1-20° 20° 50° — |FROM E LEE TO RIVER 10/2412012
PORTER LANE 0.1]CO 1-20° 20° 50° SUBDIVISION AMBERLY MEADOWS 9/1/2013
PRICE ROAD 6.7|CO 219 25" 507 DE OFF HICKORY CREEK 71812011
'PROSPECT CHURCH ROAD 19{SA 127 27 50" 72 NBACK 10 72N 97172013 35
Qi
QUEENER ROAD 0.2|SA AT 7 50° RIVER RD TO AWY 72N 9172013
120f34



S

s

{ RO{ ST
' 2015-.014
ROAD NAME LENGTH]COUNTY OR|CLASS & [BED RIGHT OF _|CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT |TILE Speed Limit
WILES |STATE AID |WID WIDTH WAY DE Lﬁﬁscs Approved
|SUBDIVISION _ DATE
QUILLEN OVERLOOK DRIVE 0.1|CO 315 15 50° SUB OFF SANDY SHORE DR NEAR 321 S 27112013
R
'RABY TOWN ROAD 0.4|CO A7y 7 50° BETWEEN DAWSON & OAKLAND RD 77172013
RANCH ROAD 0.5|CO 1-23' 23 50° DEAD END CURB |OFFF STOCKTON VALLEY 71112013
RANCHERO DRIVE 0.2|CO 27 27 50 CURB-DE OFF CRESS LN 1171472012
'RAUSIN ROAD 34|CO 2-19.6 19 50 FROM W LEE AAT PHILADELPHIA 117172013 30
[RAWHIDE TRAIL 0.3|CO 126 26 50° CURBDE FR TO MUDDY CREEK R 1111472012
IRED GROUSE DRIVE 04|CO 1-24' 24 50° CURB-DE CONKINNON POINT 111172013
IREED SPRINGS ROAD 0.6]CO 120 BE 50° “JFROM SUNNYSIDE TO MONORE 117172013
REEDSP~NGSCHURCHRD 6.7|]CO AT 7T 50° FROM SUNNYSIDE 10 MONORE 117112013 Jan-00
REST CAMP ROAD 15C0O 3165 16 30 FROM ANTIOGH CH E TO UNITIA B/1/2011 2013 25
REX LANE 0.1jCO 13 13 20 OFF UNITIA NEAR GILBERT LN 77812011
'RIDEN ROAD 0.1JCO 2-16.5 16 30 DE OFF PKWY S OF MORGANTON 71812011
'RIDGEBARK LANE 02{CO 1-24' 2§ 50° SUB TATE DR 71720613
RIDGEVIEW DRIVE 0.1|CO 1-24.6' 246 50° DEAD END RD 10 77112013
[RIESLING CT 0.1jco 1-22 2 CURBED/SUB VINEYARD COVE SUBDIVISION 811312013
IRILEY DRIVE 0.7|CO (SE] 19 50° OFF EDITH LN OEF HINES VALLEY B/1/2011 25
RITCHEY RD 11[C0O 1-20° 20° 50 From Vonore to 1elico Pky 71172013 30
'RIVER CHASE ROAD 0.3[CO 1-26' 26 50° CURBED-DE OFF THUR NEAR BEALS CH 1111472012
[RIVER POINT DRIVE. 0.2|CO 124 2 CURBED-DE OFF LAKE COVE 87172013,
[RIVER VIEW DRIVE 1jCO 2-18' 185 50° CURBED FROM MAIN ST 10 DEAD END 8/172011 2013
RIVERS EDGE DRIVE 0.3]CO 124" 28 50 CURBED OFF RIVERVIEW GOLF DR 87472013
RIVERVIEW GOLF DRIVE 0.4]CO 124 24 50° CURBED OFF HUFFS FERRY PAST GOLF COR. 9/1/2013
[RIVERVIEW ROAD 1|CO ey & 50° DE OFF INDUSTRIAL PK DR 10 DE 17171800,
ROAX ROAD 0.3|CO 218 8 50° FROM UNITIA RD 10 BLOUNT CO 77132011
'ROBERSON SPRINGS ROAD 2.7]3A 1-20' 20 50° FROM MULBERRY S1 10 DRY VALLEY 71472011] _ 4/26/2012
(ROBERTS CIRCLE 0.4|CO 28 & 50° OFF FORD RD 9/12013
IROBER1S ROAD 0.4{CO 124 24" 50 OFF STEEKEE NEAR 72 97112013 15/school
ROBINSON CIRCLE (LC) 0.7|CO 313 2z 50 OFF 11 E 70/1/2013
'ROBINSON DRIVE (LC) 0.1]CO 315 19 50° OFF HWY 11 NEAR HIGHLAND PARK 10/2412012,
ROBINSON ROAD (LO) 0.4|CO A7 7 507 OE OFF PR CHURCH NEAR 75 127472013
[ROCK QUARRY ROAD 0.71CO 315 19 50° OFF E LEE BACK TO E LEE 12712013
IROCKY TOP ROAD 0.6]CO 317 27 30° DE VIS LN B 12/172013]
ODNEY ROAD 0.1]CO 24T T 50" SU DEND __ |OFF SCENIC DR NEAR 321S 127112013
IROLLING ACRES DRIVE 0.1|CO 313 23 50° 95 INDR 12/172013
IROSS ROAD 19|CO 316 16 50 OFF STOCKTON VALLEY 7271/2013] 35
ODUNDUP LANE 0.1]CO 125 25 50 CURB-DE FROM RAWHIDE TRAIL TO DE 1171412012
'ROY LONAS ROAD 0.4[CO 10 16 30 OFF BLUE SPRINGS IMCMINN CO 81672011
TTAN ROAD 0.2|CO 13 15 30 DE —|FROM HICKORY CREEK T0O DE B/BI2011
IRUSSELL LANE 0.3|CO 219 20 50° i INESTA 1072512012
IRUSSELL ROAD 0.1jCO 218 18 50° EASTER DR 1O DEAD END 871312013
0.1jCO 139 39 50° SUBDIVISION MAHLON PLACE Vi 12712013

13 0f 34



(. R ust {
2013-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTH [COUNTY OR|CLASS & laso ]mm’ OF |CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT {TILE Speed Limit
MILES |STATE AID |WIDTH WIDTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
ISANDY SHORE DRIVE 0.6/CO 120 20 50° SUB/CURBIDE OFF 321 NEAR DAM 12/172013
SCENIC DRIVE 0.3|CO 218 8 50° OFF ALLEN SHORES NEAR DAM 127172013
SCENIC HILLS LN 0.1|cO 119 {03 50° OFF BUTTER MILK NEAR OLD 95 127172013
SCENIC VIEW DRIVE 0.3|CO 1-25' 27 50° DE OFF RIVERVIEW DR PAST GOLF 12/1/2013
SHAW FERRY LANE 0.6|CO 7218 18 50" OFF SHAWFERRY RD 10/25/2012
[SHAW FERRY ROAD 75|SA 219 28 50° NOF TOWN CREEK TO MARTEL 10/2512012]
SHAW FERRY ROAD N 71|CO 218 18 50° [FROM 321 FROM BILL SMITH 7112013 2011 25
ISHEETS HOLLOW ROAD 0.1]CO 216 16 50" OFF MEADOW W ACI BROOK 8172011 30
ISHELTON GROVE ROAD 0.7|CO 317 7 50° FROM BLUE SPRINGS 10 ERIE 6/10/2013 2011
ISHIPLEY LANE 0.3|CO 13 13 30 FROM 70 E TO OLD STAGE 1072412012
SHULIS LN 0.4]CO 315 15 30 OFF 411 AC FROM NILES FERRY 2212012,
'SILO DRIVE 0.5[CO 124 24 50° CURBED -DE OFF MUDDY CREEK NEAR MARTEL 10/25/2012
[SIMMONS ROAD (LO) 0.3|CO 1-20° 20 50° E LEE TO WEBSB DR 10/24/2012
SIMPSON RD Loudon 2.1|C0O 124" 24 50° |FROM STEEKEE SCHOOL RD 9/1/2013
[SIMPSON ROAD (LC) 0.5|CO 218 24 50° FROM OLD 95 TO NORTHSIDE DR 87312011
[SIMPSON ROAD EAST 0.4]CO 219 20 50° 321 70 SHAW FERRY 81312011
'SINKING CREEK ROAD 2.4|CO 1-20° 20 50 FROM MORGANTON 10 95 211412012 30
ISKYVIEW DRIVE 0.3]CO 1-24 24 50° CURBED-DE [AVALON SUBD 9/1/2013
'SUAB TOWN ROAD 0.3[SA 1216 27 50 FROM BLUE SPRINGS 10 MCMINN 9/1/2011 2013
'SMALLEN ROAD 11|CO 17 17 30 OFF POPLAR SPRINGS RD 12/12/2011 20
[SMITH VALLEY ROAD 0.1[CO 313 15 30° DE OFF 70 BEJ/FORD & THORTON RDS 11/21/2011
ROAD 0.5|CO 2-19° 28 50° OFF LOUDON Rl UGARLIMB 9/1/2013
[SNOW ROAD 0.3|CO 316 18 50° FROM T TUE 1072512012
SPRING ROAD 0.5|CO 1-20° 24 50° SUB/CURBIDE ___ |OFF HARRISON OFF OLD 85 712212013 25
SPRING VIEW ROAD 0.3|CO 126 26 507 CURB -DE OFF BLACKBERRY RIDGE DR 1111412012
STAFFORD ROAD 0.7]CO XK 13 30 DE FROM 72N INTO ROANE 912013
ALLCUP ROAD 0.3|CO 2-16° 18 50° OFF FORK CREEK INTO MONORE /112013
STEEKEE CREEK ROAD 3.4|5A 122 22 50 FROM STEEKEE INTO MONORE 71112013 35
3 OAD 4.3[5A 125 25° 50 FROM GROVE ST 10 MONORE 7112013 45735115130
STEEKEE SCHOOL ROAD 22|5A 320" 20 50° STEEKEE 10O VONORE 811812012 30
[STEELE RD 0.3]co 4136 13.6' 30° PINE GROWE CIRCLE 772011
ISTEVENS LANE 0.4|CO 2155 15" 30° OFF BROWDER HOLLOW 712013
[STEVENS ROAD 0.2|CO 315 15 50° ROM N Y10 TRIGONIA 2212012
STINNETT ROAD 6.3|CO 316 76 50° #ROMNEAR HIGHLAND PARK SCHOOL 10/2412012
STOCKTON VALLEY 6.2|SA 123 23 50° 72N 10 OAKLAND R 10172012 30/40
ISTONE HARBOR 0.3|CO 1-25' 25' 50° SUBDIVISION FROM LAKEVIEW TO DE 71172013
STRANGE ROAD 0.5|]CO 316 18 50° OFF 11 E NEAR OLD STAGE 10/24/2012
UGARWOOD ROAD 0.3]CO 127 30 50° OFF SUGARLIMB S OF 75 71112013
'SUMMER GLENN LN 0.2|CO 124 24 50 SUBDIVISION JAMES RIDGE SUBDIVISION 71172013
SUMMITT HILL DRIVE 0.3|]CO 124’ 24 50° CURBED YELLOWOOD SUBDIVISION 9/1/2013
[ SUNNY SIDE ROAD 2.6[CO 120 20° 50° W N 5/1/2013 11/1/2011]30/35
ISUNSET BLUFF 0.1|CO 1242 27 50° WINDRIDGE RD TO DE 8/1/2011
ISUNSET DRIVE 0.1JCO 2-18 18 50 OFF CRESCENT DDR E LEE HWY 8/112013
14 of 34
J }



, <
{ Ro{ ST (
2013--014
ROAD NAME LENGTH|COUNTY OR|CLASS & |BED RIGHT OF |CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
MILES |STATE AID TH WIDTH WAY DE REPLACE
SUBDIVISION DATE

F
TANGLEWOOD DRIVE 0.9|CO 123 73 50° CURB-DE FROM KNOX LN S OF MARTEL 81112013
TARWATER ROAD 130 2185 i3 50° OFE 95 S ACROSS FROM PINE GRO 8/1/2013
TAYLOR DRIVE 0.1|CO 316 18 50° DE OFF 11 E NEAR SHAW FERRY 10/24/2012
TEETERS ROAD 03|CO 17 17 20° GREENBACK 9/1/2013 15
[TEN MILE ROAD 0.2|CO a4 20 30 DEAD END OFE MURRAYS CHAPEL IN ERIE 9/1/2013
THOMPSON BRIDGE ROAD 0.1]5A 1-25 37 50° DE FROM 411 INTO BLOUNT CO 10/1/2013
I THOMPSON ROAD 0.2[CO 213 13 20 OFF JACKSON BEND 7112013
THORNTON DRIVE 0.5/CO 316 22 50° DE OFF 70 NEAR DIXIE LEE JUNCTION 11721712011 71112011
(THURMER CIRCLE 0.2]CO 1-26' 26 50° CURB-DE OFF LAKEVIEW NEAR BEALS CHAPEL 1171412012
TILLEY ROAD 0.6|CO 218’ 18 50 POND CREEK 10 DEAD END 117112013
TIMBER RIDGE DRIVE 0.3|CO 124 24 50° SUB/CURBJDE OFF HINES VALLEY (SUBDIVISION) 812011
[ TIMBERLINE DRIVE 0.5{CO 1-26' 26" 50° CURBED AVALON SUBD 117112013
TINNEL LANE 0.2|CO 413 20 50 OFF TINNEL RD 10 DEAD END 11/1/2013
TINNEL ROAD 0.4|CO 716 18 50 NEAR HIGHLAND PARK SCHOOL 10/24/2012] 412512012
TIVOLE DR 0.4}CO 1-23' 23 50' OFF W, 12/1/2013
TOWN CREEK CIRCLE 0.2|CO 120 20 50° OFF MYRES RD NEAR TOWN CREEK 170/1900

WHN CREEK ROAD E 14|SA 1-20 25 50° FROM 321 TO FORD RD 1112372011
I TOWN CREEK ROAD W 14[SA 2-18.6' 24 50 FROM 321 10 OLD 95 BI3/2011 71311905
TRADES DRIVE 0.1|CO 1-26 26 50° CURB/SUB _ HARRISON HILLS SUBDIVISION 37172013
TRAIL VIEW 0.3[CO 122 27 50° FROM CECIL WEBB 10 DEAD END 37112013
ITRIGONIA ROAD 0.8[SA 2-18.5 18 50° OFF TRIGONIA 10 MONROE 2212012
TRIGONIA ROAD NORTH 256|CO 218’ G 50° —[FROM TRIGONIA 10 411 372013
I TURMAN DRIVE 0.5|CO 125 27 50° DE OFF SHAWFERRY RD 5/1/2013
TURN LANE ROAD 0.3|CO 316" 25 50" OFF SIMPSON RD 4/16/2012
I TURNER LANE 0.2|CO 125 25 50" CURBED-DE [OFF COLUMBUS DR 8/172011
[TURTLE GOVE COURT 0.2|CO 124 24 50° CURBED-DE LAKECREST DR TO DE mLLERS LAN 5/172013
TWIN COVE CIRCLE 0.5[CO 126 26 50 CURBED-DE ____ |OFF PA N TCOVE SUBDIVISION 9/3/2011
TWiN COVE DRIVE 0.4/CO 126 26 50 CURBED-DE N UBDI 11/14/2012
TWIN LAKES RD 0.2|CO 1-19° 19’ 50 321 N NEAR HALL RD 6/10/2013
UNION FORK CREEK CHURCH 13JCO 13 13 30 HWY 725 TO WADE RD W 5/1/2013]
UNITIA ROAD 2.9{SA 1-20° 20° 50 M HWY 321 5 10 BLOUNT CO 10/3/2011 30
VALLEY DALE DRIVE 0.2]cO -26' 50 DIVISION LITTLE MNT ESTATES 5/1/2013
[VALLEY VIEW DRIVE 0.1]CO 1-26.2 26 50° SUBDIVISION AVALON SUBDIVISION _ 5/1/2013
'VARNER HOLLOW ROAD 0.4|CO 12 17 30 OFF STEEKEE RD NEAR CIRCLE DR 5112013
VAUGHN ROAD 0.4/CO 4115 (kN 20° OFF UNITIA 873/2011) -
VAUGHNS CHAPEL ROAD 0.3[CO 120 26 50° FROM BROWDER SCHOOL 6/172013]
[VINEYARD HILLS DR 0.6]CO 1-25' 25 50' CURBED-SUB YA UE 61112012
IVINEYARD ROAD 0.6 219 16 50° 3215 A FROM 95 N 9/8/2011
VIRTUE ROAD 05[SA 218 20 50° "MUDDY G T TDWAY 1012512012 ]
VONORE ROAD 43|5A 124 2% 50° FROM 72 5 10 WATKING RD _ 611712012 2013| 5/12/2012 40

15 of 34



P /
( RQ’ ST Y
2013-2014
ROAD NAME LENGTH [COUNTY OR chAss & ‘%? ’jgcm CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD ’sx;u [PAVEMENT Speed Limit
STATE AID |WIDTH TH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
W
WADE LANE 0.3[CO 313 13 30 DE WADE RD 10 DEAD END 7112013
WADE ROAD EAST 0.5/CO 316 16 50° DE OFF 72 5 NEAR PKWY 778712011
[WADE ROAD WEST 1.3[CO 316 16 50" FROM 725 TO MARKWOOD 77812011
WALKERLN 0.3[co 411 11 30° DE [FORM OLD KINGSTON LOOP 71172013
WALLER FERRY ROAD 1.2|CO 4-14" 14 50" FROM WHITE WING TO 321 71172013 35
WARD ROAD (LC) 0.7|cO 219 17 50° DE OFF HICKORY CREEK 77912011
WARD ROAD (LO) 0.5|CO 1z 17 30 OFF WADE RD 71872011
WASHINGTON PIKE 4.3]CO 37 7 50° FROM PHILADELPHIA T0 MONROE 30712012 35
WATERFORD CR 0.2|CO 127 27 50° SUB AVALON 8112013
WATKINS ROAD 2.2]SA 1-22 2z 50 FROM STEEKEE TO VONORE 6/10/2013 30
WATSON ROAD 14]CO 37 7 50 [FROM CORINTH TO WATKINS 8/1/2013
WATT CEMETERY ROAD 2.7|CO 317 7 50' FROM DAVIS FERRY TO RITCHEY 8/1/2013 35
'WEBB CIRCLE 0.1jCO 7 7 50 OFF 11 W NEAR 10/2412012
WEBB DRIVE 0.5/CO 1-20° 20 50" FROM COX 10 PORT MADISON 9/13/2014
WEDGEWOOD DRIVE 0.4]CO 726 26 507 CURBED/DEADEN |[AVALONSUBD 9/13/2014
S RT 0.2[CO 1-26' 26 50 CURBED AVALON SUBD 9/13/2014
[WESLEY ROAD 0.3]CO 219 23 50° OFF HARDIN DR HARDIN ESTATES 10/2512012
ROAD Mco 2-19 i 50° OFF 72 5 ACROSS BRIDGE S OF PKY 6/10/2013
IWEST LANE WEST TRAIL 0.2|CO 316 25 50 OFF FOSTER RD 71112013
'WESTSHORE DRIVE 02|CO 1-26' 26" 50' CURBED OFF MISTY VIEW DR/RIVERVIEW DR 71172013
WHEAT ROAD EENE 317 27 30 FROM HINES VALLEY 1O ROANE 8/172011
ELE 0.1jCO 120 27 50° OFF 70 NEAR DIXIE LEE JUNCTION 8/172013
WHITE OAK ROAD 0.3|CO 315 15 507 OFF OVERLOOK RD TO SHAW FERRY 12/27/2011
IWHITE ROAD 0.8|CO 218 L3 50° OFF PINE GROVE / PROV 71172013 25
[WHITE WING ROAD 02|SA 120 20° 50° FROM 321 N N NEAR WALLER FERRY 71412013 35
WHITE WING ROAD N zﬂg 296 5 50 FROM 321 N OF 140 TO 321 77112013
[WHITE WING ROAD W 0.2 123 23 50° FROM 321 OFF 140 10 71/2043
TWHITNEY DRIVE 04[CO 123 25 50 CURBED OAKWOOD ESTATES SUBDIVISION 81172013
TWILKERSON LANE 0.3]CO 218 18 50° FROM 70 TO OLD STAGE 10/8/2011
WILKERSON ROAD 0.6]CO 14 4 30 DE OFF MCCANALLY RD 70 KNOX 10/25/2012
[WILLIAMS FERRY ROAD 3|SA 120 20 50 *FR?SH OLD 95NEAR 321N TO BMILK &/1/2013
[WILLIAMSBURG DRIVE 0.1]CO 123 24 50° DE YEDEAR RD 10 DEAD END 81112013
[WILSON RD (LO) 0.3[CO 4-10° 10’ 20" CORINTH CHURCH 10O DEAD END 2/112013
IWILSON ROAD (LC) 0.9]CO 413 16 30° DEAD END FROM MARTEL 10 VIRTUE NJKNOX 21112613
[WINCHESTER DRIVE 0.2]CO 219" 23 50 SUB OFF HARDIN DR HARDIN ESTATES &13/2013
WINDRIDGE ROAD 0.8[CO 124" 24 50° CURBED OFF LEEPER FERRY 10/8/2011 25
WINDSWEPT DRIVE 0.3]CO 1-26' 26 50" CURBED AVALON SUBD 21112013
WOODLAND DR 0.4]|CO 1-20° 20° 50° FROM DAVIS FERRY POPLAR SPRING 7/112013
WOODLAWN CHURCH RD 0.6/CO 412 12" 50° OFF BUTTERMILK NEAR OLD 95 71172013
WOODLAWN ROAD 04|CO 219 19 50° FROM BUTTERMILK 10 OLD 95 71112013 20069
16 of 34

N




( | ' ~ Ro{ ST {

2013-,014
ROAD NAME LENGTH|COUNTY OR|CLASS & BED RIGHT OF [CURBED LOCATION OF ROAD SIGN PAVEMENT [TILE Speed Limit
MILES [STAIE AID |WIDTH WAY DE REPLACE Approved
SUBDIVISION DATE
WOODS STREET 0.1{CO 3-16" 16' 50° CRESCENT TO SIMMONS 71112013
Y
YARBERRY DRIVE 0.8{CO 1-20" 20 50" DE OFF YEDEAR DR 8/1/2013
YATES LANE 0.1jCO 4-14 14’ 30 OFF STEEKEE CREEK NEAR GREEN 8/1/2013
YEDEAR ROAD 0.6{CO 1-20° 20 50° SUB CURBED OFF 321 S NEAR BOOTHS CHAPEL 1/8/1900 25
Z
ZANELN 0.5]CO 1-23' 23 50" CURBED/SUB ROCKINGHAM SUBDIVISION 71112013
ZION RIDGE RD 1.1|{CO 2-18" 18 50' SUBDIVISION FROM MAPLE HILL RD TO MT ZION 7/1/2013

NOTES: POPLAR SPRINGS RD WAS CHANGED FROM .9 TO 3.5 MILE LONG THIS WAS A MISTAKE FOUND DATING BACK TO 2005

17 of 34



